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I  was born in 1944. My parents came from Leeds, but my mother, who 
had been an English teacher, stopped when she had children, and was 

living in High Wycombe, and my father was with the Royal Marines in 
Belgium. His first job after the war was in London and we lived there until 
1952, when he got a job in a research laboratory of the Plessey electronics 
company. �is was in Cobham, and we moved to a Surrey village, where 
my parents continued to live until after I had left home. From there I 
would travel into Guildford, where from 1955 to 1962 I attended the 
Royal Grammar School. 
 
       I was fortunate to grow up in a home with lots of books. My mother 
had the classics of English literature, as well as modern novels. My father 
had books on politics, religion and history. I think there were four forma-
tive moments in my childhood. �e first was the discovery of history. From 
as early as when I was seven years old, there is a photograph of me reading 
A Child’s History of England. �is history focused heavily on the medieval 
period and the author liked a good story. �e book was arranged so that 
the story was on one side and an illustration on the other; I can still 
remember the pictures of the White Ship sailing to its doom and Ranulf 
Flambard escaping from the Tower of London. A second important 
moment concerns my father’s enthusiasm for sports and games of all kinds, 
especially cricket and chess. By the age of nine I was a cricket fanatic, and 
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though it took longer to become equally keen on chess, the passion lasted 
longer because I was a better chess player than cricketer. �e third was my 
interest in politics, which I can date to a specific event, namely Suez. I 
became a supporter of the Labour Party, which I have remained. �e 
fourth, which developed more gradually, was my growing interest in 
Christianity from about the age of fifteen. My parents were regular church-
goers, and at various times we went to Congregationalist, Presbyterian, and 
Anglican churches, though they eventually settled on the Church of Eng-
land, partly because of the inspiring preaching of the rector of the village 
church. One thing that strengthened my own interest was studying the 
Reformation at school and wanting to learn more about the specific teach-
ings of the various churches and the differences among them. Another was 
the teaching of Mr. Malleson, the senior English teacher, who also taught 
Religious Education, and who awakened my interest in the Bible, as well 
as pointing me to such books as William James’s Varieties of Religious Expe-
rience. As a student at Cambridge, I attended the college chapel, as well as 
sometimes going to the evening services at Great St Mary’s, where there 
were often visiting celebrity preachers. I can remember queuing for a serv-
ice where John Robinson was due to preach, only to be turned away 
because the church was already full. In the 1970s I started attending 
Quaker meetings and I became a member of the Society of Friends in 
1978. I have remained active in local meetings, first in Birmingham and 
more recently in Derby. 
 
       At school, History was always my favourite subject and I never doubted 
that I wanted to study it at university. I was encouraged by the senior His-
tory teacher, the sardonic Douglas Mark Sturley, and his enthusiastic assis-
tant, Dr. B. Gordon Blackwood. Sturley had a mission to suppress any signs 
of naïve idealism in his pupils. I remember an essay on the Enlightened 
Despots where he had crossed out the word “ruthless,” replacing it with 
“realistic,” and had changed “he had no scruples” to “he had no illusions.”  
 
       Before I went to Trinity Hall, Cambridge, in 1963, I spent several 
months in France and Switzerland. My parents paid for me to do a lan-
guage course in Paris, for which I shall always be grateful, as French histo-
rians have had a big influence on my work. In Switzerland I worked on a 
small farm, together with two generations of the farming family and a 
Spanish worker, Luis. �is did little for my Swiss German, as we were 
working too hard to do much chatting, but it was an interesting insight 
into an older way of life. �ere was little mechanization and hours of work 
were long, though with frequent breaks for meals or snacks. During break-
fast the patriarch read a passage from the Bible. 
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       Trinity Hall was best known as a nursery of lawyers, but there was a 
strong group of History students, including John Pollard, the historian of 
the papacy. Two of the tutors, Nick Richardson and John Nurser, had a 
significant influence on me. Both were individualists who would not have 
been at home in the contemporary world of regular “assessments” of teach-
ing, “reviews” of research and counting of publications. I found Nick, an 
historian of modern French politics, an inspiring teacher. He made me 
want to be a professional historian and he was the first person to suggest 
that I could be one. John, who was also an Anglican priest and whose 
major book was on the religious background to the Universal Declaration 
of Human Rights,1 probably had more influence than anyone else on the 
direction my research would take. He recommended books more because 
they were interesting than because they would help us to pass the exams, 
and one in particular was important for me, Churches and the Working 
Classes by Inglis.2 Inglis had valuable things to say about “the churches,” 
but much less about “the working classes.” John was also interested in the 
emerging sub-discipline of the sociology of religion. He invited me to sem-
inars in which some of the leading figures in the field took part, and he also 
recommended the work of Gabriel Le Bras and other pioneers of French 
sociologie religieuse. 
 
       After graduating in 1966 I was determined to register for a PhD if I 
could find a supervisor. I wanted to work on some aspect of English reli-
gion in the eighteenth or nineteenth century. I spoke to several possible 
supervisors before being accepted by George Kitson Clark who was then 
close to retirement but had long been the leading historian of Victorian 
England at Cambridge. He lived in a suite of rooms above the Great Gate 
at Trinity College, in one of which his research seminar was held every 
Wednesday evening. Many of his students had worked on aspects of Vic-
torian religion and Cambridge was probably the leading centre for this 
growing field of research. My contemporaries were Sheridan Gilley and 
Stuart Mews, and a little before me had been David �ompson, Ted 
Royle, Edward Norman and Clyde Binfield. So I was fortunate to be part 
of a large group of students working in related areas, as well as having 
access through the seminar to work on many aspects of nineteenth and 
early twentieth century Britain and Ireland. �ere was then no formal 
training of historians at Cambridge and no requirement to take a Master’s 
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before going on to a doctorate. �e training came through one-to-one 
meetings with the supervisor and through participation in the weekly sem-
inar, where, as well as papers by research students, there were frequent vis-
iting speakers, most often from the USA. Kitson Clark had a “sink or 
swim” approach to supervision. His job was to show students when they 
were on the wrong path, but it was the student’s job to find the right path. 
In my own case I almost despaired of receiving the green light from him. 
When it finally came, I think it was because he recognized that I had found 
my own voice. 
 
       My doctoral thesis was entitled “Membership and Influence of the 
Churches in Metropolitan London 1885–1914.” I had two key sources: the 
Religious Census of London in 1903-4 which attempted to count atten-
dance by men, women and children at every church or synagogue in the 
metropolis,3 and the notebooks compiled by Charles Booth and his assistants 
while preparing his monumental Life and Labour of the People in London.4 I 
also used every autobiography I could find by those living in London at the 
time. �e main theme was the influence of class on the very different pat-
terns of religious practice found in the various districts of the city. 
 
       My studies started with difficulty, as I failed to win a scholarship in my 
first year. I had to piece together income from a variety of sources, mainly 
various kinds of teaching, which inevitably impinged on the time available 
for research. I must nonetheless have received a favourable report from my 
supervisor, as I gained funding at the start of my second year. 
 
       Kitson came from a dynasty of Leeds industrialists. Like many such, 
they had been Unitarians and Liberals in the nineteenth century and 
moved to being Anglican and Conservative in the twentieth. Kitson was 
staunchly Anglican and one of his major books was focused on the involve-
ment of Victorian clergy in social reforming movements.5 He gave short 
shrift to the sniping at the clergy which was commonly practised by grad-
uate students, and even by some distinguished historians, at the time. He 
once accused me, probably rightly, of Nonconformist bias. �e agenda for 
my thesis came from Inglis’s book and the aim of showing not only what 
the churches were doing, but what the working classes were doing and how 
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this compared with what those in other classes were doing. History from 
the bottom up was the contemporary fashion, and it was one which I 
aspired to follow. �ere were various influences on the ways in which I 
approached this task. From Kitson Clark there was a broadly sympathetic 
understanding of the clergy of all denominations—which did not preclude 
criticism of the class perspective of many Anglicans. I attended the Past & 
Present conference on “Popular Religion” held in July 1966, just as I was 
thinking about my field of research. �ere I saw in action many of the key 
figures in the social history of religion and in social history more generally, 
and I was particularly inspired by John Kent’s paper on revivalism.6 I was 
also fascinated by the geographical patterns of religious practice revealed by 
students of Britain’s 1851 Religious Census. And, like most historians of 
religion in the later ‘60s, I was interested in the causes of secularization and 
the debates between British sociologists of religion, notably Bryan Wilson, 
arch-exponent of the Secularization �esis, and David Martin, who at that 
time was pleading for the “elimination” of the concept of secularization.7 
David was to be the external examiner for my thesis and remained both a 
friend and my initial contact with the world of sociology.  
 
       My career as a university historian was made possible by three strokes 
of good fortune. �e first was an appointment as an Arts Faculty Research 
Fellow (what would now be called a Post-Doc) in the University of Birm-
ingham. It was based in the Department of Modern History, and in Janu-
ary 1970 I came to meet my new head of department, a diplomatic histo-
rian. He asked about my research, and I explained that I was working on 
the relationship between religion and social class in Victorian cities. He lis-
tened patiently, and then said that this was very interesting, but he could 
not see its historical significance. If he had waited a few years, he would 
have discovered that this apparently recherché theme had become almost 
fashionable. Between 1974 and 1976 there was a flood of publications on 
this and related themes.8 �e second stroke of good fortune was the 
acceptance of a revised version of my thesis for publication, with the title 
Class and Religion in the late Victorian City.9 It came from a relatively new 
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publisher, Croom Helm, and was one of the earliest books in their social 
history series. �e title was suggested by the publisher, who said that 
“Every word in that title will sell.” At the time, anything to do with Vic-
torian Britain was likely to be popular—though the vogue was for books 
which included some scandal, aimed at challenging the upright and 
uptight Victorian stereotype. But all aspects of social history were thriving, 
and urban and religious history were among the most flourishing branches.  
 
       For me the most important aspect of Birmingham was the Social His-
tory Seminar, started by Dorothy �ompson, the historian of Chartism, 
and Richard Johnson, then best known for his work on the history of edu-
cation. When Richard’s interests moved elsewhere, I became the co-con-
venor. Dorothy had a talented school of graduate students, many of them 
working on Birmingham history. �e seminar offered a lively programme 
both of home-grown and visiting speakers and many of my own papers 
started there. In view of Dorothy’s combative temperament, it was a venue 
which some speakers wished they had avoided. �e orthodoxy of the time 
tended to be that religion was all about “social control,” so I had to get used 
to responding to that line of argument. 
 
       When I think of the schools of historical writing which influenced my 
first book, I would mention the drive, very influential in Britain at the time, 
to count anything that can possibly be counted, including church member-
ship and attendance, and their correlates. I have never in later books 
included so many statistical tables. �ree very different historians also 
influenced my work. First, there was John Foster, whose work was hotly 
debated in Birmingham’s Social History Seminar.10 I was fascinated by his 
account of working-class radicalism in early nineteenth-century Oldham, 
but what influenced me more directly was his use of marriage registers as a 
historical source. Foster’s interest was in how far the choice of partner 
reflected the emergence of a clearly defined working class; mine was in the 
geographical distance between those marrying. I argued that this reflected 
three kinds of community in London, one “neighborhood-based,” one 
“district-based” and one “national and international,” with each being 
related to different patterns of religious practice. Second, there was Clyde 
Binfield, whose doctoral thesis was the most entertaining I had ever read. 
I was particularly struck by a series of articles he published in the later ’60s 
on the internal life of Nonconformist chapels in the later nineteenth cen-

450                                               JOURNEYS IN CHURCH HISTORY

        10. John Foster, “Capitalism and Class Consciousness in Earlier Nineteenth-Century 
Oldham” (PhD thesis, University of Cambridge, 1967); id., Class Struggle in the Industrial 
Revolution (London, 1974). 



tury, and especially the tensions arising from the liberalizing of theology. 
�ese had an important influence on my account of the Victorian “crisis of 
faith.”11 �ird was the French historian Christiane Marcilhacy and her 
books on the diocese of Orléans in the mid-nineteenth century, in which 
she tried to construct a “collective mentality” of the various sections of the 
population.12 I tried to do the same for London. I can see in retrospect that 
this “mentality” is too rigidly defined and pays insufficient attention to the 
diversity of thinking and behaving within a particular milieu, in spite of 
much that is shared.  
 
       Around 1900, most London Catholics were working class and most 
were Irish-born or (more often) of Irish descent. My main discussion of 
Catholics was in a chapter on “Working-Class London.” Catholics were 
more concentrated than members of any other denomination, except for 
the Jews, the major parishes being in areas close to the river �ames and 
the docks. My main claim was that Catholicism “was the only form of reli-
gion that integrated its adherents into a working-class environment, 
instead of making them stand out from it.” I can see now that this claim 
was too blunt, but it makes the point that although attendance at Mass was 
much lower than in Ireland, and lower too than in New York or, probably, 
Liverpool, it was higher than the rate of church-going among working 
class Protestants and, in particular, many non-practising Catholics retained 
a strong Catholic identity and a strong respect for the clergy. So a large 
part of this (relatively brief) discussion focused on the relationship between 
priests and people. 
 
       Reflecting the publisher’s view that the book would chime with con-
temporary concerns, it was more widely reviewed than any book I have 
written since, and the tenor of the reviews also varied more widely. I appre-
ciated the positive reviews by expert critics, such as that by Peter Marsh in 
the American Historical Review, but there were also more negative evalua-
tions, such as that by Robert Currie in the English Historical Review. I 
enjoyed recently rereading the book, though there are parts which I would 
write differently if I were doing it now. My style of writing has evolved in 
the years following—partly in response to the critics, especially those who 
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were friendly critics. My later books have been more disciplined and 
sharply focused—though possibly less fun. I cut out most of the jokes, as 
well as the long footnotes. I was attentive to Clyde Binfield’s comment that 
I had stereotyped the Baptists, and I recognized a tendency to stereotype 
Evangelicals more generally. In subsequent work, I have seen it as part of 
my job as an historian to present all religious groups—and indeed political 
groups—in terms which they themselves could have recognized and to 
avoid loaded language.  
 
       After a year in which I had a Temporary Lectureship in the Depart-
ment of History at Warwick University, a third stroke of good fortune 
came in 1973. I was appointed to a Lectureship in Church History in 
Birmingham’s Department of �eology. �e competition was strong and 
the appointing committee was divided, but I had the support of John 
Gordon Davies, the formidable head of department. He was good at get-
ting his way. �is was a turning-point for me in three ways. It meant that 
I had secure employment. It also meant that I would continue in religious 
history, whereas if I had stayed in the History Department it is possible 
that my research might have taken new directions. And it also meant that 
my historical interests broadened chronologically and geographically. I 
taught a course on the Reformation, and also lectured and gave seminars 
on a wide range of nineteenth and twentieth century themes, including 
slavery, apartheid and religious persecution in the USSR. It also broadened 
my knowledge of contemporary religion. Students taking a degree in �e-
ology or taking �eology courses came from a wide variety of religious 
backgrounds, including not only all the familiar forms of religion and irre-
ligion, but others which I had not encountered before, notably Pente-
costalists and, in later years, many Muslims, as well as at least one Pagan 
and one Satanist.  
 
       My first article was strongly influenced by French sociologie religieuse13 
and arose from my fascination with geographical patterns of religious 
observance.14 Basing myself partly on the British Religious Census of 1851 
and partly on various local censuses of attendance conducted by newspa-
pers in 1880s and ’90s, I showed that urban church-going reflected pat-
terns of church-going in the surrounding countryside—not perhaps sur-
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prising, but it ran contrary to the then current assumption that church-
going was low in larger towns and high in smaller towns. I also broke down 
larger towns into smaller areas, showing the expected class differences, but 
also that some denominations, such as the Primitive Methodists, which 
had a relatively small national membership, nevertheless had a significant 
presence in working class districts of some cities. I showed a draft to my 
colleague, Dorothy �ompson, who said that the paper was “convincing 
but not very interesting.” But her husband, Edward �ompson, was more 
encouraging. He was interested in my findings on working class districts of 
cities, and said the paper was “promising.” 
 
       �e most helpful suggestion by reviewers of Class and Religion was 
that oral history might offer the best way of approaching some of the ques-
tions I had tried to answer in the book. Several of my subsequent publica-
tions have drawn on oral history, the first being my contribution to a 
volume on the lower middle class of Victorian and Edwardian Britain.15 I 
made considerable use here of the transcripts of interviews conducted in 
two major oral history projects, one led by Elizabeth Roberts and focusing 
on the working class in North Lancashire between 1890 and 1930, and the 
other a more ambitious project being conducted by a large team, led by 
Paul �ompson and �ea Vigne. It focused on the Edwardian period and 
it covered all social classes and most regions of Britain. �e former project 
benefited from Roberts’s in-depth knowledge of the region and her ability 
to empathise with interviewees; the quality of interviewing in the latter 
project was more uneven, but its strength lay in its broader scope and the 
possibilities for comparison between regions. Later, in preparing a short 
book for the Economic History Society,16 I read transcripts of all of the 
interviews with those who had grown up in working-class families in the 
cities and industrial regions of Britain. Doing this persuaded me that the 
church-going minority in the Victorian and Edwardian working class was 
larger than I (or indeed most historians—Elizabeth Roberts17 being a 
notable exception) had realized, and that there were also considerable 
regional differences. For example, church-going was considerably higher in 
the textile towns of Lancashire and West Yorkshire (as well of course in 
South Wales) than in, for instance, London or the North-East of England. 
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�e interviews also permitted a more nuanced view of the varieties of belief 
and unbelief among non-church-goers and differences between men and 
women. I explained these findings in a paper at a History Workshop in 
1982, which was later published.18 In the ’80s and ’90s, other historians 
took these lines of argument considerably further than I had done.19  
 
       My teaching at Birmingham provided the basis for my second book, 
Religion and the People of Western Europe 1789–1970,20 Which was com-
missioned by Oxford University Press as a follow-up to John Bossy’s Chris-
tianity in the West 1400–1700. Beginning with the French Revolution and 
ending with the 1960s, I looked at the countryside, the urban middle class 
and the working class. So class was still central, though I also looked at the 
popularity in the nineteenth century of Evangelicalism and Ultramon-
tanism, the emergence of Religions of Humanity, and differences between 
the religion of women and men, which was a relatively new theme at the 
time. �e book was important for me in making my work known in other 
parts of Europe. In 1997 I published a revised version, which took the story 
up to 1989.21 

 
       Whereas in my first book the section on Catholics was relatively brief, 
here they took centre-stage. I began with the conflict between the French 
Revolution and the Catholic Church, and the grass-roots revival in the 
later 1790s. I argued that in the early decades of the nineteenth century 
there was a resurgence of ‘enthusiastic’ forms of religion among both 
Catholics and Protestants. But while this led to the splintering of Protes-
tantism and a multiplication of ’sects’ outside the State Churches, the 
spread of Ultramontane forms of piety greatly strengthened the Catholic 
Church, especially in the countryside and to a lesser extent in cities too. 
Older pilgrimages revived and in the middle and later years of the century 
many new pilgrimages began, initially in the face of some scepticism on the 
part of many bishops, but eventually with their active support. �e later 
years of the century also saw the emergence of what came to be called the 
‘Catholic ghetto.’ I argued that this was only the most striking example of 
a wider phenomenon in later nineteenth-century Europe, as religious and 
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political (notably Socialist) sub-cultures formed with the purpose of 
strengthening a religious or political identity and insulating the faithful 
from hostile influences—most often that of the Liberal bourgeoisie.22 
Across several generations, from about the 1870s to the 1960s, the Church 
succeeded in many countries in building a Catholic world, underpinned by 
numerous organisations, sometimes including political parties. 
 
       Meanwhile I was working on my biggest project, which, after many 
years of research and of publishing delays appeared with the title Piety and 
Poverty: Working Class Religion in Berlin, London and New York 1870–
1914.23 If, as I have said, I moved between my first and my second book 
towards a more focused and disciplined style of writing, between my 
second and third major publications, I came increasingly to highlight com-
plexity and nuance, rather than the crispness and clarity I aimed for in Reli-
gion and the People. Piety and Poverty is a favourite of mine, partly because 
of the memories it brings back and the amount of work that went into it, 
but it has had less impact than some of my other books. �is may be 
because it was conceived in the ’70s and published in the ’90s, by which 
time the themes handled in the book were no longer fashionable. For 
example, I put a lot of effort into obtaining data on the social class of 
church-goers, which had been a hot topic in the ’70s, but no longer aroused 
so much interest. Nonetheless I think the book successfully combined 
answers to broad questions about urban and working-class religion—ques-
tioning, for example some influential views of the relationship between 
religion and the experience of poverty, including Marx’s claim that religion 
acted as “the opium of the people”; local detail about the three cities; and, 
in the chapters headed “Male and Female” and “Religion in a Half-Secular 
Society,” examination of the religious lives of individuals.  
 
       In comparing the three cities, I was struck by the wide differences 
between them, most clearly reflected in the church-going statistics. 
According to my estimates, 38% of non-Jewish adults attended a church in 
Manhattan borough on the day of a census in 1902, as against 22% in 
London and about 6% in Berlin at around the same time. �e interesting 
point is that Protestant church-going was only slightly higher in New York 
than in London: the difference is explained by the fact that Catholics were 
both more numerous and more observant in New York. According to my 
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estimates, 50% of adult Catholics were counted at a service and the figure 
for the Irish may have been even higher, since there is evidence to suggest 
that Catholics from the other major ethnic groups in the city, notably the 
Italians, were less regular in attendance. As in Britain, Irish Catholic iden-
tity was strengthened by memories of Ireland, by support for the Nation-
alist cause, and by the experience of or memory of discrimination in their 
new home, embodied in the notorious message that “No Irish need apply.” 
�e difference between America and Europe was that by 1900 the Irish in 
New York, as in other American cities, though still predominantly working 
class, enjoyed considerable power through their leading role in the city’s 
Democratic Party as well as in the Archdiocese, reinforced by the frequent 
links between clergy and politicians. In districts like the Middle West Side 
of Manhattan with dense communities of immigrants from Ireland and 
descendants of immigrants, the clergy enjoyed immense status and influ-
ence, supported by parish organisations of every kind and a public opinion 
which was loyal to the Church. Women tended to be more devout than 
men, and took a more active role in maintaining a Catholic atmosphere in 
the home, but there was also a male piety sustained by the Holy Name 
societies, as well as the numerous Catholic sporting organisations. 
 
       I remained at Birmingham until my retirement in 2010, after which I 
continued to supervise my doctoral students until the successful comple-
tion of their theses. In 2004, following some internal reorganization within 
the School of Historical Studies, of which �eology and Religion (as it had 
become) was then a part, I moved back to where I had started: the Depart-
ment of Modern History. I was twice short-listed for posts elsewhere, at 
Edinburgh, where Jay Brown was appointed, and at Harvard, where Bob 
Scribner was appointed. But I am happy to have spent so long at Birming-
ham—not least because of the History of Religion Seminar, which began 
in the early ‘90s in the Prince of Wales pub in Moseley, where I met with 
John Edwards, a historian of late medieval Spain and of the Reformation 
era, and Mike Snape, now best known for his work on religion and war. 
Our original idea was that the seminar would cover all aspects and periods 
of religious history. Birmingham at the time did have great strength in the 
history of Christianity and was increasingly strong in the History of Islam 
too, and we heard papers from colleagues on pre-historic and Roman reli-
gion, as well as medieval Islam. But although we had a hard core of regu-
lars, including, as well as ourselves, Graeme Murdock and Werner Ustorf, 
we found that many people would only come to papers which were directly 
relevant to their own research, so the original idea tended to get lost. We 
met in the evenings in one another’s homes and a glass of wine or juice was 
served before we started. �e seminar was notable for the friendly spirit 
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that is often lacking in more formal seminars, and it continued until Mike 
left to take up a chair of Anglican Studies at Durham in 2015. 
 
       In the later 1990s I was working on two works of synthesis, both com-
missioned by editors of series. �e first was Religion and Society in England 
1850–1914.24 Among other things, it gave me an opportunity to return to 
the ‘crisis of faith’ in the later Victorian years. I had given this extended, 
but perhaps one-sided treatment in Class and Religion, focusing on how the 
‘crisis’ was experienced, rather than on the broader social processes at work. 
Here I tried to redress the balance. It also marked the beginning of my 
interest in the relationship between religion and sport to which I shall 
return later. 
 
       �e second was Secularisation in Western Europe, 1848–1914,25 com-
missioned by my colleague John Breuilly for a series which he edited. John 
rightly suggested that starting in 1848 made more sense than starting in 
1870, as I had intended. �e revolutions of 1848 were clearly crucially 
important in Germany and France, though less so in England, the third 
country to be discussed in the book. My aim was to produce a social-
historical counterpart to the history of ideas offered by Owen Chadwick in 
his well-known book on secularization in Europe.26 I think I succeeded in 
this, but the book was not widely reviewed, and probably remains less read 
than Chadwick’s book—though a translation into Czech suggests that the 
readership is not confined to the UK. My main point was that, whereas 
historians and especially sociologists often think of a unified secularizing 
process, the extent of secularization at any time has varied not only 
between neighbouring countries but between different areas of life. In the 
second half of the nineteenth century, the secularization of individual 
belief and practice had already made considerable progress, especially in 
France, but the role of religion in politics remained considerable; religion 
was an important component not only of national identities, but also of the 
individual identities of many people who were far from devout, and reli-
gion was deeply embedded in popular culture, especially in traditionally 
Catholic countries. Until the 1960s there was a balance between the secu-
larizing tendencies and the continuing strength of religion in many areas 
of society and of individual lives. 
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       Conferences have played a large part in my academic life, both because 
many of my publications began as conference papers,27 and probably would 
not have been written but for this invitation, and because most of my aca-
demic collaborations began with meetings at a conference. As examples of 
the latter, I met Jeff Cox for the first time at the History Workshop on 
Religion and Society held at Friends’ House London in 1983, which was 
probably the largest gathering ever held of those interested in the social 
history of religion, and I also had a meeting there with Bob Scribner. �is 
led to my collaboration with him in a series on “Christianity and Society in 
the Modern World,” which included many notable books on the period 
from the Reformation to now.28 �e most widely read, no doubt, was 
Callum Brown’s �e Death of Christian Britain,29 to which I shall return 
later. I had first met Callum at the Social History Conference in 1981, and 
I first met David Hempton, with whom I would also later work, at a con-
ference of the Ecclesiastical History Society in the later ’80s. While there 
are good reasons why academics might reduce their travel to distant parts 
of the world, the requirement to meet online has severely reduced the value 
of the conferences held during the covid pandemic. One, based in the 
Netherlands, in which I took part, was a disaster because of technical prob-
lems. �e other such events went smoothly so far as the technology was 
concerned but they largely excluded the informal discussions and the new 
contacts which are essential parts of face to face academic meetings. 
 
       In 2002 I was elected president of the Ecclesiastical History Society, 
the main organization of historians of Christianity in the UK. It also regu-
larly includes speakers and participants from other countries. �e president 
chooses the theme for that year’s conferences. I chose “Retribution, Repen-
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tance and Reconciliation,” and invited speakers ranging from Christine 
Trevett on forgiveness and reconciliation in the early Church to John de 
Gruchy on the Truth and Reconciliation Commission in South Africa. I 
chose as the theme for my presidential address “Christianity and Capital 
Punishment.”30 �is reflected a longstanding interest in the theme, since at 
sixteen I had won a public speaking competition for the youth of Guildford 
with a speech calling for abolition. As well as referring to the usual statistical 
arguments and the probability that those who had been hanged in our coun-
try in recent years included some who were innocent, I also made use of reli-
gious arguments concerning the sanctity of life. I was therefore very inter-
ested to see that Richard Evans, in his brilliant history of capital 
punishment in Germany, argued that the declining support for the death 
penalty was an aspect of secularization.31 I was also interested in a book by 
a former Anglican prison chaplain, Harry Potter, who argued that the con-
tinuing support from the Church of England and especially the bishops was 
crucial to the continuation of hanging into the 1950s and that the with-
drawal of this support from the later part of that decade was a key factor in 
the suspension and then abolition of the death penalty in the ’60s.32 Excel-
lent as both books were, I was not convinced by these central arguments. I 
suggested that rational arguments for or against the death penalty were less 
significant than its symbolic significance and that this changed frequently—
not least when a former opponent of the punishment, such as Robespierre, 
found himself in power. Starting with the Catholic Enlightenment and the 
abolitions in Tuscany and the Austrian Empire in the later eighteenth cen-
tury and concluding with the current debates in the USA, I argued that the 
most consistent opponents of the death penalty have been Socialists and 
dissenting Christian minorities, but that those in political power or posi-
tions of privilege have shown a reluctance to relinquish this part of their 
armoury, even if they had a history of earlier opposition. 
 
       �e historical organization in which I have been most actively 
involved is the “Commission Internationale d’Histoire et d’Études du 
Christianisme” (CIHEC), the international organization of historians of 
Christianity, affiliated to the International Historical Congress. It arose 
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out of the 1950 Congress in a spirit of post-war reconciliation, bringing 
together historians mainly from France, Belgium and West Germany, and 
also Catholic and Protestant historians, at a time when they tended to be 
organized separately. In time, historians from other parts of Europe as well 
as the U.S. got involved, including some from Poland and Romania, and 
more recently from other parts of the former Eastern Bloc. My involve-
ment began when I was asked to organize a panel on urban religion in the 
nineteenth and twentieth centuries as part of a series of sessions organized 
by CIHEC at the International Historical Congress in Madrid in 1990. In 
subsequent years I gave papers or organized sessions at many CIHEC con-
ferences, large and small, including those at every International Historical 
Congress up to Jinan in 2015. I was a committee member from 1995, and 
then president from 2005 to 2010. Whereas in its early days French influ-
ences were dominant, I would say that now its role is most important in 
countries, particularly in eastern Europe, where research on Christian his-
tory was formerly discouraged, and where international contacts are thus 
especially needed. 
 
       �e Madrid conference was important for me not only because it was 
my first experience of organizing an international panel, but because it laid 
the basis for my first edited volume.33 Since then I have edited several vol-
umes, either individually or working with two or three colleagues. �e first 
was a Religious History of Britain as part of a British-French collaboration 
for a French series. I was brought in by Stuart Mews and we worked with 
the French historian of Victorian Britain, Christiane d’Haussy.34 �en I 
was part of a team organizing a conference in Paris on the decline of Chris-
tendom as part of a historical project funded by the World Council of 
Churches. For this I was brought in by my colleague, Werner Ustorf, and 
after considerable delays it led to another book. More recently I assisted 
Todd Weir and Benjamin Ziemann in organizing a conference at the 
British Academy with the title “Defending the Faith.” �is focused on 
“Apologetics” (Christian, Hindu, Jewish, Muslim, Secularist), showing 
how in the multi-confessional world of the twentieth century religious and 
anti-religious bodies of all kinds defended their own beliefs and refuted the 
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attacks from outside, while strengthening the morale and trying to ensure 
the orthodoxy of those inside. Todd and I edited the resulting volume. 
 
       My biggest editorial task was to be responsible for the twentieth-cen-
tury volume of the Cambridge History of Christianity.35 �is was limited 
to the “Western” forms of Christianity, with “Eastern” being the subject of 
a separate volume. �ree volumes in the nine-volume series had a single 
editor while the others had two or even three editors. Like many editors, I 
drew quite heavily on people whom I knew and who I was confident would 
deliver. I do not think that, as one American critic claimed, the volume 
weas Eurocentric, but because of the lack of money for translations the 
contributors were either native English-speakers or had very good English. 
I divided the volume into three sections: “Institutions and Movements,” 
which looked at those with a global reach, including for example the 
Papacy and Pentecostalism; “Narratives of Change,” in which the chapters 
focused on regions of the world, often divided between before after 1945; 
and “Social and Cultural Impact,” which was the most potentially difficult 
part to manage in a balanced way. Authors were asked to look globally at 
a particular theme, but inevitably their expertise was limited to particular 
parts of the globe, and they sometimes struggled to deal with issues which 
were very important in some other countries, but not at all in those which 
they knew most about. �e volume received a negative review in Church 
History and, while I would question many of the reviewer’s criticisms, one 
was, I think, valid and important, namely that we gave too little attention 
to popular culture, including the impact of radio, television, gospel music, 
country and western music, rock music, novels about the Rapture or Niger-
ian exorcism videos. 
 
       My first book had been fortunate in its time of publication and the 
same was true of �e Religious Crisis of the 1960s.36 Interest in the 1960s was 
strong and the book’s international perspectives attracted a readership 
beyond the UK. Moreover, Callum Brown’s Death of Christian Britain had 
stirred up interest in religion in the ’60s, as well as provoking controversy. 
So the time was ripe for a book which covered some of the same ground in 
a different way.  
 
       My interest in the ’60s arose in the first instance from having lived 
through the decade. �e earlier histories of religion in the ’60s were written 
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by people who remembered those years. �eir histories were inevitably 
influenced by their own memories and indeed by their emotional relation-
ship with that decade—strongly positive in Callum’s case, mainly negative 
in some other cases, such as that of Gérard Cholvy and Yves-Marie 
Hilaire, who regarded the later ’60s and early ’70s as a tragedy.37 My own 
memories influenced my writing in that I saw the ’60s not only as a time 
of religious crisis, but also of religious ferment. Both aspects, in my opin-
ion, are essential to an understanding of the decade. So far as my relation-
ship with the ’60s is concerned, it was mainly positive, but with some reser-
vations. I appreciated the greater informality and the loosening of 
conformist pressures which the decade brought. In particular, I valued the 
democratic and egalitarian ideals of the time, and I regret their subsequent 
decline. However, I deplored the romanticization of political violence 
which became fashionable in the later part of the decade. 
 
       �e 1960s played a significant part in Religion and the People, where I 
saw these years as marking the end of an era in Europe’s religious history. 
My interest in the ’60s was renewed by hearing Callum speak at a confer-
ence in Paris in 1997 and by his subsequent book. �en I was invited to 
give a paper on the historiography of Christianity in the twentieth century 
at a session organized by CIHEC in the International Historical Congress 
in Oslo in 2000. I gave a review of the literature, by then quite extensive, 
on religion in the ’60s.38 I made the claim, repeated in my book, that future 
historians would see the 1960s as marking a break in Europe’s religious 
history as decisive as that brought about by the Reformation. In 2004 I was 
invited to give the Vonhoff Lectures at the University of Groningen which 
gave me the opportunity to give my own ideas of the period more shape. 
My approach was distinctive in three ways. First, I recognized that “the 
Sixties” were an international phenomenon: while the principal focus in my 
book was on England, I also gave attention to other countries, most 
notably France and the USA. Second, my focus was on the way that “ordi-
nary people” experienced the ’60s, rather than the bishops and the politi-
cians, or the activists and the celebrities. �is led to my extensive use of oral 
history. �ird, I rejected the chronologies both of those like Callum 
Brown, who saw a radical change of direction in the ’60s, and those like 
Alan Gilbert,39 who saw the 60s as merely the culmination of a long-term 
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evolutionary process of secularization. I argued that the causes of change 
had to be seen on at three levels: long-term pre-conditions, such as the cri-
tiques of Christianity and Judaism, going back to the eighteenth century; 
medium-term catalysts, most notably the onset of affluence after World 
War II; and the impact of specific events, most notably the US Civil Rights 
Movement, �e Vietnam War and Vatican II. “�e Sixties” arose from the 
interaction of these three kinds of factors. 
 
       I attempted to look very broadly at religious change in the “Long Six-
ties” which I defined as 1958–74, laying special emphasis on the impact of 
affluence in weakening community, thus permitting more individualistic 
life-styles. I also looked at changes in the churches, noting both the strong 
reforming impulses in the mid-’60s and the increasing polarization between 
progressives and conservatives in the later part of the decade; at “1968” and 
the political radicalization of the time; at the counter-culture and its “alter-
native spiritualities”; at sex, gender and the family; and at the sweeping leg-
islative changes with regard to homosexuality, divorce and abortion.  
 
       In 2011 the sociologist Hans Joas organized a conference in Erfurt 
where historians from several countries responded to my book from the 
point of view of their own country. I do not think that any of them pre-
sented a picture of change in the ’60s which was incompatible with mine, 
but taking account of what they said would have enabled me to have pre-
sented a more nuanced picture. In the meantime Callum Brown, who had 
been invited to the conference but was unable to be there, had published a 
more thorough-going critique,40 so when I published my response to 
points made by speakers at the conference, I included a response to 
Brown.41 �e basic difference between us was that he sees one big central 
story of “�e Sixties,” namely a mass revolt by the younger generation, 
especially young women, against the churches and against the puritanical 
restrictions which many blamed on the churches. Besides this central story, 
everything else, according to Brown, was a sideshow. My view was that this 
was one of the stories of “�e Sixties,” but that it stood alongside other 
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equally important stories, including the political radicalization of the later 
’60s, the impact of Vatican II, and the social changes associated with rising 
prosperity, to mention only three of the most significant. 
 
       �e “Long Sixties” could be traumatic for Catholics, because up to 
that time they had been generally more successful than the Protestants in 
resisting the secularizing trends. In 1960 there were still parts of rural 
Europe, for example in Brittany, where 90% of the population were prac-
tising Catholics. But in a few years between 1965 and 1975, these figures 
often fell by a half or more. In both Protestant and Catholic Churches the 
mid-’60s had seen demands for radical reforms in Church and society, and 
rising hopes that rapid changes were possible, even likely. Because Vatican 
II had raised hopes for change so high, the disappointment was all the 
greater when changes were limited and came slowly. Most denominations 
saw a decline in the numbers of their clergy, both because of fewer voca-
tions and because of those leaving the priesthood, but the Catholic losses 
were much more severe. Research in France suggests that most of those 
who left had gone through a longer period of disillusionment with the set-
apartness of the clergy and the hierarchical nature of the Church.42 
 
       While the political and religious dramas of the decade, as well as the 
sexual revolution, made the headlines, some of the social changes were 
much more subtle and imperceptible. One of the advantages of oral history 
is that it can pick up some of the less dramatic but equally significant 
changes. I was struck by an interview with a woman who recalled that she 
and her husband had regularly attended the Methodist church until the 
time of their marriage, but then they increasingly came to spend Sunday, 
their only free day together, going out on their motor bike—with the result 
that they ‘floated away’ from the church.  
 
       I faced the question of how far changes in that decade followed a 
common pattern and how far there were distinctive national trajectories. I 
think in retrospect that I may have placed insufficient emphasis on national 
differences. One national difference which I did discuss, however, was the 
growing gap opening up in the ’70s between a more religious USA and an 
increasingly secular Europe. I argued that in the ’60s churches in both 
Europe and the USA had suffered serious losses. But the situation in the 
USA began to stabilize around 1972, while the trend in Europe continued 
to be downward. In 2010 I had the chance to explore this theme more fully. 
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I was given a Fellowship at the Swedish Collegium of Advanced Studies in 
Uppsala as part of a small group interested in longer term patterns of reli-
gious change. Also in the group were Hans Joas, one of the Collegium’s 
permanent fellows, and two historians from the USA, David Sorkin and Jeff 
Cox. I rejected the view that there was a fundamental divide between a “reli-
gious” United States and a “secular” Europe, arguing that up to the 1970s 
Europe was not “less religious” than the United States but “differently reli-
gious.” Moreover, there were big differences between European countries 
and between American regions. From the perspective of the early twenty-
first century when, especially during the presidency of George W. Bush, 
many Europeans were concerned at the political influence of the Religious 
Right in the USA, and many Americans were concerned at the growth of 
secularism in Europe and also at the rising importance of Islam, it appeared 
that there were deep-rooted historic differences which might explain the 
current situation. I argued, however, that the real divergence took place in 
the 1970s. I subsequently discussed the question with David Hempton and 
we planned two conferences at Radcliffe and Harvard, papers from which 
eventually fed into a collective volume.43 Our idea was to pick nine issues 
where it might be argued that there were significant European/American 
differences and then to invite two authors, one mainly expert on the USA 
and one mainly expert on one or more European countries, to debate the 
issue. David and I, while agreed on quite a lot, also had some significant dif-
ferences, so we wrote two concluding chapters. David’s theme was the accu-
mulation of small differences which led Europe and America in what were 
ultimately different directions. My theme was change over time in the 
nature and extent of the differences. In the nineteenth century, American 
religious history was very different from that of France, for example, but the 
religious similarities between the USA and Great Britain were far greater 
than the differences. From the early twentieth century onwards, Britain and 
the USA diverged as secularization, though apparent in both countries, 
advanced more rapidly in Britain. But the presence especially of the 
Catholic Church in many parts of Europe and its roots in popular culture 
remained strong up to the 1960s, in spite of the greater role of secularism 
in European than in American politics. 
 
       My most recent project, leading to a book on Religion and the Rise of 
Sport in England, now in the process of publication,44 has developed over 
many years. My interest in the subject began with my book on Religion and 
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Society 1850–1914. I was struck by the fact that the decline in church-going 
from about 1890 coincided with the Victorian sports boom, and I won-
dered if there was a connection. To complicate the question, I was well 
aware that the churches had often contributed to the boom by forming 
cricket and football clubs or providing gymnasia. When Sturt Mews was 
elected president of the Ecclesiastical History Society in 1999 and selected 
as his theme “Work, Rest and Play” (a reference to the advertising slogan 
“A Mars Bar a Day Helps you Work, Rest and Play”), I took the opportu-
nity to return to the theme with a short paper. I presented the relationship 
between Victorian Churches and sports in the form of a modified version 
of Jane Austen’s Pride and Prejudice in which this relationship moved 
through successive phases of repulsion, attraction and ultimately (diverging 
here from Austen) a friendly separation. I then developed the theme in the 
following years, usually in response to invitations to contribute to confer-
ences or collective volumes. �e first was a paper on “Nonconformity and 
Sport” for a Festschrift in honour of Clyde Binfield.45 For a Festschrift in 
honour of Keith Robbins, I took a more international approach, examining 
the relationship between religion, sport and politics in several European 
politics, highlighting the difference between England and the many Euro-
pean countries, including France, Germany and Ireland, where sport was 
more strongly politicized.46  
 
       An invitation to deliver the Hulsean lectures in Cambridge in 2008 
gave me the opportunity to tie my thoughts on the Victorian period more 
fully together. But as one questioner asked, “What happened before and 
what happened after?” In the book which I finally completed in 2021 I tried 
to answer those questions, bringing the story up to the present day. �e 
peculiar circumstances of 2020 and 2021 influenced the shape of my later 
research. Access to archives was cut off for long periods, and I had to make 
much greater use of sources available through the internet. While the rela-
tionship between religion and sport in the nineteenth century is well-docu-
mented and there are some (though not many) major studies by historians,47 
very little research has been done on the twentieth century. So in discussing 
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the nineteenth century I was in dialogue with other historians, including 
some for whom religion was secondary to their main concerns, but in writ-
ing about the twentieth century I was to a large extent on my own, apart 
from Jack Williams, a leading historian of cricket, who was the first to point 
to the importance of the churches in sport in the inter-war years.48  
 
       My research showed that many of the sports clubs and facilities estab-
lished by churches in the Victorian years continued into the 1960s and only 
went into rapid decline in the ’70s and ’80s. It was precisely then that 
Evangelical churches began to come to the fore in church-based sport and 
large numbers of new clubs and leagues were formed. I suggested that the 
history of the relationship between religion and sport encapsulates the var-
ious stages of English religious history since the later eighteenth century. 
It begins with the “unreformed” Church of England and its connections 
with “traditional” sports. �en in the early nineteenth century, the rise of 
Evangelicalism brought growing tensions as Christian preachers attacked 
many of the then-popular sports because of their cruelty or brutality, and 
all of them because of their associations with gambling. Some Evangelicals 
simply regarded all sports as a waste of precious time. However, the grow-
ing liberalization of theology in the later part of the nineteenth century was 
associated with a friendlier view of sport—or at least of “good” sports such 
as football and cricket. �e first half of the twentieth century was the era 
of what some historians have called “diffusive Christianity”: church-going 
was in decline but the churches remained familiar and respected institu-
tions, not least because of the huge range of recreational activities which 
they provided, especially for the young, but for many adults too. �e later 
twentieth century saw growing secularization and the decline of church-
based sports. But by the end of that century and the beginning of the 
twenty-first, there was not only a changed religious world but a changed 
relationship between religion and sport. In spite of continuing seculariza-
tion, there was a large growth of sports chaplaincy, involving, for example, 
the majority of major soccer clubs; the impact of immigration and the 
globalization of sport meant that star athletes came from a wide variety of 
religious backgrounds, including many Muslims; and the Evangelicals who 
had once condemned sport were now its most enthusiastic advocates.  
 
       When I retired in 2010, Callum Brown and Mike Snape organized a 
small conference and presented me with a Festschrift with contributions 
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        48. Jack Williams, Cricket and England: A Cultural and Social History of the Inter-War 
Years (London, 1999). 



from historians and sociologists from a number of countries.49 I am 
immensely grateful to Callum and Mike, as well as to all the other contrib-
utors, for their work in making this fine volume possible. I also appreciated 
the diversity of the contributors, including scholars with opposing views on 
major historical or sociological issues. So far as my historical work is con-
cerned, I have tried to avoid joining a party, and have valued having friends 
with very different approaches and belonging to organisations with differ-
ent cultures. Introducing me before a lecture in Sheffield some years ago, 
Clyde Binfield made the perceptive comment that he had heard me speak 
both at the Ecclesiastical History Society and at a History Workshop and 
“they are as different as chalk and cheese.” My historical roots lie in the 
social history of the 1960s and ’70s, and in spite of the various learning 
experiences which I have described here, my approach to history has not 
changed fundamentally since then. �e theme of my work has continued 
to be the interaction between religion and society, but I have explored this 
theme by focusing on many different areas, including, for example, the 
labour movement, national identity, the role of religion in legislative 
changes, anti-clericalism and everyday life. My interest in comparative his-
tory has led me to spread my net widely, and I think this has both advan-
tages and disadvantages. In my recent work on the history of sport I have 
been aware that I do not have the in-depth knowledge of any one sport 
which most specialists in the field have. And, indeed, I do not have the 
kind of in-depth knowledge of the history of any religious denomination, 
including my own, which any denominational historian has. My corre-
sponding strength, I hope, lies in a readiness to enter sympathetically into 
very different religious worlds. 
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        49. Callum G. Brown and Michel Snape, eds., Secularisation in the Christian World 
(Farnham, 2010).



Catholic Child and Youth Martyrs, 1588–2022 
 

RACHEL M. MCCLEARY* 
 

Child and youth martyrs throughout the history of Christianity are 
few. New emphasis on their presence in the twentieth century raises 
questions about the nature of sanctity. Using a new data set on child, 
adolescent, and youth martyrs beatified and canonized since 1588, this 
article discusses early modern to contemporary models of sanctity for 
males and females while at the same time showing how the ancient 
motif of puer senex continues to be relevant in their narratives. With 
Catholic teachings adapting to contemporary views on child agency 
and autonomy, several problems arise, requiring the Church to re-
evaluate its models of sanctity for young people. 
 
Keywords: Martyrs, child, adolescent, youth, Vatican II, sanctity, 
puer senex, beatified, canonized 

 

Since the establishment of the Congregation for the Causes of Saints in 
1588, the Roman Catholic Church has beatified 5,213 martyrs.1 �ese 

numbers exclude pre-Congregation child and youth martyrs, among them 
the Holy Innocents, the first Christian martyrs.2 Unlike confessors, mar-
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        * Rachel M. McCleary is a Lecturer in the Economics Department at Harvard Univer-
sity. Her email address is: rachel_mccleary@harvard.edu. She would like to thank her col-
leagues at Harvard and the Association for the Study of Religion, Economics, and Culture 
for their comments. 
        1. Initially called the Sacred Congregation of Rites and Ceremonies, its founding was 
to create a centralized administration responsible for saint-making and relics within the 
Roman Curia. “�e creation of the Sacred Congregation of Rites and Ceremonies marked a 
major evolution in causes of canonization, providing a stable structure so that these causes 
could be treated in a systematic way.” �e second reason for the establishment of the Con-
gregation was to ensure that the process was systematic and thorough, avoiding ridicule from 
Protestants as well as within the Church. “�e Sacred Congregation of Rites was entrusted 
with the duty to study causes of canonization with great care, thus insuring [sic] that those to 
be proposed as saints were truly worthy. Moreover the Congregation was to see that the insti-
tution of canonization observed the highest degree of integrity so as to hold it above ridicule.” 
Jason A. Gray, “�e Evolution of the Promoter of the Faith in Causes of Beatification and 
Canonization: A Study of the Law of 1917 and 1983” (�esis ad Doctoratum in Iure canonico 
adsequendum, Pontificia Università Lateranense, Rome, 2015), 58. 
        2. �e term “Holy Innocents” refers to the male children of Bethlehem, two years old 
and under, massacred by order of Herod the Great. �e three Magi informed Herod of the 



tyrs tend to die in large groups, resulting in the overall number of martyrs 
beatified greatly exceeding the number of confessors (772).3 Among the 
beatified martyrs, 183 are children and youth eighteen years and younger 
(Table 1). According to the 1983 Code of Canon Law, minority status 
ends at eighteen, adolescence at fourteen, and infancy at seven.  
 
       In 1981, the Congregation for the Causes of Saints held a Plenary Con-
gregation in the Vatican to discuss the question of the beatification and can-
onization of adolescents.4 �is article discusses a new data set of child and 
youth martyrs officially recognized by the Church from 1588 to early 2022.5 
�is data set was constructed using documents of the Church such as the 
Index ac Status Causarum (1953, 1999, 2008), the website of the Congrega-
tion for the Causes of Saints, as well as written materials by the Congrega-
tion, papal documents, documents of the offices of archdioceses and dioceses 
as well as religious orders, and investigative studies on martyr events.6 �e 
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birth of a new king. Herod sought to eliminate all possible rivals through the massacring of 
the infants (Matthew 2:1–18). �ey are considered martyrs because they not only died for 
Christ, but instead of Christ. For a discussion of the differences and similarities in accounts 
of early Latin and Greek Church fathers, see M. J. Mans, “�e Early Latin Church Fathers 
on Herod and the Infanticide,” Harvard �eological Studies, 53, nos. 1 & 2 (combined issue, 
1997), 92–102 (firstname unknown). For a discussion of the Holy Innocents in East and 
West theological writings, see Paul A. Hayward, “Suffering and Innocence in Latin Sermons 
for the Feast of the Holy Innocents, c. 400–800,” Studies in Church History, 31 (1994), 67–80, 
and Marie E. Doerfler, “�e Infant, the Monk and the Martyr: �e Death of Children in 
Eastern Patristic �ought,” Le Muséon, 124, no. 3 (2010), 243–58. Also excluded from this 
discussion are child and youth saints and blesseds, such as Simon of Trent, expunged from 
the liturgical calendar in the 1960s. 
        3. For a discussion of martyrs beatified since 1588, see Rachel M. McCleary and Robert 
J. Barro, “Opening the Fifth Seal: Catholic Martyrs and Forces of Religious Competition,” 
Journal of Religion and Demography, 7 (2020), 92–122; Rachel M. McCleary and Robert J. 
Barro, “Martyrs and Confessors,” (paper, delivered at the American Economic Association 
Meetings, held virtually, January 7, 2022). For a discussion of the confessors data set, see 
Robert J. Barro and Rachel M. McCleary, “Saints Marching In, 1590–2021,” Economica, 83 
(2016), 385–415; Robert J. Barro, Rachel M. McCleary, and Alexander McQuoid, “Econom-
ics of Sainthood, a Preliminary Investigation,” in: Handbook of Religion and Political Economy, 
ed. Rachel M. McCleary (Oxford, 2011), Chapter 10. 
        4. Congregation for the Causes of Saints, Plenary Congregation, March 31–April 2, 
1981. L’Osservatore Romano, April 10, 1981, page 7 carried articles by several authors, includ-
ing Cardinal Pietro Palazzini, Prefect of the Congregation for the Causes of Saints, present-
ing arguments for heroic virtues in children and adolescents qualifying them for beatification. 
        5. From here on in the discussion, the Roman Catholic Church is referred to as “the 
Church.” 
        6. �e Congregation for the Causes of Saints published a small book by Maurizio 
Tagliaferri and Judith Borer, Santi e Beati Giovani (Vatican, 2017), that lists by geographic  
region the child, adolescent, and youth (up to age thirty) confessors and martyrs beatified and 



present analysis situates martyrs within the social, cultural, and political con-
texts of their deaths (Table 2). Even though martyrdoms occurred at histor-
ically different periods, within diverse societal contexts, and across geo-
graphic locales, similar persecution patterns emerge when accounting for 
gender, age, ethnicity, social status, and affiliation with the Church. 

 
      The issue of agency—choosing to be a martyr—is a prominent 
theme in cases of child and youth martyrs who died alone. Without the 
psychological, emotional, and physical support of family and other 
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canonized from 1588 to 2017. No biographical narratives are provided. Between 1588 and 
2022, the Church beatified nine confessors eighteen years and younger. Four were canonized. 

TABLE 1.  Beatified Child and Youth Martyrs 

                                            Total         Age 0–6     Age 7–14  Age 15–18     No age                                                  ________   ________   ________   ________   ________ 
                                          All       F       All       F       All       F       All       F       All       F 

All                                            183    41     29     11     45     10     73     13     36      8 
Start–1800                               3     0      0      0      2      0      1      0      0      0 
1801–1900                              33     1     10      0      9      0     10      1      4      0 
1901–1978                              28     9      0      0      9      4     19      5      0      0 
1978–2005 JPII                     29     9      0      0      5      1     12      4     12      4 
2005–2013 Ben XVI           70    20     19     11     17      4     14      1     20      4 
2013–2022 Francis              21     3      0      0      3      1     18      2      0      0 

                                             Lay          Lay Plus        Order          Alone                                                  ________   ________   ________   ________ 
                                          All       F       All       F       All       F       All       F 

All                                            142    41    147    41     34      0      20      8 
Start–1800                               3     0      3     0      0      0       0      0 
1801–1900                              25     1     25     0      7      0       1      1 
1901–1978                              25     9     25     9      3      0       6      2 
1978–2005 JPII                     22     9     25     9      4      0       3      2 
2005–2013 Ben XVI           56    20     57    20     13      0       2      1 
2013–2022 Francis              12     3     12     3      7      0       8      3 
 
Note: No age signifies a child or youth martyr without information on specific age at death. 
�ese persons are included in the “total” group in the upper panel.  F denotes female.   
�e category of “Lay Plus” includes those who were catechists, aspirants, sacristans, altar boys, 
acolytes, postulants, candidates, oblates, and those affiliated with a religious order in a non-
ordained position such as novice, cooperator, or lay brother. Data obtained from the Congre-
gation for the Causes of Saints, Index ac Status Causarum (1953; 1999; 2008); the Congrega-
tion’s website, http://www.causesanti.va/it.html, and for Japanese martyrs, Juan Ruiz de 
Medina, S.J., El Martirologio del Japón, 1558–1873 (Roma, 1999).



TABLE 2. Beatified Child and Youth Martyrs by Event 

Event                            Numbers            Description 

Martyrs of Japan      83 (F: 19) [0]   Persecution by Tokugawa Shogūnate. Died  
                                                         in groups of entire families, groups of female 

and male Christians. Imprisoned, died by 
burning at the stake, cut to pieces, etc. 

Spanish Civil War   26 (F: 0) [3]     Anti-Catholic Republican Army captured,  
                                                         imprisoned and shot mostly clerics and males. 

Militia came to the homes of two youths, 
took them and shot them. �e third youth 
who died alone was imprisoned and shot. 

Boxer Rebellion       16 (F: 6) [2]     Spontaneous Boxer rebel uprising against  
                                                         foreigners and native Christians. Boxers cap-

tured, tortured, and killed clerics, Chinese vil-
lagers residing near mission stations (Catholic 
and Protestant) and Chinese Christians. 

Martyrs of Natal      12 (F: 4) [0]     Dutch-Portuguese colonists warring along  
(Brazil)                                              with indigenous auxiliaries led to massacres 

of a moradores settlement that included male 
and female children and youth. 

Martyrs of Korea     8 (F: 4) [4]       Chosǒn empire persecuted foreign and native  
                                                         Christians. Imprisoned, tortured, and hanged.   

Martyrs of Uganda   7 (F: 0) [1]       European missionaries and colonists threat- 
                                                         ened the Buganda empire.  Court Christian 

pages burned alive on orders of the king. 
Ssebuggwawo, who died alone, was hacked 
to death by the king’s executioners. 

Canary Islands         5 (F: 0) [0]       Part of Counter-Reformation conflicts, when  
(on way to Brazil)                             French Huguenot pirates attacked the ship 

carrying Jesuit missionaries to Brazil. 

Martyrs of Prague    3 (F: 0) [0]       Franciscan friars and novices were beaten to  
                                                         death by Protestants after the Archduke of 

Austria sacked Prague. 

Martyrs of               3 (F: 3) [0]       Franco-�ai border conflict: the �ai govern- 
�ailand                                            ment persecuted Catholics as part of its 

“nationalist” agenda, leading local authorities 
to put Catholics to death. 

Martyrs of                (F:0)  [1]           Spanish Conquest of Mexico and the conver- 
Tlaxcala 3                                          sion of adolescents who proselytized to rela-

tives and indigenous tribes. Cristóbal, a noble 
Nahual youth, was murdered by his father. 

(continued on next page)
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TABLE 2. Beatified Child and Youth Martyrs by Event (continued) 

Event                            Numbers            Description 

Communism post    1 (F: 0) [1]       Communist forces persecuted Christians in  
WWII                                               occupied countries. Rolando Rivi was impris-

oned, tortured, and shot; he died alone. 

Cristero War           1 (F: 0) [1]       Pro-Catholic forces challenged the Mexican  
(Mexico)                                           liberal government. �e Military captured 

Sanchez del Rio, who was tortured and shot. 

El Salvador Civil     1 (F: 0) [0]       �e Salvadoran military targeted Catholics  
War                                                   whom it viewed as “Communist”; it shot 

priest and his companions. 

Guatemala Civil      1 (F: 0) [1]       �e Guatemalan military targeted Catholics,  
War                                                   whom they viewed as “guerrilla sympathizers.” 

�ey captured Barrera Mendez, who was tor-
tured, hanged from a tree, and shot to death. 

Martyrs of Ireland    1 (F:0)  [0]       Queen Elizabeth I and the Act Against  
                                                         Reconciliation with Rome: those who 

secretly conveyed priests by boat were tor-
tured, hung, drawn and quartered. 

Martyrs of Laos       1 (F: 0) [0]       During the Laotian Civil War, Communist  
                                                         guerrillas attacked a car carrying Inthirath 

and the parish priest, killing both. 

Martyrs of               2 (F: 0) [1]       Two historical periods (1600s and 1800s) of  
Vietnam                                            government purges of native Catholics and 

missionaries. 

Guam and               1 (F: 0) [0]       Indigenous group murdered a missionary  
Philippines                                        priest and native catechist for violating chief-

tain’s order. 

In Defensum              5 (F: 5) [5]       Five girls and a youth who were violently 
Castitatis                                           attacked in attempted rapes (in defensum 

castitatis). Each died alone. 

Martyrs of Paimol,  2 (F: 0) [0]       Intra-tribal conflicts, exacerbated by British  
Uganda                                             colonial rule, led to the killings of Okelo, a 

catechist, and Jildo, who were proselytizing 
outside their tribe. 

Tenentismo Revolt  1 (F: 0) [0]       Brazilian military officers’ revolt against the  
(Brazil)                                              government: Tenentismo revolutionaries 

ambushed and killed a missionary priest and 
his Brazilian altar server. 

 
Note:  Female number shown in parentheses. Number of children and youth who died alone 
shown in brackets.
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TABLE 3. PART I. All Martyrs Beatified by Event 

                                                                                                                                               Overall           Age 0–18       Age 0–14      Age 15–18        No age                                                                                                                                           __________    _________    _________    _________    _________ 
Event                                                                 Death years         BEA years             All          F        All        F        All        F        All        F        All        F 

Spanish Civil War                                        1934–1939         1987–2021         2053     236      26        0        0        0       26        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Otranto (Italy)                         1480                  1771                   813      —       —      —      —      —      —      —       —      — 
French Revolution                                       1792–1799         1906–2021          446     151       0        0        0        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Japan                                           1597–1639         1627–2008          437      93      83       19       52       14        7        1        24        4 
English Reformation                                   1535–1681         1886–1987          288       4       0        0        0        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Korea                                           1791–1888         1925–2014          228      73       8        4        3        2        5        2         0        0 
World War II                                                 1939–1946         1971–2021          171      32       1        1        0        0        1        1         0        0 
Martyrs of Vietnam                                     1745–1862         1900–1951          113       1       1        0        0        0        1        0         0        0 
Boxer  Rebellion                                            1900                  1946–1955           86      34      16        6        5        2       11        4         0        0 
Communism post WWII                          1945–1995         1998–2019           84       8       1        0        1        0        0        0         0        0 
Mongol Invasion (Second)                        1260                  1807                    49       0      —        0       —       0       —       0        —       0 
Canary Islands (on way to Brazil)           1570                  1854                    40       0       5        0        0        0        5        0         0        0 
Cristero War (Mexico)                               1926–1931         1988–2005           39       0       1        0        1        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Natal (Brazil)                            1645                  2000                    29       5      12        4        0        0        0        0        12        4 
Martyrs of Uganda                                       1885–1886         1920                    22       0       7        0        1        0        6        0         0        0 
Algerian Civil War                                       1994–1996         2018                    19       6       0        0        0        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Gorkum (Netherlands)         1572                  1675                    19       0       0        0        0        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of China                                          1747–1856         1889–1900           17       1       0        0        0        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Ireland                                        1579–1654         1992                    17       1       1        0        0        0        1        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Laos                                             1954–1969         2016                    17       0       1        0        0        0        1        0         0        0 
Guatemala Civil War                                  1980–1991         2017–2021           14       0       1        0        1        0        0        0         0        0 
Martyrs of Prague                                         1611                  2012                    14       0       3        0        3        0        0        0         0        0 
 
Note: No age signifies a child or youth martyr without information on specific age at death. �ese persons are included in the age 0–18 group. F denotes 
female. Martyrs of Otranto case has information on gender for only one person. Martyrs of Otranto and Mongol Invasion cases have no data on age at death.
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TABLE 3. PART II. All Martyrs Canonized by Event 

                                                                                                                                                 Overall         Age 0–18       Age 0–14      Age 15–18        No age                                                                                                                                              _________    _________    _________    _________    _________ 
Event                                                                 Death years         CAN years             All        F        All        F        All        F        All        F        All        F 

Spanish Civil War                                        1934, 1936        1999, 2013            11       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Otranto (Italy)                         1480                  2013                     813      —      —      —       —       —       —      —       —      — 

French Revolution                                       1792                  2016                       1       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Japan                                           1597–1637         1862–1987            42       2        4        0         2         0         2        0         0        0 

English Reformation                                   1535–1681         1935–1975            47       3        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Korea                                           1838–1867         1984                     105      49        4        2         2         1         2        1         0        0 

World War II                                                 1941–1942         1982, 1998             2       1        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Vietnam                                     1745–1862         1988–1992           113       1        1        0         0         0         1        0         0        0 

Boxer  Rebellion                                            1900                  2000                      86      34       16        6         5         2        11        4         0        0 

Communism post WWII                          —                      —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Mongol Invasion (Second)                        1260                  —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Canary Islands (on way to Brazil)           —                      —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Cristero War (Mexico)                               1926–1928         2000, 2016            25       0        1        0         1         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Natal (Brazil)                            1645                  2017                      29       5       12        4         0         0         0        0        12        4 

Martyrs of Uganda                                       1885–1886         1964                      22       0        7        0         1         0         6        0         0        0 

Algerian Civil War                                       1994–1996         —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Gorkum (Netherlands)         1572                  1867                      19       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of China                                          1747–1856         1996, 2000            17       1        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Ireland                                        1579-1654         —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Laos                                             1954-1969         —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Guatemala Civil War                                  —                      —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Martyrs of Prague                                         1611                  —                           0       0        0        0         0         0         0        0         0        0 

Note:  See note to Table 3: Part I.



Christians, a child martyred alone demonstrates exceptional fortitude 
and discipline. His Eminence Pietro Palazzini, Prefect of the Congrega-
tion for the Causes of Saints (1980–1988), referred to young martyrs and 
confessors as “precocious,” “exceptional” and “endowed with singular 
abilities.”7 By doing so, he continued the usage of the ancient puer senex 
motif in modern narratives of young martyrs.8 Exceptional sanctity in 
children and youth assumes agency beyond their chronological, biologi-
cal development. The Church’s theological interpretation of sanctity, 
what can be called “the norm,” applies universally, regardless of whether 
a person is an adult or minor, including infants and children. Because of 
their cognitive, psychological, and physical development, the norm of 
sanctity in minors applies according to their chronological capabilities, 
what Palazzini refers to as the principle of relative maturity.9 Yet, chil-
dren and youth singled out for beatification are “exceptional” and a rarity 
among minors.  
 
       �e discussion presented here does not elaborate on the topic of 
agency in minors.10 Rather, this study presupposes the position taken by 
Palazzini, theologians, and religious scholars that minors are capable of 
exceptional spirituality and heroic action. �e focus here is providing a 
description of the contexts of martyrdom and sanctity of those child, ado-
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         7. Pietro Palazzini, Instruzione Redatta ad uso di Quanti si Occupano delle Cause di Beat-
ificazione e Canonizzazione delgi Adolescenti (working document, approved May 6, 1981 by 
Pope John Paul II in preparation for the Plenary Congregation of the members of the Con-
gregation for the Causes of Saints, March 31–April 2, 1981. Provided to the author by the 
Congregation for the Causes of Saints, June 26, 2020).  
         8. The evolution of the puer senex motif has its origins in ancient Roman literature, 
see André-Jean Festugière, “Lieux communs littéraires et thèmes de folklore dans l’ha-
giographie primitive,” Wiener Studien, 73 (1960), 123–52; Teresa C. Carp, “‘Puer Senex’ in 
Roman and Medieval Thought,” Latomus, 39, Fasc. 3 (Jul.–Sep., 1980), 736–39; Christian 
Gnilka, “Das Puer Senex Ideal und die Kirchenbauten zu Nolan,” Boreas: Münsterche 
Beiträge zur Archäologie, 18 (1995), 175–84; Ernst Robert Curtius and Colin Burrow, Euro-
pean Literature and the Latin Middle Ages (Princeton, 2013), 98–101. For discussions of the 
puer senex motif in medieval hagiographies, particularly in the childhoods of adult saints, 
see André Vauchez, Sainthood in the Later Middle Ages, trans. Pierre Birrell (Cambridge, 
1997), 507–10; Donald Weinstein and Rudolph M. Bell, Saints and Society: The Two Worlds 
of Western Christendom (Chicago, 1982), 19–47; and Michael Goodich, “Childhood and 
Adolescence among the Thirteenth-Century Saints,” History of Childhood Quarterly, 1, no. 
2 (Fall 1973), 285–309. 
         9. Palazzini, “Instruzione,” 5–6. Also, see Vicenzo Lelièvre, Les Jeunes Peuvent-ils être 
Canonisés? (Paris, 1984), 394–97. 
        10. For an in-depth discussion as well as survey of approaches to the topic in Roman 
Catholicism see, Lelièvre, Les Jeunes Peuvent-ils être Canonisés? and �ierry Lelièvre, Même les 
Enfants Peuvent être Canonisés! (Paris, 2005). 



lescent, and youth martyrs beatified between 1588 and early 2022.11 
Although they lived and died during different historical periods, their beat-
ifications occurred in the early-modern to modern period, from 1627 to 
2022. Among the several purposes of hagiographies as a literary form is the 
promotion of models of sanctity presented to the faithful and to the wider 
public.12 In the cases discussed here, the Church’s early-modern to con-
temporary models of sanctity are under scrutiny.  
 
       �is article, first, presents a description of the data set, followed by a 
discussion of child and youth martyrs who died in groups and, finally, a 
discussion of those martyred alone. Canonized minors, similar to adults, 
serve as a visible sign of God within a particular historical context. In the 
early modern to contemporary period under discussion, the Church pres-
ents them as exemplary models of Christian sanctity for their peers to imi-
tate. �e main purpose is to distill models of sanctity that the Church 
chooses for male and female children, adolescents, and youth.  
 

Description of Child and Youth Martyrs Data Set 
 
       Martyrs are the ultimate witness of faith.13 �eir lives exemplify heroic 
virtues for which they voluntarily accept death, motivated directly or indi-
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        11. For treatments of medieval child and youth martyrs and confessors, see Michael 
Goodich, “Childhood and Adolescence among the �irteenth-Century Saints,” 285–309; 
Weinstein and Bell, Saints and Society (Chicago, 1982), 17–99; Patricia Healy Wasyliw, Mar-
tyrdom, Murder, and Magic: Child Saints and �eir Cults in Medieval Europe (New York, 2008); 
Michael Goodich, ed. and trans., Other Medieval Ages: Witnesses at the Margins of Medieval 
Society (Philadelphia, 2015). 
        12. André Vauchez discusses the necessity of hagiographies to convey both the human-
ity (imitability) and the holiness (admirability) of saints, “Saints Admirables et Saints Imita-
bles: Les Fonctions de l’Hagiographie ont-elles Changéaux dernier Siècles du Moyen Âge?” 
in: Les Fonctions des Saints dans le Monde Occidental (IIIe–XIIIe siècle), Actes du Colloque de 
Rome, 27–29, 1988 (Rome, 1991), 161–72. Several authors discuss the early modern 
Church’s evolving criteria for sanctity. Simon Ditchfield describes post-Tridentine hagio-
graphic emphasis on imitation, moving the reader into action, in Liturgy, Sanctity, and History 
in Tridentine Italy: Pietro Maria Campi and the Preservation of the Particular (Cambridge, 
1995), 132–4, as does Karen A. Winstead with regard to English hagiography after the fif-
teenth century, in Fifteenth-Century Lives: Writing Sainthood in England (South Bend, 2020), 
147–60. John McCafferty details the “repurposing” of Brigit of Kildare’s hagiography to 
comply with female sanctity as defined by the Church’s post-Tridentine reforms in “Brigid of 
Kildare: Stabilizing a Female Saint for Early Modern Catholic Devotion,” Journal of Medieval 
and Early Modern Studies, 50, no. 1 (2020), 53–73. 
        13. �e theological-juridical definition of martyrdom is “the voluntary suffering or sus-
taining of death for the faith or another virtue related to God.” See Prospero Lambertini 
(Benedict XIV), De Servorum Dei beatificatione et Beatorum canonizatione (Prato, 1839), Lib.  



rectly by hatred of the faith (odium fidei) on the part of their persecutors, 
whom the martyrs forgive.14 �is classic interpretation of martyrdom orig-
inates with Roman persecution of the early Christians martyred for their 
faith. �ey are, in Peter Brown’s felicitous phrase, “the venerable nucleus 
of the throng of saints.”  
 
      Lumen Gentium introduced a new dimension of sanctity, referred to 
as the “martyr of charity.”15 �is new model of martyrdom emphasizes 
selfless, voluntary sacrifice of one’s life out of love (caritas) for God and 
one’s neighbor, pivoting away from a focus on the persecutor and the per-
secutor’s motivation (odium fidei) to emphasize the martyr’s heroicity. �e 
first actualization of this broadening of the classical meaning of martyr-
dom occurred when John Paul II canonized Maximilian Kolbe as a 
“martyr of charity” in October 1982.16 Eleven years earlier, Pope Paul VI 
beatified Kolbe as a confessor, not a martyr, referring to him as “martyr of 
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III, Cap. 11, 1. Another definition is, “Martyrdom is the supreme witness given to the truth 
of the faith: it means bearing witness even unto death. �e martyr bears witness to Christ who 
died and rose, to whom he is united by charity. He bears witness to the truth of the faith and 
of Christian doctrine. He endures death through an act of fortitude. ‘Let me become the food 
of the beasts, through whom it will be given me to reach God.’” Catechism of the Catholic 
Church (Vatican, 1993), para. 2473. 
        14. Benedict XVI reaffirmed Benedict XIV’s historical, canonical-legal criteria of mar-
tyrdom in his letter to the 2006 plenary session of the Congregation for the Causes of Saints. 
Martyrdom is (1) to suffer a violent death inflicted by (2) a persecutor perpetrated for (3) 
reason or reasons directly bearing on the victim’s faith and/or Christian moral virtue, and (4) 
such death suffered by the victim whose life exemplifies a constancy in practicing the virtues 
over time confronts her death with fortitude and forgives her persecutor. Benedict XVI, To 
the Participants of the Plenary Session of the Congregation for the Causes of Saints (letter, Vatican, 
April 24, 2006). 
        15. “Since Jesus, the Son of God, manifested His charity by laying down His life for us, 
so too no one has greater love than he who lays down his life for Christ and His brothers 
(230). From the earliest times, then, some Christians have been called upon—and some will 
always be called upon—to give the supreme testimony of this love to all men, but especially 
to persecutors. �e Church, then, considers martyrdom as an exceptional gift and as the 
fullest proof of love. By martyrdom a disciple is transformed into an image of his Master by 
freely accepting death for the salvation of the world—as well as his conformity to Christ in 
the shedding of his blood. �ough few are presented such an opportunity, nevertheless all 
must be prepared to confess Christ before men. �ey must be prepared to make this profes-
sion of faith even in the midst of persecutions, which will never be lacking to the Church, in 
following the way of the cross.” Pope Paul VI, �e Dogmatic Constitution of the Church, Lumen 
Gentium: �e Light of the Nations (Vatican, 1964), Chapter V, para. 42. 
        16. “In virtue of my apostolic authority, I have decreed that Maximilian Maria Kolbe, 
who, after his beatification was venerated as a confessor, shall henceforth be venerated also as 
a martyr.” John Paul II, “Solemn Rite of Canonization of Saint Maximiliano Maria Kolbe” 
(homily, Vatican, October 10, 1982). 



love.”17 Kolbe, a Conventual Franciscan friar imprisoned at Auschwitz, 
offered his life for that of a fellow prisoner who was the father of several 
children. John Paul II declared Kolbe’s act of self-sacrifice one of heroism 
and therefore martyrdom. According to John Paul II, Kolbe is a modern 
martyr who confronted Nazism’s culture of hatred against humanity, 
exterminating innocent people.18 
 
       Pope Francis introduced the category of oblatio vitae, which is not a 
form of martyrdom even though it is similar to the concept of “martyr of 
charity.”19 Oblatio vitae entails the performance of a single selfless act 
grounded in habitual Christian virtuous behavior in quotidian life until the 
extraordinary moment of supreme self-sacrifice. Francis’s introduction of 
oblatio vitae as a separate category can be interpreted as part of the pontiff’s 
broadening of the Church’s understanding of daily martyrdom.20  
 
       Between 1588 and 2022, the Catholic Church beatified 183 child and 
youth martyrs and canonized fifty of them (Table 1). Of the fifty canonized 
child and youth martyrs, 78% were made saints after Vatican II (Table 3: 
Part II). Among the 183 beatified, 122, or 66%, were chosen after the close 
of Vatican II (1962–1965), similar to the pattern among martyred blesseds 
as a whole.21 Of the 183 beatified martyrs, 142 or 77% are male, slightly 
lower than the 85% of all adult martyrs.  
 
       After receiving the three sacraments of initiation—baptism, confirma-
tion, and Eucharist—children and adolescents exercise full membership in 
the church and its evangelizing mission. Upon reaching the age of seven 
(age of reason), children perform penance and receive communion. 
Around this age, the Church introduces boys to institutional roles. Of the 
male child and youth martyrs, the youngest novice was eight years and 
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        17. Pius VI, “Solemn Beatification of Father Massimiliano Maria Kolbe” (homily, Vat-
ican, October 17, 1971). 
        18. John Paul II, “Solemn Rite of Canonization of St. Maximilian Maria Kolbe,” 
(homily, Vatican, October 10, 1982). 
        19. Francis introduced this category in his apostolic letter (motu proprio), Maeiorem Hac 
Dilectionem: On the Offer of Life (Vatican, July 11 2017). 
        20. See Francis, “Angelus,” (St. Peter’s Square, Vatican, June 23, 2013), 1, and his 
address, “Visit to ‘Villa Nazareth’” (Vatican, June 18, 2016), 3. Francis reiterates this concept 
of daily martyrdom in his audiences, speeches, and homilies; see Pope Francis, “Holy Mass 
for the Beatification of Paul Yun Ji-Chung and 123 Martyr Companions” (homily, Gwangh-
wamun Gate, Seoul, August 16, 2014); Pope Francis, General Audience (Paul VI Audience 
Hall, Vatican City, January 7, 2015); and Pope Francis, General Audience (St. Peter’s Square, 
Vatican, September 25, 2019), 2. 
        21. See McCleary and Barro, “Martyrs and Confessors” for data on adult martyrs. 



another martyr entered seminary at the age of ten. By the age of twelve, 
boys can become catechists and acolytes. Of the total blessed child and 
youth males (142), thirty-four, or 24%, were affiliated with a religious 
order, from serving as a catechist to being a professed religious. By con-
trast, 56% (1799 out of 3187) of adult martyred males were affiliated with 
a religious order. �is pattern underscores several factors. First, the 
Catholic Reformation asserted the monopolistic authority of male clergy in 
the Church, giving preferential status to male religious vocations. Since the 
late sixteenth century, the majority of males canonized are ordained 
(deacon, cleric, priest, bishop, archbishop, pope). Second, many religious 
orders established a house or monastery in Rome, strategically positioning 
themselves to petition for the causes of their candidates. �ird, religious 
orders, through their international networks of houses, institutional 
resources, and finances, are capable of championing one of their members’ 
causes, including those lay candidates who worked with the order.22  
 
       By contrast, females represent only 22.4% (41 out of 183) of all child 
and youth martyrs. None of them formally belonged to a religious order. 
Historically, women, as wives and mothers who govern the home, transmit 
religious beliefs and shape the spiritual lives of their children, grandchil-
dren, and other family members. Six women (martyrs of China and Korea) 
were informally lay catechists. In 2021, Francis formally established the lay 
apostolic ministry of catechist for women and men.23 He also altered canon 
law, permitting women formally to serve as lectors and acolytes.24 Histor-
ically, these two ministries—lector and acolyte—represented the first 
stages toward ordination and a clerical career. With the decline in priests 
worldwide, officially installing women as catechists, acolytes, and lectors 
acknowledges their participation in an “authentic lay vocation” while draw-
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        22. Religious orders promoted their martyred members with a reputation of sanctity 
through hagiographies and passiones circulating both orally and written among the houses; 
see Michael Goodich, “�e Politics of Canonization in the �irteenth Century: Lay and 
Mendicant Saints,” Church History, 44 (1975), 294–307; Simon Ditchfield, Liturgy, Sanctity, 
and History in Tridentine Italy (Cambridge, 1995); Christopher MacEvitt, “Martyrdom and 
the Muslim World through Franciscan Eyes,” �e Catholic Historical Review, 97, no. 1 
(2011), 1–23. Kenneth L. Woodward in Making Saints (New York, 1996) points out that a 
religious order, as an institution, is optimally positioned to assume the financial cost of a can-
didate for canonization (114). Frequently the causes of lay candidates are assumed by reli-
gious orders (112). 
        23. Francis, (motu proprio), Antiquum Ministerium (apostolic letter, Vatican, May 10, 
2021). 
        24. Francis, (motu proprio), Spiritus Domini (apostolic letter, Vatican, January 10, 
2021). 



ing a sharp line between their function (“in a fully ‘secular’ manner”) and 
that of ordained clergy.25  
 
       Of the thirty-six child and youth martyrs with no recorded age, all 
died during two periods of religious persecution. Between 1613 and 1636, 
twenty-four were martyred by the Tokugawa shogūnate of Japan. �e pre-
dominant pattern was the martyrdom of entire families. Sometimes this 
occurred with sons and fathers separated from wives, daughters, and 
infants, who were executed in groups. Nine of the children and youth 
without ages belonged to the prominent Ogasawara family. �ese children 
were beheaded along with their parents and four servants in a private exe-
cution in a Buddhist temple. In 2008, Benedict XVI beatified 188 Japanese 
martyrs, among them twenty “sons” and three “daughters,” with proper 
names but no ages. �e three daughters belonged to a noble family who 
died together. �ose designated “sons” accompanied a parent, brother, or 
other relatives to martyrdom. 
 
       �e second group of children and youth without known ages are 
twelve Brazilians, eleven of which lack proper names and ages. In 2017, 
Francis canonized this group of Brazilian martyrs, known as the Martyrs 
of Natal. Simply referred to as “daughters of . . .” they died in a group of 
thirty Portuguese Catholic colonists murdered by native Brazilians and 
Dutch Huguenot settlers. Seven of these are male Brazilian martyrs 
described as “young companions of Joao Martins.” 
 

Group Martyrs 
 
       �e majority of child and youth martyrs died in groups (89%) (Table 
3: Part I). Of these, males are the majority (80%). Among the 147 child 
and youth martyrs with known ages, 114 or 77% are males. Of these 114, 
sixty-one, or 54%, are youth (fifteen to eighteen years), thirty-five, or 31%, 
are adolescents (seven to fourteen years), and eighteen, or 16%, are chil-
dren (one to six years). Several factors explain the martyrdom pattern 
among male youth and adolescents. Socialization into gender roles occurs 
between the ages of five and eight, when children acquire reasoning capa-
bilities, understand moral distinctions, and assume gender-defined respon-
sibilities through participation in adult activities.26 Parents and other adults 
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        25. Francis, (motu proprio), Antiquum Ministerium (apostolic letter, Vatican, May 10, 
2021). 
        26. Barbara Rogoff et al., “Age of Assignment of Roles and Responsibilities to Chil-
dren: A Cross-cultural Survey,” Human Development, 18 (1975), 353–69; Chunyan Yu et al., 



(for example, a priest or teacher) direct males into work and religious 
responsibilities outside the home. By contrast, females are socialized in 
domesticity, assuming responsibilities within the private sphere of the 
home, the “epicenter of feminine virtue,” learning to care for family mem-
bers and identifying as future mothers and wives.  
 
       Male children become participants in the church’s formal religious rit-
uals as early as the age of seven. Since only males receive ordination, per-
form sacramental roles, and become senior officials in the Church hierar-
chy, they congregate together at an early age in exclusively male 
church-sanctioned activities. �rough this socialization, young males learn 
the language, symbolism, and significance of religious doctrine and sacra-
mental practices that regulate Catholic life. As a consequence, males pub-
licly represent the Catholic faith, becoming targets of religious violence. Of 
the male martyrs in the data set with known ages, the youngest to formally 
affiliate with the Church were two Franciscan novices, aged eight and ten, 
martyred by Protestants in Prague in 1611. Of the seventy-eight male mar-
tyrs between the ages of eight and eighteen, 59% formally participated in 
some institutional capacity.27 �e majority of these males were affiliated 
with or were members of a mendicant order.28 Only four had no affiliation 
with a religious order. 46% of male child and youth martyrs formally 
involved in the Church died during the Spanish Civil War. 
 
       Among child and youth martyrs who died in groups, 20% are female. 
None of these females was a member of an order. Even as the Church for-
mally and “incisively” broadens female participation in liturgical celebra-
tions and lay ministries, the Vatican continues to uphold traditional 
Catholic teaching on complementary gender roles. Girls are to remain 
chaste until marriage, becoming a virtuous wife and mother modeled on 
the Virgin Mary, mother of Christ. In patriarchal, male-dominated 
Catholicism, a common theme in hagiographies of young female medieval 
saints and martyrs was their unwillingness to submit to marriage, thereby 
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“Marching to a Different Drummer: A Cross-Cultural Comparison of Young Adolescents 
Who Challenge Gender Roles,” Journal of Adolescent Health, 61 (2017), 548–54; Glenn H. 
Elder, Jr. and Martha J. Cox, “When Societal Events Occur in Lives: Developmental Link-
ages and Turning Points,” in: Children in Changing Worlds: Sociocultural and Temporal Perspec-
tives, eds. Ross D. Parke and Glen H. Elder, Jr. (Cambridge, 2019), 25–56. 
        27. �ey are acolyte, catechist, cooperator, confrater or tertiary, aspirant, sacristan, 
seminarian, novice, religious, and cleric. 
        28. �ese orders were Augustinian Recollects, Order of Friars Minor (Franciscan), 
Order of Preachers (Dominican), Carmelite of the Ancient Observance, and Hospitallers of 
Saint John of God.  



rejecting the binary gender characteristics of dominant (male)/submissive 
(female) or superior (male)/inferior (female) and instead choosing a reli-
gious vocation.29 Joining a religious community to avoid marriage, how-
ever, does not entail avoiding binary gender constructions. Female reli-
gious orders are under male ecclesiastical authority (for spiritual direction 
and sacramental needs) from the local bishop up to the Holy See.30 
 
       �e Spanish Civil War patterns of martyrdom show religious persecu-
tion conforming to gender stereotypes promoted by the Nationalist and 
Republican forces. Republicanism depicted the Catholic clergy as control-
ling and “accessing” women through sacramental rituals (especially the 
confessional) in order to express “their irrepressible sexual desires.”31 Anti-
clerical militia viewed nuns and lay religious women as “duped” victims, 
submissive “instruments” of the clergy’s lustfulness and authority.32 
Nationalists similarly viewed women as subjugated to male authority (hus-
band and priest) but as defenders of traditional Catholic patriarchal nor-
mative order. Statistics on deaths during the Spanish Civil War show that 
few nuns were killed (283) when compared to an estimated 6,832 members 
of the Catholic clergy, including thirteen bishops, 4,172 diocesan priests 
and seminarians, and 2,365 monks, clerics, and friars.33 Whereas male pos-
tulants, novitiates, clerics, and seminarians were violently attacked, with 
many of them stripped naked, their genitalia removed, and executed, 
female religious were rarely physically abused, raped, or executed.34  
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        29. For a discussion of refusal to marry in the lives of young saints, see Weinstein and 
Bell, Saints and Society, 87–99. Caroline Walker Bynum positions the topic of rejection of 
marriage as an issue of control over one’s physicality, Holy Feast and Holy Fast (California, 
1987), 222–26. 
        30. �e exception to males in the Church administration are few and only recent. In 
2020 and 2021, Francis began to appoint women to positions in the Vatican Curia: Italian 
lawyer Francesca di Giovanni as Undersecretary of Multilateral Affairs, Secretariat of State; 
Sister Alessandra Smerilli, Undersecretary for Faith and Development, Dicastery for Promot-
ing Integral Human Development; Italian magistrate Catia Summaria, Promoter of Justice, 
Vatican Court of Appeals; Sister Nathalie Becquart, co-Undersecretary for the Vatican’s 
Synod of Bishops. 
        31. María Pilar Salomón Chéliz, “Beatas Sojuzgadas por el Clero: La Imagen de las 
Mujeres en el Discurso anti-Clerical en la España del Primer Tercero del Siglo XX,” Femi-
nismo/s (Dec., 2003), 41–58. 
        32. Mary Vincent, “’�e Keys to the Kingdom’: Religious Violence in the Spanish Civil 
War, July–August 1936,” in: �e Splintering of Spain: Cultural History and the Spanish Civil 
War, 1936–1939, eds. Chris Ealham and Michael Richards (Cambridge, 2005), 68–89. 
        33. Antonio Montero Moreno, Historia de la Persecución Religiosa en España, 1936–
1939 (Madrid, 1961), 762. 
        34. Vincent, “‘�e Keys to �e Kingdom,’” 86. 



       �e 2,053 martyrs of the Spanish Civil War are the largest group of 
beatifieds for a single event (Table 3: Part I).35 Of the 236 females beati-
fied, 192 are religious and forty-four are lay, and none are younger than the 
age of nineteen. Among the total of 236, John Paul II beatified ninety-
nine, Benedict XVI beatified forty-eight, and Francis beatified eighty-
nine. �ese Spanish Civil War martyrs include twenty-six child and youth 
martyrs, all of whom are male and only two of which did not die in a group 
(Table 3: Part I). All the beatified child and youth martyrs of the Spanish 
Civil War were between the ages of fifteen and eighteen. Republican forces 
imprisoned and executed groups of lay males (including male relatives) and 
entire religious communities together.36 �e youngest beatified martyr of 
this war, Francisco García León, fifteen years of age, was arrested with his 
uncle for refusing to discard a scapular. He died with his father and uncle 
in a group of prisoners massacred by Republican militia. Another teenager, 
the fifteen-year-old Antonio Gaitán Perabad who was arrested with his 
father and two cousins, refused to return home when given the opportu-
nity. Republicans shot them several times in the head and buried them in 
a common grave. 
 
        The themes of multigenerational martyrdom and filial loyalty preva-
lent in Spanish Civil War narratives are also culturally prominent among 
the blesseds of pre-modern Japan, Chosǒn Korea, and Qing China. The 
largest geographic concentration of child and adolescent martyrs (ages 
zero to fourteen) is in Asia (Table 3: Part I). The Tokugawa shogūnate 
in Japan (1600–1873), and later the Korean Chosǒn dynasty (1784–
1886), instituted systematic purges of Christians lasting decades.37 The 
Chinese martyrs of the Qing dynasty (1898–1901) died under different 
circumstances; nevertheless, the societies of Tokugawa Japan, Chosǒn 
Korea, and Qing China reflect religious diffusion primarily through kin-
ship networks. 
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        35. Fifty-five martyrs from that civil war are to be beatified in 2022, only one of whom 
is a nun. 
        36. Francisco Javier Ramón Solans, “‘�ey Walked Towards their Death as if to a 
Party.’ Martydom, Agency and Performativity in the Spanish Civil War,” Politics, Religion, 
and Ideology, 17, nos. 2–3 (2016), 210–26, here 220. 
        37. For a discussion of the reasons for the persecutions by the Japanese Shogūnate, see 
Charles R. Boxer, �e Christian Century in Japan (Berkeley, 1951) and Joseph Jennes, A His-
tory of the Catholic Church in Japan: From Its Beginnings to the Early Meiji Period (1549–1873) 
(Tokyo, 1959); for Chosǒn Korea, see Franklin Rausch, “Like Birds and Beasts: Justifying 
Violence against Catholics in Late Chosǒn Korea,” Acta Korana, 15, no. 1 (2012), 43–71; for 
China, see Paul Hattaway, China’s Christian Martyrs (Oxford, 2007) and Anthony E. Clark, 
China’s Saints: Catholic Martyrdom during the Qing (1644–1911) (Pennsylvania, 2011). 



       In neo-Confucian Japan, Korea and China, the soul of a departed 
ancestor could only receive reincarnation and deification through a series 
of religious rites performed by his or her descendants.38 Children (espe-
cially the first-born male) ensured the veneration of one’s parents and 
ancestors through filial piety, the highest norm in pre-modern Confucian 
societies. �e social norms learned within the family translated into the 
socio-economic-political roles a child assumed as an adult in society. For 
example, in pre-modern Japan, the loyal son became the loyal subject of a 
daimyō, and the daimyō, in turn, became the loyal subject of the shogun. 
�e integrity of Asian societies and their successful functioning relied on 
the interlocking nature of neo-Confucian ethics. 
 
       Conversion to Christianity was a disruptive force within multigenera-
tional family households and implicated all family members, even those 
who did not convert.39 Converting to Christianity was apostasy from the 
perspective of traditional spiritual and cultural ancestral veneration. Two of 
the earliest Korean beatified martyrs, executed in 1791, were cousins who 
had burned their ancestor tablets. Breaking with ancestor worship became 
an act of defiance as well as a test to ferret out Christians. Converts who 
refused to perform ancestral worship were “breaking off proper human 
relations” and rebelling against the cosmic-moral foundation of civiliza-
tion.40 Families disowned converted children or were powerless to protect 
them against societal persecution. �us another theme—subhuman-
ness—runs through the accounts of religious persecution. In the Spanish 
Civil War context, religious males were preying sexual beasts. In the Con-
fucian context, Christian converts violated the social order and were no 
longer human beings, but jackals and crows.41 On the other hand, even 
though conversion broke neo-Confucian social order, entire households 
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        38. Endō Shūsaku, cited in James Harry Morris, “Anti-Kirishitan Surveillance in Early 
Modern Japan,” Surveillance and Society 16, no. 4 (2018), 410–31; here 421; Andrew Finch, 
“�e Pursuit of Martyrdom in the Catholic Church in Korea before 1866,” Journal of Ecclesi-
astical History, 60, no. 1 (2009), 95–118; Jan Jakob Maria de Groot, �e Religion of the Chinese 
(New York, 1910), Chapter �ree; James Watson and Evelyn Rawski, eds., Death Ritual in 
Late Imperial and Modern China (Berkeley, 1988). 
        39. �is is a theme in early Roman Christianity, Ernest Cadman Colwell, “Popular 
Reactions against Christianity in the Roman Empire,” in: Environmental Factors in Church 
History, eds. James T. McNeill, Matthew Spinka, and Harold R. Willougby (Chicago, 1939), 
53–71, here 62. 
        40. James Huntley Grayson, Korea: A Religious History, revised edition (London, 2002), 
141–6; Don Baker, Korean Spirituality (Honolulu, 2008), 64–70; Rausch, “Like Birds and 
Beasts,” 57. 
        41. Rausch, “Like Birds and Beasts,” 57, 60. 



converted to Christianity, thereby ensuring intergenerational familial 
integrity. Christian households met secretly, creating wider social cohesion 
and organizing themselves into sodalities and neighborhood units.42  
 
       An amalgam of neo-Confucianism and Jesuit Catholic Reformation 
martyrology created a distinctive brand of Japanese religious fervor.43 
Appeals to the hardships endured by early Roman Christian martyrs “espe-
cially the young ones and meek women” who gave up their homes, family, 
and friends to die for their faith were intended to inculcate loyalty to the 
Christian faith. Following the persecutions under Hideyoshi in the 1580s, 
young Japanese boys learned the lives of the saints from the Sanctos no 
Gosagyo (adapted from Flos Sanctorum) printed in 1591 in romaji.44 

 
       �e psychological pressure exerted by missionaries and soon-to-be 
martyrs on their families not to apostatize required novel doctrinal inter-
pretations. �e Exhortations to Martyrdom, compiled around 1614–15, 
consists of teachings on how to remain faithful under persecution.45 �e 
Instructions on Martyrdom (circa 1622) state unequivocally who is a martyr, 
including an infant (baptized or unbaptized) and a fetus killed along with 
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        42. �e circumstances and existence of underground Christian (Kirishitan) communi-
ties up until the late 1800s are discussed by Peter Nosco, “�e Experiences of the Christians 
during the Underground Years and �ereafter,” Japanese Journal of Religious Studies, 34, no. 1 
(2007), 3–29. 
        43. Martyrdom was integral to Jesuit evangelizing missionary activities worldwide. “Just 
as they were candidates for martyrdom in the Reformed regions of Europe, the Jesuits desired 
to die for the Church everywhere, treating their own martyrs as instruments for the conver-
sion of souls and the establishing of the Church in new lands. �is was part and parcel of a 
systematic global strategy that was carefully documented and illustrated. On the basis of this 
policy, the Jesuits circulated widely the reports of the martyrdom of their brethren, thus cre-
ating a veritable spiritual cartography that accompanied the technical cartography of the 
world that was in the process of being made at that time.” Renato Cymbalista, “�e Presence 
of the Martyrs: Jesuit Martyrdom and the Christianisation of Portuguese America,” Interna-
tional Journal for the Study of the Christian Church, 10, no. 4 (2010), 287–305, here 290–1. For 
the effect of Jesuit theater on impressionable young minds and their use for recruitment pur-
poses, see Christoph Nebgen, “Missionaries: Who Were �ey?” in: A Companion to Early 
Modern Catholic Global Missions, ed. Ronnie Po-chia Hsia (Boston, 2018), 401–24, here 416–
19, 421–23. Child martyrdom was part of Jesuit evangelization propaganda and theatrical 
performances for young western European children; see Goran Proot and Johan Verberck-
moes, “Japonica in the Jesuit Drama of the Southern Netherlands,” Bulletin of Portuguese 
Japanese Studies, 5 (2002), 27–47, here 41–44; James A. Parente, “Andreas Gryphius and 
Jesuit �eatre,” Daphnis, 13, no. 3 (1984), 525–51, here 535n26. 
        44. Boxer, Christian Century, 191, 234. 
        45. Masaharu Anesaki, “Writings on Martyrdom Kirishitan Literature,” Transactions of 
the Asiastic Society of Japan, [ser. II], 8 (Jan., 1931), 39–59.  



the mother.46 �e Exhortations makes clear that one should not apostatize 
out of affection for wives, children, and friends. A disturbing account of 
martyrdom zeal is an exchange between soon-to-be-martyr Jesuit Carlo 
Spinol, who calls out to Isabel Fernandez as she appears on Nishizaka Hill 
outside Nagasaki: “Isabel where is your son Ignacio?” Isabel, holding up 
her five-year old son, exclaims in response, “Father, here is my son. I will 
offer him to God. He will become a martyr with me.”47 Becoming a martyr 
was the highest act of charity, whereas the second highest was the sacrifice 
of one’s “dedicated wives and children, relatives, property, and so forth.”48 
 
       �e beatifications of large groups of Japanese martyrs by Pius IX 
(1867) and Benedict XVI (2008), combined with the twenty-six beatified 
by Urban VIII (1627) include eighty-three child and youth martyrs, the 
largest affiliated with a single event (Table 3: Part I). One estimate of the 
total number of Christians executed in Japan after the 1614 expulsion edict 
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        46. Anesaki, “Writings,” 59–65. For the Church, the veneration of children who suf-
fered violent deaths has its locus not in their innocence but in God’s relationship with human-
ity. Humans are born with the impulse to sin and therefore are “non-innocent.” Augustine 
viewed original sin as inherited from Adam, tainting human beings from their first breath. A 
newborn child in this hereditary state of original sin is “pure” but not “innocent.” On Augus-
tine’s view, unbaptized children were destined for hell. Since the first centuries of Christian 
persecution, the Church theologically posits that martyrdom can be a substitute for water 
baptism (baptismus aquæ). “�ose who suffer death for the sake of the faith without having 
received Baptism are baptized by their death for and with Christ. �is Baptism of blood, like 
the desire for Baptism, brings about the fruits of Baptism without being a sacrament,” Cate-
chism of the Catholic Church (Vatican City, 1993), VI, para. 1258. 
        Fetuses martyred in the womb are similar to the Holy Innocents. �eir executioners out 
of “selfishness and fear” intentionally ended their lives and in this way “they are in solidarity 
with the Holy Innocents,” International �eological Commission, �e Hope of Salvation for 
Infants who Die without being Baptised (Rome, 2007), para. 86b. �omas Aquinas held that 
“children while in the mother’s womb . . . can, however, be subject to the action of God, in 
Whose sight they live, so as, by a kind of privilege, to receive the grace of sanctification” 
Summa �eologica (London, 1963), III.68.11.1. �e Church agrees with this theological inter-
pretation of the mystery of God’s grace that is beyond human knowing; see International �e-
ological Commission, �e Hope, 87c. Instructions on Martyrdom, written in Japan prior to 
1622, has a curiously undogmatic section on the martyrdom of a child executed in the arms 
of her mother or in the womb. A child “without judgment or determination,” that is, in inno-
cence “below the age of reason” and lacking intentional volition, goes to her martyrdom. A 
child who dies in her mother’s arms or womb is a martyr because the mother is a Christian 
who willingly gave her life for God. �e Instructions suggests a covenant of faith. �rough the 
mother’s faith, the innocent infant and fetus attain salvation, a theologically unsound propo-
sition in the Catholic Church. See Anesaki, “Writings,” 59–65, here 62–3. 
        47. Don C. Seitz, “�e Nagasaki Martyrs,” Catholic Historical Review, 13, no. 3 (1927), 
503–09, here 506. 
        48. Anesaki, “Writings,” 51.  



is 2,128, including seventy-one Europeans.49 Between 1597 and 1633, 
fifty-nine beatified children and youths with known ages were executed. 
Adolescent and youth males tended to die with their fathers and brothers 
in groups of males. Infants and younger adolescents died with their moth-
ers or their entire families. Many family members died from wretched 
prison conditions awaiting execution.  
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        49. Boxer, Christian Century, Appendix XIV. 

�e 26 martyrs of Nagasaki. Japanese Jesuit priest Paulus Miki with six other pro-
fessed priests and religious of the Society of Jesus as well as of the Order of Friars 
Minor and seventeen lay people, including male youth and adolescents, were 
arrested and sentenced to death by crucifixion in 1597. On order of daimyo Toy-
otomi Hideyoshi their bodies remained on the crosses for several months.  �e 26 
martyrs of Nagasaki were beatified in 1627 by Urban VIII and canonized in 1862 
by Pius IX. Attribution: ilustración—grabado calcográfico—de Juan Francisco de 
San Antonio: «Crónicas de la apostólica provincia de S. Gregorio de religiosos des-
calzos de NSPS Francisco en las Islas Filipinas, China, Japón, & c.” (Parte Tercera, 
de la Celeberrima Seraphica Mission de Japon), Sampaloc, 1744. https://francis-
canos_ martires_de_japon-312x350.jpg&f=1&nofb=1



       �e Korean martyrs, similar to those of Japan, died in waves of gov-
ernment-sponsored Christian persecution over several decades. Whereas 
the introduction of Catholicism to Japan began with Jesuit missionaries 
converting a daimyō and those under his domain through mass conversion, 
the Korean Catholic Church from its inception was a native lay 
movement.50 �e persecution of Korean Christians, which began in 1795 
and lasted until 1871, resulted in an estimated 10,000 deaths with 8,000 of 
those occurring between 1868 and 1870.51 �e government imprisoned 
thousands of Korean children with their relatives and fellow Christians.  
 
       Whereas the Japanese Tokugawa shogūnate sought to exterminate 
Christianity by executing infants, children and youth with their families, a 
slightly more humane interpretation appears in the narratives of Korean 
child and youth martyrs. Prison officials allowed mothers to release their 
infants into the care of relatives. Pregnant women temporarily left prison 
to give birth and returned for execution. Judges were reluctant to sentence 
children and adolescents (particularly females) to death, often urging them 
to apostatize. Of the 228 beatified Korean martyrs (who died between 
1791 and 1888), only eight are children and youth, a miniscule fraction of 
those persecuted. Francis beatified four of these children and youth in 
2014, and Pius XI beatified three in 1925. John Paul II canonized four in 
a group of 103 martyrs in 1984. 
 
       Unlike the origins of religious persecution in Japan and Korea, anti-
Catholic violence in China at the turn of the twentieth century began as a 
chaotic popular uprising in reaction to special legal and economic conces-
sions granted by the Qing government to Protestant and Catholic foreign 
missions. �e Boxer Rebellion (1899–1901) targeted Christian missions 
located in northern China. After the Empress Dowager Cixi in June of 
1900 declared war against the Eight Nation Alliance, her government 
issued a public decree requiring Chinese Christians to apostatize. Qing 
imperial troops coordinating with bands of Boxers attacked mission sta-
tions, frequently killing and destroying entire villages in which the mis-
sions were located. Estimates of the number of victims of the Boxer Rebel-
lion is 250 foreigners and tens of thousands of Chinese.52 Of the 120 
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        50. Finch, “A Persecuted Church: Roman Catholicism in Early Nineteenth-Century 
Korea,” Journal of Ecclesiastical History, 51, no. 3 (2000), 556–80. 
        51. Committee for the Bicentennial Commemorative Projects of the Catholic Church 
of Korea, Lives of the 103 Martyrs (Seoul, 1984), 10–1. 
        52. Paul Cohen, History in �ree Keys: �e Boxers as Event, Experience, and Myth (New 
York, 1997), 310. 



canonized by John Paul II in 2000, eighty-seven are Chinese and thirty-
three are foreign missionaries. Of the 120, sixteen are children and youth 
who died in 1900. Patterns of persecution are similar to those in other 
Asian societies in that the youngest Chinese martyrs, ages seven and nine, 
died with their mothers. Unmarried females accompanied their mothers 
and siblings to their deaths, several refusing sexual slavery or arranged mar-
riages. �e socialization of Chinese male adolescents and youths in the 
Church as catechists, acolytes, and seminarians translates into a pattern of 
males dying together, at times in the company of foreign clergy.  
 
       �e region with the second highest number of child and youth martyrs 
is Africa.53 Two Catholic missionary institutes, �e Society of Missionar-
ies of Africa (White Fathers) and the Componi Missionaries, worked in 
eastern and northern Uganda, respectively, during the late 1800s. �e 
founder of the Componi missionaries, Daniele Comboni, drawing on the 
missionary philosophy of Charles Lavigerie, founder of the White Fathers, 
trained Africans to evangelize to Africans.54 In the 1870s, increasing Euro-
pean (Anglican and Catholic) missionary presence in East Africa as well as 
British and German trade, scientific, and military expeditions challenged 
the territorial authority of the Bagandan (modern Uganda) rulers.55  
 
       �e martyrdom of twenty-two Banda in 1886, including seven adoles-
cent and youth pages from the Baganda court, occurred within this unsta-
ble geo-political context.56 One explanation for the executions is that 
Mwanga II, Kabaka of Buganda, suspected his Christian pages of being 
informants for the foreign (Anglican and Catholic) missionaries. �e pri-
mary explanation for the martyrdoms given in historical accounts is the 
Christian pages refusing to participate in Mwanga II’s homosexual prac-
tices.57 Christian missionaries (Anglican and Catholic) preached an abso-
lutist moral stance against homosexuality as well as other Bugandan prac-
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        53. �e geographic region with the least number of child and youth martyrs is Eastern 
Europe. 
        54. Laura António Nhaueleque and Luca Bussotti, “�e Conceptualisation of Africa in 
the Catholic Church Comparing Historically the �ought of Daniele Comboni and Adal-
berto da Postioma,” Social Sciences and Missions, 32, no. 1–2 (2019), 148–76, here 157. 
        55. Rev. J.P. �oonen, Black Martyrs (London, 1942), 169. 
        56. To the north of Buganda, Kabarega (the king of Bunyoro Kitara, a traditional 
enemy of Buganda) was fighting off the pending invasion from the Khedive of Egypt. From 
the east, the Germans were annexing territories in the regions of present Tanzania. 
        57. �oonen, Black Martyrs, 99, 104–06, 165, 170–01; J.A. Rowe, “�e Purge of Chris-
tians at Mwanga’s Court: A Reassessment of the Episode in Buganda History,” Journal of 
African History, 5, no. 1 (1964), 55–72, here 70. 



tices such as polygamy, worshipping tribal gods, wearing magical amulets, 
and shamans.  
 
       �e canonization of twenty-two Uganda martyrs in 1964 (not includ-
ing twenty-three Anglican martyrs) was an opportune moment to reinter-
pret historical events from Ugandan and western perspectives, bringing 
into question the official interpretation of the Congregation for the Causes 
of Saints that hinged on the role of sodomy in the Baganda court.58 �e 
canonization entered into contemporary African debates on same-sex rela-
tions, including whether sodomy was a foreign import (“European”) or 
ethnic “Bugandan” practice.59 Yet, the recurring theme of subhuman-ness 
appears in Paul VI’s homily celebrating the canonization of the Banda 
Catholic martyrs. Bugandan culture was “that primitive human society” 
with Africans behaving in an “almost instinctive state” until Christianity 
elevated them to a civilized state.60  
 
       Focusing for a moment on Kizito, the youngest martyred page at 
approximately thirteen years of age, the priest Père Simeon Lourdel 
described Kizito gaily going to his execution, “as if he were at play with his 
friends.”61 �is same motif occurs in an eyewitness account of the second 
great martyrdom of Edo (Tokyo) on December 24, 1622, describing a 
group of eighteen children following men and women, “all too young to 
have learnt to fear death. �ey went laughing and gleefully joking in child-
like fashion, carrying the toys and knickknacks that are children’s delight.”62 
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Intimacy, Memory and Belonging in Postcolonial Uganda,” Journal of Eastern African Studies, 
9, no. 1 (2015), 1–19.  
        60. Paul VI, “Canonization of the Martyrs of Uganda,” October 18 (homily, Vatican, 
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finally were hung up by one foot and torn limb to limb.” Hubert Cieslik, “�e Great Martyr-
dom in Edo 1623: Its Causes, Course, and Consequences,” Monumenta Nipponica, 10, nos. 
1–2 (combined issue, 1954), 1–44, here 33. 



Returning to Kizito, even though Père Lourdel thought Kizito a child, “too 
young to know his own mind and also insufficiently instructed,” Kizito 
exhibits a maturity beyond his chronological age (puer senex motif) by 
understanding that if he was killed without being baptized, he would not be 
saved.63 Kizito’s insistence on being baptized signaled his acceptance of 
impending martyrdom, conveying the message that a life of Christian purity 
could only be lived in the afterlife. Kizito’s narrative mirrors that of Anpro-
nianus in the Flos Sanctorum, who requested baptism (redemption from sin) 
as a yearning for martyrdom.64  
 
       �e narrative of a second group of Ugandan martyrs, Daudi Okelo and 
Jildo Irwa, follows the same story arc of Antonio and Juan, the two Nahua 
martyrs. Two converted young boys, Antonio, the grandson of a Tlaxcala 
nobleman, and his slave-servant Juan, at the request of the Spanish Fran-
ciscan Fray Martín de Valencia, traveled to a hostile tribe to evangelize. 
�e Franciscan friar warned them of the volatile circumstances. Antonio 
and Juan were foreign Christian converts to this tribe. When they defiled 
sacred objects in their evangelistic zeal, the local tribe beat them to death 
in 1529. �e narrative of Ugandan martyrs Daudi Okelo and his assistant 
Jildo Irwa follows the formulaic storyline, highlighting similar themes. In 
1917, the Italian priest Cesare Gambaretto, who has recently opened a 
Comboni mission station at Kitgum in northern Uganda, requested Okelo, 
sixteen years of age and a catechist, to travel to the town of Paimol with 
Jildo Irwa, twelve years, as his assistant to evangelize to Acholi tribal chil-
dren.65 Analogous to the role of the Franciscan friar in Juan and Antonio’s 
narrative, Gambaretto warned the boys of the area’s lawlessness, fre-
quented by slave traders and gold seekers and marred by inter-tribal vio-
lence. In both narratives, the clerical warning sets the stage for the boys to 
acknowledge their acceptance of martyrdom. Similar to the two Nahua 
boys sent to evangelize to a nearby tribe, Okelo and Irwa were Acholi tribe 
members but belonged to a different clan from the Paimolians. Like Anto-
nio and Juan, they are a foreign presence as well as young Christian con-
verts actively engaged in evangelizing. In eastern Acholi, where Paimol was 
located, ongoing intra-tribal conflict and violent resistance to British colo-
nization policies had destabilized the region, a theme mirrored in Antonio 
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        63. �oonen, Black Martyrs, 165.  
        64. Andrew M. Beresford, “Dreams of Death in Medieval Castilian Hagiography: 
Martyrdom and Ideology in the Gran Flos Sanctorum,” La Corónica, 42, no. 1 (2013), 159–84, 
here 177–78.  
        65. John Orr Dwyer, “�e Acholi of Uganda: Adjustment to Imperialism” (PhD diss., 
Columbia University, 1972), 213.  



and Juan’s narrative as the tribe they sought to evangelize was resisting 
Spanish conquest. In 1918, in defiance of the British commissioner’s deci-
sion to depose the Acholi tribal hereditary chief and appoint a man from 
another village, an uprising began in October, lasting until early Novem-
ber. Okelo and Irwa, outsiders and innocent bystanders to the conflict, 
died along with local Catholic converts and foreigners.66  
 
       �e third largest geographic concentration of child and youth martyrs 
is in Latin America, signaling a new trend initiated by the last three popes. 
If we include those without age and proper name, the largest group died in 
1645 in Natal, Brazil.67 Within the context of the Dutch-Portuguese wars, 
rebel moradores (Portuguese colonists) hanged thirty-three Tupi 
Amerindian Dutch auxiliaries and enslaved their families in retaliation for 
a Dutch-led massacre on the Portuguese village of Cunhaú, murdering 
Jesuit priest André de Soveral and numerous colonists. In retaliation, Tupi 
and Tarairiu allied together and, accompanied by Dutch colonists of the 
West India Company, attacked a moradores settlement at Uruaçu, Rio 
Grande.68 �is counterattack freed the enslaved Tupi women and children 
while exacting casualties among the Portuguese settlers, among them 
twelve children and youth. 
 
       In 2000, for the celebration of the 500th anniversary of the evangeliza-
tion of Brazil, John Paul II beatified thirty Portuguese martyrs from 
Cunháu and Uruaçu (referred to as the Natal martyrs). Among them were 
twelve youth with no age, and eleven with no proper name. In his homily, 
John Paul II referred to the martyrs as “defenceless Catholics,” glossing 
over the colonial context of brutal warring and violent subjugation of 
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Amerindians. 69 For their canonization in 2017 by Francis, the narrative of 
their martyrdoms places Dutch Calvinists as the instigators of the persecu-
tion, moving the Amerindians to the periphery.70 Rearticulating their story 
within the narrow focus of Protestant-Catholic competition contempo-
rized their martyrdoms for Brazilians. �e Church in Brazil is losing 
adherents to Evangelicalism (of various types) to the degree that by the end 
of 2022, Brazil, the largest Catholic country in the world, will become 
majority Protestant.71 �e revised hagiography positions the Martyrs of 
Natal as powerful exemplars for contesting anti-Catholic rhetoric and 
Protestant competition. 
 
       During the same ceremony in 2017, Pope Francis canonized three 
Nahua male youth martyrs of Tlaxcala, Mexico—Cristóbal (age twelve) 
martyred in 1527, and Antonio and Juan (ages twelve and thirteen) mar-
tyred in 1529. Educated by millennialist Franciscans, these young zealous 
converts turned against their Nahual institutions and norms.72 Openly crit-
icizing Tlaxcalan elders’ religious practices and desecrating sacred objects, 
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early hagiographers deploy the puer senex motif to describe these boys as 
“‘wise infants’ instructing foolish elders,” thereby justifying the inversion of 
Nahual social order.73 Cristóbal was murdered by his father Acxotecatl, a 
Nahual lord and elder. Interpreting the murders of these pubescent boys 
depends on the cultural perspective. Are they adolescents lacking full 
agency, or are they adults challenging the authority of their peers? From 
the European perspective, children ages twelve and thirteen are not yet 
adults, retaining a saintly innocence and purity. According to Tlaxcala 
stages of childhood, at the ages of twelve and thirteen, the martyrs were 
now adults.74 Cristóbal, as direct heir to his father’s title and holdings, 
challenged his father’s social status not as a child but as a male adult. On 
this interpretation, Acxotecatl murdering his son was justified by Nahual 
cultural norms, as his adult son was challenging his legitimate authority.75  
 
       Interpreting persecutors’ intentions are difficult to discern in ideolog-
ically radicalized contexts. �e first child and youth martyrs of Central 
America died during civil wars in El Salvador (1979–1992) and Guatemala 
(1960–1996).76 After Vatican II, the Latin American Catholic Conference 
of Bishops formulated a social justice doctrine justifying a normative stance 
for clergy and laity to organize farming cooperatives, credit unions, and 
labor unions.77 �e assassination of sixteen-year-old Nelson Rutilio 
Lemus, who died accompanying Jesuit priest Rutilio Grande and lay cate-
chist Manuel Solórzano while driving from the town of Aguilares to El 
Paisnal, El Salvador appears to have a political motivation. Grande, as “an 
activist cleric,” through his pastoral activities of organizing comunidades 
eclesiales de base became a “Communist” threat to the military.78  
 
       �e narrative arc of Nelson Rutilio Lemus’s life and martyrdom reap-
pears in the hagiographies of Adilio Daronch (age fifteen) and �omas 
Khampheuane Inthirath (sixteen). Adolescents serving in their capacities as 
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altar boys (not trained as catechists) accompanied their parish priests on pas-
toral visits into geographic areas violently contested between rebel groups 
and the military. After warnings from local residents of insurgent activities 
in the area, the youth and his parish priest continued their pastoral visits. 
Rebels captured and executed Daronch with Spanish priest Manuel Gómez 
González in southwestern Brazil in 1924. Guerrillas murdered Inthirath, of 
the ethnolinguistic group Lavȇn, with French priest Lucien Galan during 
pastoral visits in Laos in 1968. �ese narratives express the familiar motif of 
a warning foreshadowing their martyrdoms found in the narratives of the 
two Nahua youth and the two Acholi youths. �e corpus of their narratives 
consists of their obedience to ecclesiastical authority, fulfilling their assigned 
role with extraordinary courage and devotion to the Catholic faith. 
 
       �e narratives of group martyrs incorporate motifs and patterns of 
persecution repeated in different historical contexts. To a large degree, the 
uniqueness of an individual martyr’s life is conformed to the formulaic 
themes of sanctity the Church intends to convey. In contexts of European 
empire expansion in Latin America (early sixteenth century), Asia (six-
teenth to twentieth century), North America (sixteenth to seventeen cen-
tury), and Africa (late nineteenth to early twentieth century), Catholic mis-
sionaries intentionally encouraged adolescent and youth males to 
evangelize. A strong emphasis on catechesis for males beginning around 
the age of discretion (seven years) gave the Church some control over chil-
dren, undermining parental as well as political authority and creating the 
struggle between “chief and chapel.”79 Missions, often reinforced by colo-
nial military presence, shifted power dynamics, challenging the normative 
foundation of the subjugated society. �emes of Christian moral superior-
ity over traditional religious practices and faith over filial piety ruptured 
normal family relations. Christian converts became antisocial, destroying 
existing societal structures and kinship relations. �ese new converts were 
more loyal to each other and their clerics than to their families, tribal 
elders, and local religious figures. In every case of group martyrs, involve-
ment with the Church politically implicated the young convert. Woven 
into their narratives are expressions of courage, self-discipline, justice, and 
moral rectitude. In confronting persecution and martyrdom, child and 
youth martyrs, when given the opportunity to apostatize, displayed excep-
tional faith in accepting their impending death.  
 

496                     CATHOLIC CHILD AND YOUTH MARTYRS, 1588–2022

        79. Jean Camaroff and John Camaroff, Of Revelation and Revolution: Christianity, Colo-

nialism, and Consciousness in South Africa, 2 vols. (Chicago, 1991–1997, here 1991), I, 262. 



Martyrs who Died Alone 
 

       Only a small number of beatified martyred children and youth (twenty) 
died alone. �e geographic concentrations are in descending order: Asia 
(seven), Western Europe (six), Latin America (four, if including Mexico), 
Eastern Europe (two), and Africa (one) (Table 2). Francis has beatified 
more children and youth who died alone (eight) than any other pope. Beat-
ifying children and youth who died alone raises the same challenges as beat-
ifying young confessors. Child and youth martyrs who die alone require 
autonomous agency involving cognitive, psychological, and physical matu-
rity that belies their chronological development. �ese salient dimensions of 
martyrdom are glossed over when infants, children, and youth die in groups. 
 
       All of the dozen child and youth males who died alone are between 
the ages of twelve and eighteen. Male martyrs actively participated in reli-
gious activities in their community such as being a catechist, acolyte, sem-
inarian, member of a religious association, or a novitiate in a religious 
order. Such is their religious fervor that they dedicate their young lives to 
their faith and express a willingness to die for it. �e youngest male martyrs 
exemplify extraordinary devotional rigor through daily prayer, attending 
mass, and confession.  
 
       �e theme of biological brothers features prominently in the narratives 
of several young men who died alone. Older brothers are role models for 
younger ones, especially those who formally join the Church. �eir affiliation 
with a religious order or diocese singles them out for persecution. Lluis 
Estruch Vives joined the same religious order, the Capuchins, as his older 
brother. At the beginning of the Spanish Civil War, in October of 1936, the 
local revolutionary anarchist committee became aware of Vives’s religious 
vocation even though he dressed in civilian clothing, lived with his parents, 
and worked in a munitions factory with his father. One evening, members of 
a leftist militia visited his family’s home and under false pretenses took Vives 
away. His body was located the next day at the entrance to a local cemetery. 
Another youth, Luis Quintas Duran, also martyred during the first months 
of the Spanish Civil War, belonged alongside his brother José to the Noc-
turnal Adoration Society. �e circumstances of the capture of José (age 
twenty-three), Luis (eighteen), and their younger brother Mario (fourteen) 
are not detailed. Mario was cruelly beaten and released. �e militia separated 
the two older brothers. Luis became a prisoner in the Convent of the Wor-
shippers (Adoratrices), a converted prison, and was shot in the neck while 
holding a bottle of water to his mouth. His younger brother Mario identified 
his body. José, the eldest, was martyred two years later in Turón. 
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       �e fraternal theme continues in the narratives of two adolescents tran-
sitioning into youths. José Sánchez del Río, age fourteen and intent on fol-
lowing his older brothers into the Cristero War (1926–1929), was captured, 
tortured and killed by the Mexican military. A similar narrative progression 
of tortured martyrdom “going on for some hours” before death appears in the 
hagiographies of José Sánchez and Juan Barrera Méndez, age twelve, who 
died during the Guatemalan Civil War. Juan and his two (some say three) 
older brothers were captured by the Guatemalan military in January 1980. 
After instigating a massacre in their family’s village, the military captured 
Juan and his older brothers of the ethnolinguistic Maya K’iche group. �e 
older brothers managed to escape, leaving Juan behind. Juan’s family were 
members of Catholic Action, a lay Catholic organization that over the course 
of several years evolved into promoting the rights of the poor.80 �e Marxist 
Ejército Guerrillero de los Pobres, operating in the region where Juan lived, 
recruited from Catholic Action members.81 �e military sliced the bottom of 
Juan’s feet with a knife (as they did to José), forced him to walk on river rocks 
(José walked on cobblestones), cut off his ear, broke his legs, (José was 
stabbed several times with bayonets), hung him from a tree, and finally rid-
dled Juan’s body with bullets (José was shot in the head). Establishing odium 
fidei on the part of the persecutor is complicated. Unlike the strident anti-
clericalism of the Mexican government in José’s case, the reasons for Juan’s 
torture and death appear to be multiple. One narrative suggests that the mil-
itary tortured and executed Juan in retaliation for his brothers’ escape.82 
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        80. Many priests were sympathetic to as well as actively involved with guerrilla move-
ments. For example, Faustino Villanueva Villanueva, a Spanish Catholic priest of the Mis-
sionaries of the Sacred Heart and parish priest of Joyabaj, El Quiché, traveled to Nicaragua 
clandestinely to learn from the Sandinistas how to export violent revolution to Guatemala; see 
Bill Vasey, Called: He Gave them the Word, the memoir of Bill Vasey with Tammy Endres 
(Vasey, 2020), 107. John D. Early, a former Catholic priest and scholar of Guatemalan 
Catholicism, failed to mention the forms of violence and coercion the guerrilla movements 
engaged in, especially the Ejército Guerrillero de los Pobres, against indigenous communities; 
see John D. Early, Maya and Catholic Cultures in Crisis (Gainesville, 2012), 235–61. For such 
an account, see Tomás Guzaro and Terri Jacob McComb, Escaping the Fire: How an Ixil 
Mayan Pastor led His People out of a Holocaust during the Guatemalan Civil War (Austin, 2010). 
�e violence perpetuated by the guerrillas against indigenous communities, as well as 
Catholic and Protestant clergy, remains understudied. �e focus of scholars in the United 
States, Europe, and Latin America is on military/state violence perpetuated against civilians, 
especially indigenous communities, after the 1982 coup d’état. 
        81. David Stoll, Between Two Armies in the Ixil Towns of Guatemala (Columbia, 1993), 
66; Mario Payeras, Los Pueblos Indigenas y la Revolución Guatemalteca: Ensayos Étnicos, 1982-
1992 (Guatemala City, 1997), 49. 
        82. Oficina de Derechos Humanos del Arzobispado de Guatemala, Testigos de la fe por 
la paz: Vidas ejemplares de la Iglesia Católica de Guatemala, (Guatemala, 2003), 89–93, here 93. 



Racism against Maya K’iche could be another possible motive. Some sug-
gested that the military believed him to be a guerrilla sympathizer.83  
 
       �e narratives of José and Juan’s lives depict devout adolescents who 
actively participated in parish life. José, in the words of the postulator, 
exhibited “psychological maturity much higher than that of his own age.”84 
Juan was “an inquisitive child with adult-like initiatives who exhibited atti-
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        83. Oficina de Derechos Humanos, Testigos, 92. 
        84. Deborah Castellano Lubov, “Postulator Recalls St. José Sanchez del Rio Saying 
‘My Faith Is Not for Sale,’” National Catholic Register, October 16, 2016, https://www.ncreg-
ister.com/news/postulator-recalls-st-jose-sanchez-del-rio-saying-my-faith-is-not-for-sale, 
accessed January 27, 2022. 

Maya K’iche children touching the mural of 12 year-old martyr Juan Barrera 
Méndez in Zacualpa, El Quiché, Guatemala. (photograph Rachel McCleary, July 
2022). Juan Barrera Méndez, a K’iche Maya catechist was tortured and executed by 
the Guatemala military in 1980 during the civil war.  He was beatified along with 
six other lay members of the El Quiché diocese and three Spanish priests of the 
order Missionaries of the Sacred Heart. http://www.radioscatolicasdequiche.org/ 
radioquiche/index.php/martires-de-quiche/juan-barrera-mendez



tudes and ways of being typical of the responsibility and maturity of an 
adult person.”85 �e puer senex topos of exceptional maturity for their 
chronological ages explains their steadfast faith. To be truly virtuous and 
holy, José and Juan had to overcome their biological childhood. 
 
       Similar themes run through the hagiographies of male martyrs who 
died during the Boxer Rebellion and the waves of state persecution in 
Chosǒn Korea beginning in the early 1800s. �ese themes likewise recur 
in violent twentieth-century conflicts between Marxist ideologies and 
Christianity, replacing the conflict between paganism and Christianity. 
�e Mexican revolution and civil war, the subsequent Cristero war, and 
World War II and its aftermath in Europe pitted variations of Marxist 
anticlerical ideology against the traditional Catholic hierarchy. �e only 
Italian (child and youth) male martyr associated with World War II who 
died alone was Rolando Rivi, of fourteen years. As a seminarian returning 
home wearing his cassock, he was kidnapped by members of the Commu-
nist Garibaldi Brigade. Imprisoned in a pigpen and tortured, Rivi was shot 
to death in 1945. �e motif of a youth refusing to discard a religious object 
(scapular, prayer card, image of the Virgin) to avoid persecution runs 
through several narratives. Rivi’s family warned him not to wear the cas-
sock, a warning he chose not to heed.  
 
       Politics and ideologies contextualize the martyrdom of males who die 
alone. �is contrasts sharply with the circumstances of female martyrs, 
whose gender and familial circumstances are central to their deaths. �e 
narratives of female martyrs who died alone are dominated by themes of 
precocious religiosity, virtuous behavior (humility, modesty, patience, obe-
dience, selfless charity), an understanding of sin, as well as a renunciation of 
personal desires and ambitions to assume domestic responsibilities (cook-
ing, sewing, washing, cleaning, caring for siblings, collecting wood or water, 
tending farm animals). Many forgo their own ambitions to remain at home 
performing domestic chores as well as tending livestock. Economic condi-
tions motivate parental dependence on a young daughter’s labor. Of the 
eight child and youth females martyred alone, six lost one or both parents 
at a young age. �e death of one parent brings into sharp focus the necessity 
of filial obedience. When a parent dies or suffers from chronic illness, young 
females renounce their biological adolescence, dutifully assuming adult 
household tasks that their mothers fulfilled for the family. Unlike medieval 
female saints who react to a parent’s death by rejecting worldly responsibil-
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        85. Oficina de Derechos Humanos, Testigos, 91–2 (translated from Spanish by the 
author). 



ities foisted upon them, these young female martyrs accept the premature 
burden of adulthood.86 Spiritually, a young female responds to the added 
responsibility by strengthening her religious devotion (praying daily, 
attending mass), conserving the family by maintaining harmony with her 
siblings, and caring for them as a surrogate parent. 
 
       �e ancient Christian theme of the “double crown”—virginity and 
martyrdom—continues in contemporary contexts.87 �e theme of pubes-
cent females as protectors or “keepers” of their own chastity originated in 
the third century along with other forms of sexual renunciation.88 �ird- 
and fourth-century Roman Christian saints Agatha, Lucy, and Agnes, 
having taken permanent vows of chastity before God, repudiated male 
advances and offers of marriage, were denounced, and martyred. �eir 
rebuffed persecutors sought revenge by denouncing the young women as 
Christians, an outlawed religion. �ese young women, rather than aposta-
tizing, demonstrated unusual autonomy, steadfastness in virtue, and forti-
tude beyond their ages.  
 
       Beginning in the twentieth century, the sanctification of girls and 
youth martyred for protecting their chastity took on a slightly new interpre-
tation. Rather than being martyred for rejecting marriage or spurning a 
suitor, these young women died in violent attacks resisting a rapist. Practic-
ing chasteness, they remained “virginal” by choosing martyrdom over the 
moral, social, psychological, and physical consequences of submitting to 
rape. Pius XII established the contemporary Catholic paragon of female 
chastity and domesticity with the beatification of eleven-year old Maria 
Goretti in 1947 and canonization in 1950. She died in 1902 in Italy in 
defense of her virginity (in defensum castitatis).89 In his beatification homily, 
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        86. Both medieval saintly men and women rejected familial obligations at the death of 
a parent see, Weinstein and Bell, Saints and Society, 53–56. 
        87. Patricia Healy Wasyliw points out that the retelling of a saint’s life and death 
depends on the perspective of the writer who may emphasize one aspect, for example, her vir-
ginity and refusal to marry a prefect’s son, over other aspects, namely, refusal to obey pagan 
laws and worship idols. Such are the narratives of Saint Agnes in the literary hands of 
Ambrose, Tertullian, and Augustine, see Martyrdom, Murder, and Magic, 18–19. 
        88. Peter Brown, �e Body and Society: Men, Women, and Sexual Renunciation in Early 
Christianity (New York, 1988), 191.  
        89. Pius XII, “Address of His Holiness Pius XII to the Faithful Convention in Rome 
for the Canonization of Santa Maria Goretti” (Vatican, June 25, 1950); John Paul II, “To the 
Bishop of Albano for the Centenary of the Death of St. Maria Goretti” (message, Vatican, 
July 6, 2002); John Paul II, Angelus (Vatican, July 7, 2002). �is is not the place to discuss the 
arguments put forward by theologians, scholars, and journalists on the Church’s use of 



Pius XII glorified her spiritual fortitude and preternatural physical strength 
(puer senex motif) in fighting off Alessandro Serenelli, who was twice her 
age. �ree years later, in his canonization homily, Pius XII again referred to 
the virtues of obedience and domesticity as integral to her purity of faith, a 
theme reiterated by John Paul II. Goretti’s extraordinariness (puer senex 
motif), according to John Paul II, was her “strong and mature personality.”90  
 
       With the last three popes, a trend emerged of beatifying girls and 
adult women who died resisting rape. Benedict XVI beatified Albertina 
Berkenbrock (twelve years) and Lindalva Justo de Oliveira (forty). John 
Paul II beatified Antonia Mesina (fifteen), Karoliny Kózkówny (sixteen), 
Teresa Bracco (twenty), Alfonsine Anuarite Nengapita (twenty-three), 
and Pierina Morosini of Bergamo (twenty-six). Francis beatified Anna 
Kolesárová (sixteen), Veronica Antal (twenty-two), Benigna Cardoso da 
Silva (thirteen) and Isabel Cristina Mrad Campos (twenty).91 �e causes at 
various stages of pre-beatification of fourteen girls and women martyred 
during an attempted rape illustrate the popularity of the in defensum castis-
tatis corpus of saintliness with the Holy See.  
 
       Five females between the ages of eleven and sixteen died alone in 
attempted rapes (Maria Goretti, Antonia Mesina, Albertina Berkenbrock, 
Karolina Kozkowny, and Anna Kolesarova). One adolescent, Laura 
Vicuña (confessor, twelve years), was a victim of domestic abuse. Vicuña’s 
narrative alludes to sexual advances by the abusive hacendero to whom her 
mother was mistress.92 A wide range of scholars, theologians, journalists, 
notable writers, and lay Catholics have critiqued this model of sanctity 
involving obedience, submission, and domesticity (learning to handle the 
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females murdered during a rape attempt as examples of Christian virtue. See, for example, 
Monica Turi, “Il ‘Brutto Peccato.’ Adolescenza e Controllo Sessuale nel Modello Agiografico 
di Maria Goretti,” in: Bambini Santi: Rappresentazioni dell’Infanzia e Modelli Angiografici, eds. 
Anna Benvenuti Papa and Elena Giannarelli (Turin, 1991); Eileen J. Stenzel, “Maria Goretti: 
Rape and the Politics of Sainthood,” in: Violence Against Women, eds. Elisabeth Schūssler  
Fiorenza and M. Shawn Copeland (London, 1994), 91–98, and Kathleen Norris, “Maria 
Goretti—Cipher or Saint” in: Martyrs: Contemporary Writers on Modern Lives of Faith, ed. 
Susan Bergman (San Francisco, 1996), 299–309. 
        90. John Paul II, Angelus (Vatican, July 7, 2002). By contrast, Francis focused on Maria 
Goretti’s act of charity in forgiving Serenelli before she died, Francis, Angelus (Vatican, July 
3, 2016). 
        91. �e beatifications of Benigna Cardoso da Silva and Isabel Cristina Mrad Campos 
will take place, respectively, on October 24, 2022 and December 10, 2022. 
        92. Maria Domenica Grassiano, For Love of My Mother: Laura Carmen Vicuña (New 
York, 1985).  
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        93. �e Church’s use of females murdered during a rape attempt (a criminal act) as 
examples of Christian virtue underscores Andrew Greeley’s criticism of the Catholic hierar-
chy as unwilling to adapt and reform to changing gender roles with access to education and  
technology particularly in western societies. He argues that the Church is becoming irrele-
vant, weakening the authority of the pope; see �e Catholic Revolution: New Wine, Old Wine-
skins, and the Second Vatican Council, (Berkeley, 2004). Stenzel, “Maria Goretti: Rape and the 
Politics of Sainthood,” 91–98 and Norris, “Maria Goretti—Cipher or Saint,” 299–309 discuss 
the cognitive dissonance between the Church’s model of female sanctity and contemporary 
gender roles and choices for women (birth control, fertility, abortion, career and economic 
independence, partnering options), particularly those who are college-educated.  

Maria Goretti, beatified and canonized by Pius XII, died in 1902 at the age of 11 
fending off her sexual assailant, Alessandro Serenelli.  Pius XII established the con-
temporary Catholic paragon of female chastity (purity) and domesticity with her 
sanctification. Attribution:  https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Maria_Goretti#/media/ 
File:Photograph_of_Saint_Maria_Goretti,_1902.jpg:~:text=By%20Unknown%20 
author%20%2D%20http%3A//www.famigliacristiana.it/%2C%20Public%20 
Domain%2C%20https%3A//commons.wikimedia.org/w/index.php%3Fcurid% 
3D30256607

needle as opposed to horses) as virtue resisting evil (male bestiality) ending 
in sacrificing one’s life to a sexual attacker.93  



       Female martyrs offer a model of sanctity distinct from males murdered 
in hatred of the faith. �ese girls and women exhibit deep devotion, humil-
ity, and selfless caring for others. At least three knew their assailants. Each 
assault took place at or near the young woman’s home while she was per-
forming chores (sewing, fetching water, or searching for a stray bullock). 
Karolina Kózkówny (Poland) and Anna Kolesarova (Slovakia) died during 
the First and Second World Wars, respectively. Similar to other attempted 
rape victims, these young women, both age sixteen, came from poor rural 
families. With both parents living, Karolina’s childhood conveys a sense of 
normalcy. She has leisure time to interact with neighboring children, 
attend mass daily, and help her uncle with his work at the local library. By 
contrast, Anna lost her mother when she was just over ten years of age. 
Anna assumed the domestic responsibilities of caring for her brother and 
father. When the liberating Red Army occupied her village, the women 
including Anna, dressed in black to become sexually anonymous. Karolina 
and Anna, precociously devout and dutiful young women, each were bru-
tally assaulted and murdered by occupying Russian soldiers. In Karolina’s 
case, the soldier dragged her into the woods under false pretenses. She 
fought off the soldier who then mortally wounded her with his saber. 
Anna’s assailant, after eating a meal she had prepared for him in the 
family’s kitchen, pointed his gun at her in the presence of her father. When 
Anna refused to submit, the soldier shot her. 
 
       Of the three Chosǒn Korean Christian females who died alone, the 
two youngest, Anastasia Yi Bonggeum, age twelve, and Yi Bareubara, 
fourteen, died in their prison cells. �e young ages of these orphaned girls 
presented public relations problems for authorities. Reluctant to punish 
either girl because of their adolescence, the authorities urged each to apo-
statize, but they refused. After forcing Anastasia to witness her mother’s 
martyrdom, she was tortured and hanged in her cell at midnight away from 
public scrutiny. Yi Bareubara, having lost both parents, accompanied her 
aunts to prison. She died of Typhoid Fever in her cell, most likely to the 
relief of the authorities. �e third, eighteen-year-old Barbara Sim A-gi, 
was taught catechism by her brother. After his arrest, the police returned 
to the family home for her. �e police beat her in the hopes that she would 
apostatize. She submitted to the abuse and died at the police station.  
 
       Looking at the narratives of the lives of the male and female martyrs 
who died alone, their behavior belies their chronological age. Many of 
these adolescents and youth are spiritually precocious. At an early age, they 
demonstrate consistent and abiding devotion characteristic of adults. �eir 
daily lives exhibit constancy of religious purpose through intense praying, 
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confessing, attending mass, taking communion, becoming catechists, join-
ing lay organizations, and volunteering in the parish. Obedience to the 
Church frames their secular daily activities. Some males commit their lives 
to the Church by becoming acolytes, novitiates, and seminarians. Females 
fulfill the Marian ideal of a loving caregiver in the family and a future 
mother. �ese children and youth overcome the appetites and desires char-
acteristic of their biological age to engage in consistent acts of devotion, 
filial piety, and charitable acts toward others. Whereas males act on their 
faith in public spaces and are frequently active agents in their martyrdom, 
females have little control over their bodies, social context, and the circum-
stances of their martyrdom. Whereas male adolescents and youth defy 
parental control, females succumb to parental authority out of filial love 
and duty.  
 
        Child martyrs who died alone are particularly problematic for the 
Catholic Church as their martyrdom entails a developed degree of 
autonomous agency requiring a maturity that belies their chronological age. 
In their narratives, the Church underscores their precociousness (puer senex 
motif), steadfastness in faith, and fortitude in dying. Whether children and 
youth die in groups or alone, exhibiting sanctity during their short existence 
is central to the Church’s reasons for beatifying and canonizing them. �e 
narratives of their lives serve an edifying purpose and are not, as André 
Vauchez expresses it, “the profane period of their existence.”94 As exemplars 
for young boys and girls, the sanctity of these young martyrs are models 
embedded in traditional gender roles promoted by the Church. 
 

Expanding Research on the Sanctity of Child and Youth 
 
       For centuries, official child and youth martyrs were rare. In the mid-
nineteenth century, Pope Pius IX made an exception in beatifying and can-
onizing large groups of martyrs (in 1867) from Japan and Brazil that 
included a significant number of infants, children, and youth. �e three 
consecutive papacies of John Paul II, Benedict XVI, and Francis show no 
clear trend in child and youth beatifications.95 A significant change by 
Francis is the beatification of child and youth martyrs who died alone 
(eight) more than any previous pope (at least after 1588).  
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        94. André Vauchez, Sainthood in the Later Middle Ages, 508. 
        95. John Paul II beatified 1.1 per year; Benedict XVI beatified 8.9 per year; and Francis 
2.4 per year. Benedict’s percentage is high as he beatified a group of 188 Japanese martyrs in 
2008, which included fifty-three minors, and he had the shortest term as pope (7.9 years) 
compared to John Paul II (26.5 years) and Francis (8.9 years) whose term continues. 



      Scholarly and theological treatment of child and youth martyrs is 
sparse, and with good reason. �e younger the martyr, the more likely 
they occupy the periphery of oral and written testimonies of the violent 
events in which their martyrdom takes place. Children naturally orbit 
around their parents and family members. �ey find themselves in these 
circumstances because they accompany parents, siblings (as we have seen 
with brothers), and adult relatives. One can say that their biographies are 
“not so much the celebration of one individual, but of the entire value 
system or style of life which he personifies.”96 Official Catholic teaching 
underscores this relational dimension of children to parents. �e family is 
like a “domestic church,” with the placement of the child within a hierar-
chical network of relationships. Children remain under the authority of 
their parents who are responsible for rearing and educating them “by word 
and example.”97  
 
       With John Paul II’s papacy, the Church began to elaborate and 
deepen theological reflection on the nature of sanctity, significantly trans-
forming in some respects the Church’s interpretation of child and youth 
spirituality while maintaining traditional core gender characteristics.98 Yet, 
changing societal perceptions of gender roles are undermining the 
Church’s typologies of virtuous behavior expected of girls and boys, requir-
ing a rethinking on the part of the Church of its models of sanctity. A the-
ological shift began with the pastoral constitution Gaudium et specs, in 
which a child’s religious participation in the spiritual life of the family is 
described as active, reciprocal, and more egalitarian. “As living members of 
the family, children contribute in their own way to making their parents 
holy.”99 Children, as spiritual beings, in their prayers “have a special power 
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        96. Goodich, “Childhood and Adolescence,” 286. 
        97. Vatican Council II, Lumen Gentium: �e Dogmatic Constitution on the Church (Vat-
ican, November 21, 1964), 11. 
        98. See Mario Gioia (ed.), I Giovani nella Bibbia (Roma, 1988). In 1998, John Paul II 
established the Commission for the New Martyrs of the Great Jubilee to work with local 
commissions to compile a registry of martyrs from various Christian faiths in a “vision of the 
ecumenicism of the blood.” �e archives of the Commission are not publicly available and, as 
a result, it is not known how many Catholic child and youth martyrs are included. Two books 
by Catholic scholars, Italian historian Andrea Riccardi, �e Century of Martyrdom: Christians 
in the Twentieth Century (Milan, 2000), and Robert Royal, �e Catholic Martyrs of the Twen-
tieth Century: A Comprehensive World History (New York, 2000), focus on Catholic “new mar-
tyrs” and pay particular attention to the contexts of their martyrdom. Some child and youth 
martyrs are mentioned in Riccardi’s narrative, but there is no systematic or comprehensive 
treatment of them. 
        99. Paul VI, Gaudium et spes: Pastoral Constitution on the Church in the Modern World 
(Vatican, December 7, 1965), 48. 



to penetrate heaven and soften God’s justice.”100 Because of their unique 
spirituality, children can share their “deeply lived” faith with their parents 
and not just be passive recipients of parental teachings.101 For the first 
time, the Church recognized children’s “separateness from adults” respect-
ing the “fullness and complexity of their real lives in the circumstances of 
the present and in their autonomy.”102 Francis went further, stating that 
children have full autonomy separate from parents. “. . . children are not 
the property of a family, but have their own lives to lead.” No longer 
“family property,” children can make decisions like Jesus that “may demand 
a parting for the sake of the Kingdom of God.”103 Given this evolving 
papal line of reasoning on child and adolescent agency, the Church’s inter-
pretations of sanctity for young people is anachronistic. 
 
       Another dimension of the Church’s evolving understanding of child-
hood and adolescence since Vatican II is the increasing usage of secular 
international human rights language in pastoral writings and teachings, 
often at odds with canon law, doctrine, and theology. “In the family, which 
is a community of persons, special attention must be devoted to the chil-
dren by developing a profound esteem for their personal dignity, and a 
great respect and generous concern for their rights.”104 [emphasis added]. If 
a child is an autonomous being with his or her own rights, then does a 
child’s rights supersede a parent’s authority over him or her? If yes, then 
the contextual gender role interpretations of virtues expressed in child and 
youth models of sanctity require revising.  
 
      �e Catholic Reformation repurposed the hagiographies of saints to 
appeal to the faithful, and to guide the lapsed Catholic back into the fold 
and away from Protestant competition. �e early modern and contempo-
rary models of sanctity presented here require reassessment within the 
historical circumstances of the audience. One of the main reasons for 
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        100. Paul VI, Mense Maio: Encyclical of Pope Paul VI on Prayers during May for Preser-
vation of Peace (Vatican, April 29, 1965), 14. 
        101. Paul VI, Evangelii Nuntiandi: Apostolic Exhortation of His Holiness Pope Paul VI to 
the Episcopate, to the Clergy and to All the Faithful of the Entire World (Vatican, December 8, 
1975), 71. 
        102. John Paul II, Familiaris Consortio: Apostolic Exhortation of Pope John Paul II to the 
Episcopate the Clergy and to the Faithful of the Whole Catholic Church on the Role of the Christian 
Family in the Modern World (Vatican, November 22, 1981), 21. 
        103. Francis, Amoris Laetitia: Post-Synodal Apostolic Exhortation of the Holy Father 
Francis to Bishops, Priests and Deacons, Consecrated Persons, Christian Married Couples, and All 
the Lay Faithful on Love in the Family (Vatican, March 12, 2016), para. 18. 
        104. John Paul II, Familiaris Consortio, 26. 



promoting the beatification and canonization of children, adolescents, 
and youth is for them to serve as exemplars for their contemporary peers. 
Making saints is a competitive strategy on the part of the Church to 
counter Protestantism as well as secularism.105 To what degree are these 
martyrs’ narratives, as presented by the Church, relevant to young people’s 
lives today and therefore sufficiently compelling to attract them and keep 
them in the faith? 
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        105. McCleary and Barro, “Opening the Fifth Seal: Catholic Martyrs and Forces of 
Religious Competition,” 92–122, and McCleary and Barro, “Saints Come Marching In: 
1590–2021,” 385–415.



The Strategy of Papal Nuncios in the Sacred Space 
of Prague against the Backdrop of the 

Confessional Transformation of the City at the 
Turn of Seventeenth Century 

 
TOMÁŠ ČERNUŠÁK* 

 
�e nunciature at the imperial court in Prague at the turn of the sev-
enteenth century represented an important power center for Catholi-
cism. Nuncios carried out their mission at the level of diplomatic nego-
tiations and effectively incorporated the sacred space of the mostly 
non-Catholic Prague into their strategy. 
 
Keywords: sacred space, nuncios, Prague, imperial court 

 
Introduction 
 

At the Minorites on Tuesday, 25 July, we were witness to a ceremony on 
the occasion of the feast of James the Greater. �e Spanish ambassador 
was there […]; he was sitting with the nuncio in the upper row on a mag-
nificent yet moderately sized pew. In the row beneath them were the 
Venetian and Florentine ambassadors. […] �e mass was led by the 
Abbot of Strahov with his mitre and crozier, who, for example, invited 
the nuncio to bless the Book of the Gospels.1  

 
       Such is the picturesque description of a liturgical celebration at the 
church of the Prague Minorites in 1600 as given by Pierre Bergeron, a 
member of the French delegation to Emperor Rudolf II (1576–1612).2 �e 
selected excerpt is interesting mainly for a single inconspicuous detail, i.e. the 
different approaches of the diplomats in attendance to the religious acts per-
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formed in a sacred space. Contrasting with the activity of the papal nuncio is 
the passivity of the representatives from the other countries. It raises interest-
ing questions. On what was this approach in a sacred space contingent? Was 
it merely an isolated incident, or was it a normal part of the work of nuncios? 
Could it have been part of a strategy that grew in importance with respect to 
the dominantly non-Catholic setting of an imperial residential city?  
 

Defining Sacred Space 
 
       For some time now, the spaces in which diplomats operated have been 
studied as part of a so-called new diplomatic history,3 which, among other 
things, acknowledges “the significance of diplomatic history’s pivotal 
moments, but it builds on the premise that sociocultural practices consti-
tuted political relationships, that they were not the consequence of foreign 
policy, international law, and political thought but their basis.”4 �e spaces 
often cited as typical for early modern diplomats, who not only used them 
in pursuing their activities but also shaped them, include royal courts, peace 
congresses, and imperial diets.5 �e standing of nuncios within a specific 
sacred space, however, has received little attention, and what attention it has 
been given usually falls within the context of royal court ceremonials.6   
 
       How, though, is sacred space to be defined? One of the older defini-
tions describes it “as that portion of the earth’s surface which is recognized 
by individuals or groups as worthy of devotion, loyalty or esteem.”7 �is is 
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Compass, 14, no. 9 (2016), 441–56; John Watkins, “Toward a New Diplomatic History of 
Medieval and Early Modern Europe,” Journal of Medieval and Modern Studies, 38, no. 1 
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        5. In recent times see, for example, Guido Braun, ed., Diplomatische Wissenskulturen der 
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        7. Richard H. Jackson and Roger Henrie, “Perception of Sacred Space,” Journal of Cul-
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a relatively fitting interpretation, as it does not reflect sacred space only in 
static terms as a purpose-built and topographically delimited structure, 
such as a church, nor as a simple antipode to the profane space, but instead 
lends it a degree of dynamism. �e character of the space does not neces-
sarily make up a given definite and unchanged value, but this social entity 
can be transformed and newly determined by the actions of people or their 
perceptions.8 �e boundary between sacred and profane space can, there-
fore, be extremely variable and fluent. Roads leading toward pilgrimage 
churches could, for example, be perceived as holy.9 Places in private homes, 
designated for individual or group prayer by members of a family and sup-
plied with religious paintings and objects, were reserved for private reli-
gious operations.10 Houses were used for the purposes of shared services by 
certain religious communities.11 �is variability could be seen at work in 
the opposite direction as well; for example, the spaces of churches could be 
used for profane purposes, for communicating decrees and rulings of the 
nobility, or for various forms of profane interpersonal negotiations.12        
 
      Sacred space itself was also differentiated in various ways on the 
inside.13 In the case of various liturgical operations, for instance, it was 
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given a certain dynamism, which may have served to renew or reaffirm 
the sacred character of the place. On the other hand, liturgical proces-
sions happening beyond the confines of the church building constituted 
a literal extension of sacred space and a sacralization of profane space.14 
In keeping with this interpretation, sacred space can be understood not 
only in terms of the purpose of its consecration, as was the case with 
Catholic churches, but also its functional use, which bestowed, either 
temporarily or permanently, a new sacred character to a space that had 
originally served other purposes.  
 

The Papal Nuncios in Early Modern Diplomacy 
 
       Interpreting the function of papal nuncios in sacred space, such as the 
depiction in the opening example, requires an accurate contextual under-
standing of the aspects they had in common with other diplomats as well 
as those that set them apart. Nuncios existed as a form of papal diplomat 
from as early as the Middle Ages. In his time, the prominent church law 
theoretician Guillaume Durand (†1296) ranked amongst the minimi, i.e. 
the less important, whereas the main pillar of medieval papal diplomacy 
consisted of the legates. Both forms of diplomacy were of a temporary 
nature.15 First, there was the process of building the papal state itself, 
which was intimately linked with new reflections on the person of the ruler 
in the specific dual role of pope and king.16 Another factor was the change 
in the function of diplomacy in favor of permanent diplomatic representa-
tion, which corresponded more closely to the international needs arising 
from the formation of modern states and whose beginnings can be traced 
to the Italian milieu.17 
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       Although legates continued to function as high-ranking papal diplo-
mats,18 the permanent nuncios began to take on a more important role and 
became an increasingly flexible instrument of foreign policy with which to 
respond to political developments.19 �eir mission in the first half of the 
sixteenth century was specifically to develop and strengthen bilateral rela-
tions between the papacy and the rulers of various states.20 An increase in 
the importance of the papal nunciature occurred following the dissolution 
of the Council of Trent and during the pontificate of Gregory XIII (1572–
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FIGURE 1. Guillaume Durand (c. 1230–November 1, 1296), print, seventeenth 
century. Originally published in Boissard, Jean-Jacques: Bibliotheca chalcographica 
. . . 1652–1669. Artist unknown. Image from http://www.uni-mannheim.de/ 
mateo/desbillons/aport/seite295.html. �e image is in the public domain.



85), a period when the existing network was expanded with several addi-
tional areas in the Holy Roman Empire, where the position of Catholicism 
had long come under pressure from the Protestants. Representatives of this 
group are sometimes distinguished from others with the “reform” label, 
which should serve to indicate the importance of internal church reform in 
their activities.21   
 
       �e general goals of diplomacy, i.e. “negotiation, information-gather-
ing, and representation,”22 were the concerns not only of the nuncios but 
also of other diplomats. In this respect, they were all diplomats type ancien, 
for whom there were certain common traits that are no longer observed in 
later years. �ey did not serve their countries, as some sort of abstract 
entity, but rather their rulers, in relation to whom they generally held the 
status of client. On the one hand, they had to be adept at faithfully repre-
senting the image of those rulers (imago principis et umbra),23 while on the 
other they needed to represent the interests of other persons or fractions 
without necessarily putting themselves in a conflict of interest. Another 
important element of the activities of a diplomat was his relationship with 
his own relatives, as his position presented a truly important opportunity 
to enhance not only his own social standing but also that of his family.24 
 
       Despite nuncios adopting these traits common to all early modern 
diplomats, they possessed additional specific attributes that we do not see 
in other members of this social group. �e primary difference lies in the 
fact that they represented the pope in his dual role, that is, not only as the 
sovereign ruler of the Papal States but also as the head of the Catholic 
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Church. �eir representation in the areas of foreign politics and bilateral 
international relations (in temporalibus) was complemented in a significant 
manner in the ecclesiastical sphere (in spiritualibus).25 �is mainly involved 
supervision of local churches,26 which was influenced by great efforts aimed 
at implementing the decrees of the Council of Trent.27 
 
       Another trait specific to nuncios, particularly considering the high 
degree of representation required of the religious matters they were charged 
with overseeing, was that they were often empowered with special canonical 
privileges. �ese conferred faculties gave them remarkable authority, which, 
for example, allowed them to intensively pursue the centralizing tendencies 
of the papacy in relation to local parishes.28 In order to carry out their role 
to the maximum extent as diplomatic representatives of the pope, the ruler 
of the Papal States and head of the Catholic Church, the social and reli-
gious position of nuncios underwent a marked transformation. While in the 
middle of the sixteenth century the function could still be held by laymen, 
there was an increasingly evident shift toward clericalization, and by the end 
of the century, the vast majority of nuncios held the rank of bishop.29 �is 
trend was linked with an analogical process affecting a large group of per-
sons harboring career ambitions within the framework of the administra-
tive, legal, and governing structures of the Holy See.30  
 

Nuncios and the Religious Milieu of Early Modern Prague 
 
       Nuncios were a permanent fixture in Prague between 1578 and 1612. 
It was in this period that Emperor Rudolf II resided in the capital of the 
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Kingdom of Bohemia, and the city was not only home to the diplomats of 
various states and other persons involved in diplomacy, but also a destina-
tion for numerous foreign delegations and an important center of interna-
tional politics. �e jurisdiction of the nuncios of the imperial court encom-
passed most of the Holy Roman Empire and the Kingdom of Hungary as 
well as the Bohemian lands, which had become a focal point of papal pol-
itics and were viewed as an ideal space in which to pursue recatholization 
initiatives that could also be implemented elsewhere.31 In the dominantly 
non-Catholic state, nuncios had several primary goals, including limiting 
the influence of the Protestants at the imperial court, the appointment of 
Catholics to key offices, support for church reforms and new religious 
orders, reintegration of the Utraquists into the Catholic Church, and con-
trol over the preservation of church immunity. Despite constraints arising 
from religious and political relations, some of these goals were achieved 
with great success, such as the appointment of radical Catholic aristocrats 
as heads of Bohemian provincial offices in 1599 or the implementation of 
a diocesan synod within the Archdiocese of Prague in 1605, where decrees 
of the Council of Trent were accepted.32   
 
       In religious terms, however, the nunciature, which represented the 
head of the Catholic Church, constituted a foreign element in the city. 
�is becomes quite evident when we consider the confessional orientation 
of the city, which was influenced by a historical evolution that also left its 
mark on sacred space. �e Hussite Wars at the beginning of the fifteenth 
century and the period that followed, when the system of religious plural-
ism stabilized in the Bohemian lands, were of key importance and saw the 
emergence of majority Utraquism, which was recognized by land laws and 
had its own ecclesiastical administration. �e Prague city agglomeration 
also acquired a predominantly Utraquist character.33 Minority Catholi-
cism, on the other hand, found itself in a completely different situation. 
Weakened economically and socially, numerous monastic institutions and 
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communities began to decline, and in 1421 the Prague archbishopric 
entered a period of sede vacante.34 �e religious situation became even more 
complicated and detrimental to Catholicism with the German Reforma-
tion of the sixteenth century, the followers of which significantly bolstered 
the confessional plurality of the city and the entire country. Economic dif-
ficulties and the dominant standing of adherents of the Reformation were 
particularly apparent in the monasteries of Prague, which suffered from a 
significant lack of monks and were plagued by serious internal problems, as 
evidenced in numerous reports from the period.35  
 
       �is confessional transformation also had an impact on the number of 
Catholics in the city. Research to date indicates that approximately forty 
thousand inhabitants lived in the four towns of Prague at the turn of the 
seventeenth century,36 with Catholics accounting for no more than ten 
percent of the population,37 a number that corresponds to information in 
reports from diplomats; according to the nuncio Giovanni Dolfin, for 
instance, there were approximately four thousand Catholics in Prague in 
1575.38 A similar number was given by Pompeio Vizani, who accompanied 
the new nuncio Ottavio Santacroce on his trip to the Bohemian lands in 
1581. His estimate puts the number of Catholics at five thousand.39 It is 
not surprising that certain foreign Catholic visitors, such as the aforesaid 
Pierre Bergeron,40 described the city as distinctly Utraquist. Pompeio 
Vizani even mistakenly stated that of the 114 churches and chapels in 
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Prague, only fourteen were in Catholic hands, with the rest belonging to 
the Utraquists.41  
 
       �e clear dominance of the non-Catholic character of the city, appar-
ent even in its spatial dimension, was not a static phenomenon. From 1578 
to 1612, a period throughout which, save for short intervals, nuncios 
resided in Prague on practically a permanent basis, a process can be seen of 
a gradual revival of Catholicism and an attempt to restore or strengthen its 
position in society, and this process was also manifested in space. Several 
factors contributed to this interesting transformation, which occurred in 
parallel fashion throughout the entire Church.42  
 
       �e first of these factors was the enthronement of Rudolf II, the ruler 
of the Holy Roman Empire, who had been raised in an orthodox Catholic 
court in Spain. He moved the imperial court, which comprised approxi-
mately one thousand individuals, most of whom were Catholic, to the cap-
ital of the Kingdom of Bohemia: Prague.43 �e majority of the courtiers 
resided in houses in Malá Strana (Lesser Town) and Hradčany, where they 
made up roughly one third of the population and thus had a substantial 
influence on the religious character of these localities.44 Catholic aristocrats 
also played a role in this process, as they saw their confession as an impor-
tant prerequisite for a career at the court. �ey filled in the agglomeration 
by erecting new buildings or remodeling existing palaces and also by 
engaging in lavish arts patronage benefiting Catholic institutions.45  
 
       Another factor was the influx of immigrants from other countries, 
who were attracted to the general boom in the city resulting from the 
establishment of the court. Italians made up a small yet important and 
clearly defined entity in terms of language and confession. �ey worked in 
certain professions for which there was demand, such as construction, 

518                                           THE STRATEGY OF PAPAL NUNCIOS

        41. Pompeio Vizani, Relatione del viaggio di Germania (n.p., 1581), stored in Rome, 
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Counter Reformation (Washington, DC, 1999). 
        43. Zdeněk Hojda, “Prag um 1600 als multikulturelle Stadt: Hof—Adel—Bürger-
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Mittelalter zur Neuzeit, eds. Evamaria Engel, Karen Lambrecht, and Hanna Nogossek 
(Berlin, 1995), 225–32, here 227; Ledvinka and Pešek, Praha, 320–21. 
        44. Stloukal, Papežská politika, 175–206. 
        45. Hojda, Prag um 1600, 229–30; Ledvinka and Pešek, Praha, 304; Michal Šroněk, De 
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long-distance trading, and banking. Italians were known in the imperial 
residential city as definite followers of Catholicism and were not hesitant 
to present their confessional allegiance in an ostentatious manner.46 In 
terms of church administration, the position of Catholicism was strength-
ened with the renewal of the Prague archbishopric in 1561.47  
 
       �e seemingly most important factor influencing the growing role of 
Catholicism in early modern Prague was the activities of male ecclesiastical 
orders, particularly those founded in the sixteenth century, which embodied a 
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kunde und Kirchengeschichte, 84 (1989), 235–57, here 238–39; František Kavka and Anna 
Skýbová, Husitský epilog na koncilu tridentském a původní koncepce habsburské rekatolizace Čech: 
Počátky obnoveného pražského arcibiskupství [�e Hussite Epilogue at the Council of Trent and 
the Original Conception of the Habsburg Re-Catholicization of Bohemia: �e Beginnings 
of the Renewed Archbishopric of Prague] (Prague, 1969), 35–55. 

FIGURE 2. Hans von Aachen, Portrait of Emperor Rudolf II, oil on canvas, 1590s. 
Stored at Kunsthistorisches Museum, Vienna, Austria. Image is in the public 
domain.



new and assertive concept of faith. �e topography of the city evolved with 
the construction of churches and monasteries, which represented more than 
mere static structures. �e presence and work of clerics, their contact with cit-
izens of different social standings, preaching and teaching activities, regular 
church services, and liturgical festivities that occasionally extended out into 
the profane space of the streets and squares—all of this made these structures 
living centers of Catholic culture and religion, “islands of Catholicism” not 
unlike those that could be found in other multiconfessional cities in Europe.48  
 
       In 1556, the Jesuits arrived in Prague and took up residence in the very 
center of Staré Město (Old Town) near the main roads of the city. �ey 
built a college there and, in addition to their pastoral and mission activities, 
began offering an attractive education system.49 �e Capuchins were 
another dynamic religious community. Despite initial difficulties arising 
from the unsteady position of the superior, the order gained stature among 
the Catholic nobility and courtiers, and its monastery in Hradčany, which 
was founded in the year 1600, soon became an important center of reli-
gious life.50 �ese two orders were joined in 1603 by the renewed 
monastery of the Observant Franciscans, where only a few years later the 
community comprised sixteen friars from several countries.51 �e Domini-
cans also received a new monastery in Malá Strana (Lesser Town) in 
1604.52 Other important centers of Catholic revival were the originally 
medieval but now reformed communities of the Premonstratensians, the 
Minorites, and the Augustinians.53  
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e Seicento, ed. Gabriele Ingegneri (Trento, 2021), 81–94. 
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Prague (1460–68, 1482–83 and 1604–11)”], in: Historia Franciscana II, eds. Petr R. Beneš 
and Petr Hlaváček (Kostelní Vydří, 2005), 66–104, here 92–96. 
        52. Jakub Zouhar, Česká dominikánská provincie v  raném novověku (1435–1790) 
[Bohemian Dominican Province in the Early Modern Age (1435–1790)] (Prague, 2010), 51–52. 
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       Apart from the new monasteries, the phenomenon of Catholic 
renewal also manifested itself in the prolific construction of sacred build-
ings. Between 1580 and 1620, thirteen Catholic churches and chapels were 
either built from the ground up or completely renovated in the predomi-
nantly non-Catholic city of Prague, often with contributions from patrons 
among the ranks of the aristocracy and courtiers. By contrast, only three 
buildings belonging to other Christian confessions were either enlarged or 
renovated in the same period.54  
 
       �e vitality of Prague’s centers of Catholic culture and religion could 
also be seen in the organization of entirely new festivities or those pre-
sented as possessing a new importance, where particular emphasis was 
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FIGURE 3. Photograph of the eastern entrance of the Clementium, formerly the 
Jesuit College in Prague’s Old Town (1556). Wikimedia user VitVit, Photograph 
of the Clementium, May 23, 2017. �e photo has been licensed under the Creative 
Commons Attribution-ShareAlike License 4.0 International license. Photo is 
available at https://no.wikipedia.org/wiki/Fil:Klementinum_z_Mari%C3%A1nsk 
%C3%A9ho_n%C3%A1m_4.jpg.



placed on their visual and aesthetic effect. �e significance of this effect 
was not only religious in nature and self-identifying for the Catholic com-
munity, but it also served as a form of outward presentation to the majority 
non-Catholic population with the aim of elevating the presence of the 
Catholic confession in the public space of the streets and squares.55 �e 
renewal of minority Catholicism is also evidenced by liturgical practice. 
�is is most apparent in the Feast of Corpus Christi processions, one of the 
most distinctive manifestations of outward self-identification toward the 
Protestants in the liturgy of early modern Catholicism. From as far back as 
its medieval beginnings, attempts to dominate the public space formed an 
integral part of the ritual.56 �is reality and its theological aspects consti-
tuted the main reason for the negative response to the feast from non-
Catholics.57 �e Jesuits in Prague began celebrating the Feast of Corpus 
Christi in the 1560s, and although it was initially confined only to the areas 
adjacent to their college, it was a truly magnificent event. By the end of the 
sixteenth century, the Catholics no longer hesitated to cast their influence 
over the public space in this manner within the much wider geographical 
framework of the city streets.58 In the early years of the seventeenth cen-
tury, the organization of these processions moved to the main Catholic 
churches in Prague, apparently with the aim of having them take place at 
different intervals throughout the time of the feast in order to achieve the 
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greatest possible presence in the public space without overlapping one 
another.59 �e processions were embellished with visual performances, 
sounds, and musical accompaniment, and social elites from the ranks of 
courtiers and the aristocracy participated in them. All of these efforts were 
intended to help bring about spatial hegemony.60 Apart from these proces-
sions, sources also make reference to other entirely new ones taking place 
on the various Marian feast days under the patronage of the Jesuit sodali-
ties.61 �e processions of flagellants organized by the Capuchins and led 
through the city streets were a similar “innovation” and became a much 
observed part of the religious atmosphere in the first decade of the seven-
teenth century.62  
 

The Prague Nuncios and Their Strategies in the 
Sacred Space of Prague  
 
       As indicated by recent research examining the spatial aspects not only 
of papal but also of Spanish diplomats in Prague at the turn of the six-
teenth and seventeenth centuries, of greatest importance to them were the 
imperial palace, the residences of diplomats, and the palaces of aristocrats. 
It was here that the majority of diplomatic affairs were conducted, namely 
interpersonal meetings, the gathering of information, and representation. 
In the case of papal nuncios, their presence everywhere in these spaces is 
evidence, albeit in varying degrees of intensity, of their special standing 
arising from their direct ties to the pope in his dual role of head of the 
Catholic Church and ruler of the Papal States.63 �e same is true of nun-
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cios and their impact on the sacred space of the imperial residential city of 
Prague, regardless of whether one considers it in terms of its topographi-
cally defined form or in its broader sense.   
 
       In the role of papal nuncios as diplomats, their membership in a pres-
tigious group known as ambasciatori di cappella (ambassadors of the chapel) 
held a special significance in sacred space.64 In addition to the nuncios, the 
group included envoys of the Spanish king, the Republic of Venice, and 
the Grand Duchy of Tuscany, and all of these diplomats, unlike others, 
had the privileged right as well as an obligation to attend services, prayers, 
or other ceremonies with the emperor in the imperial chapel.65 According 
to an interpretation by Antonio Caetani from the year 1611, it was pre-
cisely this “seat in the chapel” that gave these individuals the right to use 
the title of “ambassador.”66 Certain envoys to the papal court in Rome had 
a similar function, and this was closely connected with acceptance of the 
sovereignty of their rulers on the part of the pontificate. �us, even in the 
case of the imperial court the existence of this group can be understood as 
a manifestative recognition of the right to sovereignty through the medium 
of the ceremonial.67 In spatial terms, this group secured its unique status 
not only in the imperial court but also beyond. �e church of the 
Capuchins in Prague, for instance, had a special pew reserved for these 
diplomats, and they exercised their exclusive right to use it even if it meant 
engaging in disputes, such as a conflict that arose between the nuncio 
Antonio Caetani and the leading Catholic aristocrat Zdeněk Popel of 
Lobkowicz in the year 1607.68  
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       Nuncios also used sacred spaces for secret high-level political meet-
ings. �eir reports from the beginning of the seventeenth century indicate 
that one such location was the recently-completed monastery of the 
Capuchins, which presumably was chosen due to its remoteness from the 
goings-on in the heart of the city. Participants in these meetings could 
arrive individually and discreetly, without attracting any unwanted atten-
tion. For example, Czech Catholic aristocrats, the nuncio Caetani, and the 
Spanish envoy Zúñiga met here in 1609 to identify ways in which they 
could prevent the emperor from issuing the famous Letter of Majesty 
granting religious tolerance. One year later, the monastery would serve as 
the venue for a meeting to discuss matters relating to the planned founding 
of the Catholic League.69 
 
       In the aforesaid cases, it was the diplomatic role of the nuncios that 
came to the forefront more than any other. �eir advantage as compared 
with other foreign diplomats was, of course, their rank of bishop, which 
entitled them to use sacred space in a different, more active way. �e plu-
rality and vitality of Catholic institutions provided these bishop nuncios, 
who as diplomats represented the pope himself, frequent opportunities to 
participate actively in a wide variety of liturgical festivities. Sacred space 
allowed them to go beyond the boundaries of the socially restricted space 
of the imperial court and aristocratic palaces and use their presence alone 
to speak symbolically to a far broader audience, in some cases even beyond 
the sphere of their Catholic confession.   
 
       �eir activities and movements as bishops in sacred space can be 
divided into two categories depending on the type of space. �e first con-
stituted the topographically finite space of the Catholic cathedral, 
churches, and chapels. Here, the most common form of activity was vari-
ous liturgical functions connected with the church of the Jesuits in the Old 
Town of Prague and typically intended for the Catholic minority; however, 
in some cases (e.g. conversions) these activities presumably also had a 
propagative effect on the sphere of majority non-Catholics.  
 
       �ere were numerous liturgical feasts during which nuncios would 
play the central role of administrators of the sacraments in churches and 
chapels. In 1591 at the Jesuit church of the Holy Savior, Camillo Caetano 
baptized a certain Turk and administered the Eucharist to him.70 Cesare 
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Speciano baptized a Jew in this same church in 1597,71 and the nuncio 
Giacomo Puteo provided confirmation for believers here in April of 
1589.72 �is integrational character and the emphasis on the link with the 
Church led by the pope as the representative of Christ was undoubtedly 
also part of the ordination of candidates to the priesthood or the granting 
of certain lower levels of ordination.73 �ere may be a similar function for 
the interpretation of nuncios as the main celebrants of liturgical cere-
monies, primarily making use of the important church feasts, such as 
Easter, the Feast of the Ascension of Christ, the Assumption of the Virgin 
Mary, or liturgical celebrations commemorating the death of the as yet 
uncanonized Ignatius of Loyola (31 July).74  
 
       Among the specific tasks recorded in the space of the Jesuit church 
and to which the nuncios actively contributed were the ceremonial conver-
sions of renowned non-Catholics. �e presence of the papal representative 
helped elevate the propagative significance of the ritual, the symbolic effect 
of a return to the “true” Church.75 An essential part of the ceremony con-
sisted of the rejection of heresy, the acknowledgment of the Catholic faith, 
and the consequent reception of the Eucharist from the hands of the 
nuncio, which further enhanced the public effect. Cesare Speciano 
accepted Johann Lange, a Lutheran and graduate of the leading Protestant 
university in Wittenburg, into the Catholic Church in 1592 amid consid-
erable public interest.76 Peter Streuber, a theologian and former superin-
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tendent whose son studied at the local Jesuit college in 1599, rejected his 
Lutheranism in the presence of the nuncio Filippo Spinelli and other elite 
members of the Catholic society and diplomatic corps.77  
 
       �e Cathedral of Saint Vitus was the venue of a similar liturgical and 
religious function fulfilled by papal nuncios. Despite occurring on a relatively 
sporadic basis, the activities undertaken here, the consecration of archbishops 
and their suffragans, carried considerably greater importance than those 
observed at the Jesuit church. Nuncio Ottavio Santacroce was chosen to con-
secrate the newly appointed archbishop Martin Medek in 1581,78 but he died 
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FIGURE 4. Cardinal Filippo Spinelli (1556–1616), print, unknown artist, unknown 
source. Image is stored at http://www.araldicavaticana.com/sx088.htm. Image is in 
the public domain.



unexpectedly, and Medek had to be consecrated by someone else.79 Another 
archbishop, Zbyněk Berka of Dubá, was consecrated on October 10, 1593 by 
Nuncio Speciano,80 and his successors, Karl of Lamberg and the suffragan 
Johann Lohelius, were consecrated by the new nuncio Antonio Caetani 
together with the former nuncio Giovanni Ferreri on October 7, 1607.81  
 
       Although it may seem that the appointment of papal diplomats as 
consecrators was an attempt on the part of the new Prague archbishops to 
underscore symbolically the closer ties to Rome, the reasons were some-
what more prosaic. �e archbishopric was not wealthy, and the organiza-
tion of festivities celebrating such occasions involved high costs arising 
from the provision of food and housing for the consecrators and their fre-
quently large entourages. Inviting a nuncio to serve as consecrator was also 
frequently motivated by economic considerations, which is something that 
Martin Medek explicitly stated in his request to Santacroce.82 
 
       Betrothal ceremonies for members of prominent Catholic aristocratic 
families were another similarly sporadic rite performed by nuncios; in 
1597, for instance, the nuncio Spinelli performed the ceremony for the 
Italian duke Francesco Gonzaga of Castiglione and Bibiana von Pernstein. 
At the end of his time in Prague in May of 1607, Spinelli’s successor, Gio-
vanni Stefano Ferreri, gave the blessing during the betrothal ceremony of 
the emperor’s illegitimate daughter, Caroline d’Austria, and Count 
François �omas Perrenot de Granvelle, which took place at the palace of 
Adam the Younger of Wallenstein.83 It cannot be said with certainty in 
which space within aristocratic palaces betrothal ceremonies were per-
formed, but presumably it was in the palace chapel. Without a doubt, the 
motivation for involving papal diplomats in these rather private family fes-
tivities was a declaration and verification of the family’s confessional alle-
giance and its loyalty to the Holy See.  
 
       �e second area with a significant presence of papal nuncios in the 
sacred space of early modern Prague were liturgical activities that tran-
scended the topographically defined framework of Catholic sanctuaries 
and, albeit only temporarily, extensively expanded the sacred space into the 
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profane space, i.e. into the streets and squares. �e nuncios could thus 
speak, in a truly acclamatory manner, not only to Catholics but also to the 
non-Catholic majority in Prague while applying a visual strategy to help 
strengthen the role of Catholicism and the sacralization of space. 
 
       �e sources testify to two basic forms of this interaction. �e first con-
sisted of the consecration of the foundation stones or construction sites of 
new Catholic churches and chapels. Of the six newly constructed build-
ings, the local nuncios were involved in the consecration of three, and it 
can be assumed that this generated much public interest, serving even to 
provide a degree of propaganda. �e first was the laying and consecration 
of the foundation stone of the Italian chapel, a renowned Mannerist build-
ing that was part of the Jesuit complex in the Staré Město (Old Town). 
�is replaced the original chapel serving the Italian community, which was 
no longer sufficient in terms of capacity. �e foundation stone of the new 
structure was laid by the nuncio Alfonso Visconti in a ceremonial event on 
July 23, 1590. �e chapel was completed in 1600 and later consecrated by 
Visconti’s successor, Spinelli.84 A similar event involved the consecration 
of the construction site for the Capuchin church, which took place on May 
23, 1600. �is included a ceremony that began at Saint Vitus Cathedral. 
�e members of the community of Capuchins, led by their vicar general, 
Lawrence of Brindisi, carried a wooden cross on their shoulders, as the cer-
emony had been established by the order. �ey carried it in the procession 
all the way to the building site, followed by the clergy, diplomats, courtiers, 
aristocrats, and “a remarkable number of both Catholics and heretics.” �is 
was the description of the event given by Spinelli, who presided over the 
occasion by celebrating Mass at the site.85 �e same nuncio consecrated the 
completed Jesuit church in 1602.86 Another act by a papal diplomat, this 
time Cesare Speciano, intended to bolster the Catholic confession in the 
public space was the consecration of the church of the Benedictine 
monastery of Emauzy in 1592, which occurred following the conversion of 
the local Utraquist abbot to Catholicism.87  
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       Yet another area of participation by papal diplomats in the Catholic 
sacralization of the public space, one with both a major manifestation and 
a confessionally distinctive effect, were various religious processions, in 
particular those taking place on the occasion of the Feast of Corpus 
Christi. �e earliest testimony to the participation of a nuncio comes from 
the year 1580.88 Over the following decades, it was a fairly standard prac-
tice for the nuncio to assume the function of the main celebrant of Mass 
or the bearer of the monstrance with the Eucharist during processions. By 
doing so, he was placing himself in a central role within the visual strategy, 
primarily developed by the Prague Jesuits, with focus on propagating the 
Catholic faith in the multiconfessional city.89 Nuncios were not, however, 
bound to this order only, and we have documented evidence of their iden-
tical role in festivities organized by other religious orders.90   
 
       �e festive manifestations of Catholicism likely had a more substantial 
impact on members of other confessions watching the Corpus Christi pro-
cessions, which became more attractive to the public thanks to the partic-
ipation of social elites of the time, such as members of the ruling Habsburg 
family or prominent imperial princes who might have been in residence at 
the imperial court in Prague. �ese individuals were often joined in the 
procession by important courtiers and aristocrats.  
 
       �ere was, for example, a liturgical procession on June 3, 1605 led by 
the nuncio Ferreri through the streets around the church of the Augustini-
ans. It took place under the patronage of Archduke Maximilian of Austria, 
who walked in the procession accompanied by his personal guard.91 When 
the Imperial Diet, which was made up of selected imperial princes, con-
vened in Prague in 1610 at the initiative of the emperor, religious proces-
sions were held on June 10 in the vicinity of the Jesuit church, with the 
Eucharist carried by the nuncio Antonio Caetani. Large numbers of 
Catholics participated together with representatives of the nobility and 
diplomats. Also present in the procession were the main “celebrities,” i.e. 
the archdukes Maximilian and Ferdinand of Austria (later emperor), 
accompanied by the imperial personal guard, and the Elector of Mainz, 
Johann Schweikard of Kronberg, and the Elector of Cologne, Ernst of 
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Bavaria.92 �e presence of armed guards in these events was not a mere 
representative touch but may have been a disciplinary measure intended to 
prevent any unwanted or unplanned conduct from onlookers, who often 
were members of other confessions and were strictly confined to the role of 
passive spectator.93 
 
       �e final form of nuncial presence was their funerals, which served to 
demonstrate symbolically their positions as papal representatives either in 
churches or in public processions through the streets of Prague. �ere are 
several documented cases from the 1570s and 1580s, although the sources 
often provide only limited information. �e nuncio Melchior Biglia died 
of spotted typhoid in Prague in 1571, but little is known about his burial.94 
Bartolomeo Portia died of colic in August 1578.95 In his case, the sources 
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FIGURE 5. Carl Emil Doepler the Elder, Fronleichnamsprozession [Corpus Christi 
Procession], oil on canvas, c. nineteenth century. Painting is in the public domain.



indicate that his funeral took place in magna pompa at the Jesuit church and 
was attended by many courtiers, diplomats, canons, and monastics.96 �is 
suggests that these festive rituals not only played a role in the salvation of 
the deceased in the eschatological sense, but also served as public demon-
strations of the confession with the aim of achieving spatial hegemony.97  
 
       �e most abundant information can be found on the death and funeral 
of the aforesaid Ottavio Santacroce, who died in September of 1581, only 
three months after embarking on his diplomatic mission.98 Despite his 
death occurring within a relatively small circle of his closest associates, it 
transcended the space of the city in the form of his ceremonial funeral, 
which became a display of allegiance to the Catholic faith.99 It was used to 
command attention through its visual and aural aspects and thus further 
advance efforts to establish spatial hegemony.100 Members of religious 
orders, students of the Jesuit college, and members of religious brother-
hoods, all with lit candles in hand, lined up behind a cross at the head of 
the procession and, accompanied by the ringing of the bells of all the 
Catholic churches, proceeded through the streets to the seat of the nuncia-
ture in Malá Strana (Lesser Town) and on toward Prague Castle. �e 
coffin of the deceased diplomat was covered with a large white cloth reach-
ing all the way to the ground and a small black cloth decorated with a white 
cross and  the family coat-of-arms of Santacroce. �e bishop’s mitre and 
additional symbols of the nuncio’s rank were placed on top. Members of 
his household and the imperial honor guard, along with fifty paupers 
dressed in black and with lit torches in their hands, marched in close prox-
imity to the coffin. Representatives of the social elite, foreign diplomats, 
leading Czech Catholic aristocrats, and imperial councilors as well as other 
representatives of the court and the nobility followed behind the coffin. 
�e gala procession came to an end at Saint Vitus Cathedral, where cere-
monies were performed by the Jesuit Johann Vivario.101 Santacroce’s body 
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was then laid to rest in the tomb of the chapel of St. Anne, where it 
remains to the present day. 
 

Conclusion   
 
       At the turn of the sixteenth and seventeenth centuries, the nuncios in 
Prague demonstrated a remarkable frequency and variability of activity in 
different types of scared space. It was an element with which they set 
themselves apart from other diplomats, the greatest influence coming from 
the nuncios’ rank of bishop, which, however, always correlated to some 
degree with their function as diplomatic representative of the pope. As 
concerns operations carried out in the space of Catholic cathedral, 
churches, or private aristocratic chapels, i.e. within the Catholic commu-
nity, the involvement of nuncios as active officials in liturgical festivities (in 
addition to their primarily religious function) had a representative or self-
identifying significance. Liturgical operations during which nuncios inter-
vened in the functionally profane space of Prague’s streets and squares may 
have had a different purpose, serving as an apolitical tool in their 
recatholization efforts, the visual and symbolic aspects of which aided in 
the fight to achieve Catholic spatial hegemony to the detriment of the 
existing non-Catholic majority. Authentication or further elaboration of 
this thesis would benefit from comparative research conducted into other 
early modern multiconfessional cities with papal nunciatures. 
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Invisible Umbrella of American Bishops: 
Aid for the Catholic University of Lublin 

in the Early Cold War Context 
 

SŁAWOMIR ŁUKASIEWICZ* 
 

As a result of the Second World War and the subsequent expansion of 
communism, the Catholic community in Poland was divided into the 
faithful who remained in the country and those in political exile. Par-
adoxically, this division created the conditions for the emergence of 
global networks aimed at organizing aid to Catholics in Poland. A 
special case was the Catholic University of Lublin (KUL), a unique 
institution of higher learning for the Catholic elite in Poland. �ough 
its existence was threatened many times, thanks to external aid coming 
from Catholics in the West, and organized by Polish émigrés together 
with e.g. the American hierarchy, the university survived and even 
gained international recognition. 
 
Keywords: Catholic University of Lublin, Cold War, US episco-
pate, Polish Catholics in exile 

 
American propaganda cast the Cold War as one of history’s great reli-
gious wars, between the godless and the God-fearing, between good and 
evil. It was a simplistic depiction that was supported and promoted in 
the highest echelons of government and by the leaders of America’s key 
institutions.1 

 

The Polish Catholic Church, which had been hard-hit during World 
War II, did not live to see better times after its end. �e new author-

ities initially seemed to show respect for the hierarchy, allowing them to 

534

        * Sławomir Łukasiewicz, Dr. Hab., is a professor and lecturer of European Studies at 
the John Paul II Catholic University of Lublin, associate at Davis Center for Russian and 
Eurasian Studies, Harvard University, and Fulbright Scholar 2019/2020. His email address is 
lukaslaw@kul.pl. 
        �is article has been translated from Polish by Renata Kujawska-Matacz. 
        1. Dianne Kirby, “�e Cold War and American Religion,” in: Oxford Research Encyclo-
pedia of Religion, May 24, 2017, https://oxfordre.com/religion/view/10.1093/acrefore/ 
9780199340378.001.0001/acrefore-9780199340378-e-398. 



launch Catholic journals and open the Catholic University of Lublin 
(KUL)—for a long time “the only Catholic university between the Elbe 
and Vladivostok.” However, new methods of oppression quickly emerged. 
Church grounds were taken away, special operations were conducted 
against priests, and the most resistant ones were charged and sentenced to 
imprisonment. Not all church representatives resisted this pressure, which 
resulted in various forms of cooperation with the authorities. �e climax of 
the fight against the Church in Poland was the arrest of the Polish Pri-
mate, Cardinal Stefan Wyszyński. His merits for the Church at that time 
remain undisputed and his conduct became a symbol of resistance to com-
munism. Nonetheless, the Church in Poland, including such institutions 
as the aforementioned university, would not have retained its autonomy or 
perhaps would not have survived, if it had not been for the enormous help 
that came from the West. �at support took different forms, from material 
and financial gifts to stipends for scholars and students. �is study focuses 
on the help provided by the Polish diaspora and the American episcopate.  
 
       Much has already been written about the Polish Church during the 
communist period, although these are works focused mainly on the recon-

                                                               SŁAWOMIR ŁUKASIEWICZ                                                      535

Stefan Wyszyński at the Catholic University of Lublin, accompanied by, among 
others, rector Marian Rechowicz. Photograph, unknown photographer, 1958. 
Stored in Lublin in the collection of the University Archives of the Catholic 
University of Lublin.



struction of ecclesiastical structures, state policy towards the Church, and 
the martyrdom of the Catholic Church and its servants under communism, 
such as the aforementioned Cardinal Stefan Wyszyński or other bishops.2 
�e literature includes numerous works devoted to Karol Wojtyła, profes-
sor of the Catholic University of Lublin, who was elected pope in 1978 and 
assumed the name John Paul II.3 Furthermore, other symbolic figures like 
Fr. Jerzy Popiełuszko,4 lay Catholic circles,5 and the fate of religious 
orders6 have been investigated. �ere is also a tradition of studies that jux-
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tapose the fates of the Churches of the individual communist-dominated 
countries of East Central Europe.7 
 
       �ere are also more and more studies on the Polish Church operating 
in exile, which was the key structure for coordinating aid to the Church in 
Poland, although there is still no comprehensive picture of this phenome-
non.8 However, there have been few works that attempt to explore the 
transnational networks of Polish Catholics in the twentieth century. Piotr 
Kosicki emphasized the importance of their intellectual contacts with French 
thinkers, proving that the Iron Curtain had its leakages.9 �e postwar strug-
gle to maintain such ties, and to add the new ones, is an important and still 
poorly known dimension of the transnational history of the Cold War. 
 
       �e history of the Catholic University of Lublin perfectly illustrates 
that struggle, as well as many difficulties encountered by such studies. First, 
the sources are scattered and in order to complete the set, the researcher 
must look through both the church archives in Poland and the archives 
deposited in Rome, London, Paris, or outside Europe. It should also be 
noted that the censorship and repression apparatus existing in Poland, on 
the one hand, led to the creation of special sources kept today in the 
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archives of the Institute of National Remembrance, and on the other hand, 
they produced underground behaviors which hinder research today. For 
example, when the rector of KUL wanted to include important informa-
tion in his foreign correspondence, he waited until his travel to the West 
and only then he sent his letters to Paris or London. �erefore, only a 
search in Paris or London allows one to find such documents today. Many 
activities were carried out in secret, so that there were no traces left of them 
or only those that would not expose anyone to persecution by the security 
authorities. Such caution was particularly advisable in the case of contacts 
with the United States, considered by the communist authorities as the 
main external threat and patron of all espionage activities. �is is why it is 
very difficult, and sometimes even impossible, to reconstruct these activi-
ties today as the witnesses are dead. What the contacts and aid operations 
to the Church in Poland looked like, and what role the structures of the 
Church in exile, the Polish episcopate, the Vatican and the Church in the 
world played, remain to be described. 
 
       Aware of all these difficulties, this author decided to investigate what 
role the Catholic community in the West, including emigrants, played in 
keeping the Catholic University of Lublin alive. An additional impulse to 
undertake this research was, among other things, the centennial anniver-
sary of the Catholic University of Lublin celebrated in 2018. On the occa-
sion of this anniversary, new publications about the university itself were 
produced.10 �anks to inquiries in the archives of the Catholic University 
of Lublin, as well as in Paris and Washington, it was possible to supple-
ment the existing state of the research and to focus on the study of the role 
played primarily by the American episcopate. �is research attempt shows 
how important this topic is and what incredible networks were built to 
provide the Lublin university with a steady supply of resources and mate-
rials necessary for its existence and the education of the Catholic elite 
under communism. Nevertheless, precise reconstruction of the networks 
and a full assessment of the scale of that aid needs even deeper study than 
this modest article. Focusing on this narrow case study, one sees clearly 
that the survival of the Catholic University of Lublin would not have been 
possible at all without external assistance. However, the answer cannot be 
complete if it does not take into account all the help that came to Lublin 
at that time from various parts of the world. 
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The Exile Liaison 
 
       To understand the situation of Polish Catholics after World War II, 
one must begin by noting that this community was divided by the Iron 
Curtain. �e overwhelming majority remained in Poland, but the part that 
found itself outside the country numbered many hundreds of thousands. 
According to Dariusz Stola, in the period between 1939 and 1945, “4.5 
million Polish nationals were forced to go abroad,” and “more than 4 mil-
lion inhabitants of Poland’s postwar borders had to leave between 1945 
and 1948.” Around 13% from that wartime flow (600,000) decided to stay 
in the West and became part of a broader phenomenon today called the 
Central European Cold War migrations.11 Among them there were many 
Catholics, Orthodox, Protestants, and Jews. However, Catholics were the 
most numerous group, which reflected the religious map of prewar Poland, 
where they made up 65% of the population.12 
 
       �e reasons for staying in the West after 1945 were common to all 
emigrants. During World War II, they retained the hope of returning 
home soon. Nevertheless, the agreements of the world’s leaders placed 
Poland under the control of Stalin and the Soviet Union, which closed the 
way for many emigrants to return. What was more, the new political 
system controlled by the communists needed three years to expel or victim-
ize all forms of previous official opposition. �e decision to stay in exile, or 
go into exile, was not an easy one. Many emigrants also decided to return 
to Poland to help in its postwar reconstruction, like a group of Christian 
Democrats or people who in 1945 were under the illusion that they would 
be able to operate freely in Poland. However, they were either quickly 
repressed or forced to go abroad again. 
 
       On top of this it must be added that there was a change in the position 
of the Catholic Church in Poland which took place as a result of the war. 
Ethnic cleansing, the Holocaust, and the new borders established in 1945 
made the Polish population appear to be 98% Catholic.13 In this new situ-
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the 20th century] (Warszawa, 2005), 246. 
        13. Such data, confirmed by contemporary researchers, were already known in the 
1950s thanks to Richard F. Staar, “�e Church of Silence in Communist Poland,” �e  



ation the Catholic Church became the only important religious institution. 
With time, it also proved to be a challenge for the communist authorities. 
 
       During the German and Soviet occupations, a huge part of the 
Catholic hierarchy and clergymen shared the oppression of their fellow cit-
izens in Poland. �is is perfectly illustrated by the fates of the Primate of 
Poland, August Hlond, and Bishop Józef Gawlina, accountable for the 
spiritual protection of Polish emigrants from the years of World War II 
onwards. �eir role was framed by the formal title of Protector of Polish 
Emigration granted by Pope Pius XI in 1931.14 After World War II, some 
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Józef Gawlina, photograph, unknown photographer, c. 1945. Stored in Warsaw, 
the National Digital Archives, Archiwum Fotograficzne Czesława Datki [Czesław 
Datka’s Photographic Archive], 3/18/0/-/21.



new arrangements were necessary, especially for the soldiers of the Polish 
Armed Forces who stayed in the West, for whom pastoral care was coor-
dinated within the network of Polish Catholic missions. 
 
       Even during World War II, due to the development of warfare, it was 
easier for the Polish hierarchy to obtain support from the American bish-
ops than from the Vatican. �e martyrdom suffered by Polish priests and 
the faithful at the hands of the occupying forces was a cause for concern, 
and already then the first relief committees were formed. Since it was 
almost impossible to transfer direct aid to occupied Poland, their main aim 
was to support the church structures in exile, including Gawlina himself. 
�is is where his close contacts with American bishops developed. Not sur-
prisingly, when he considered returning to Poland after the war, it was the 
auxiliary bishop of Detroit, Stephen Stanislaus Woznicki—later the bishop 
of Saginaw, Michigan—who dissuaded him from doing so. Ultimately, the 
authorities in Poland did not allow him to come back, and Gawlina stayed 
in Rome, coordinating relief efforts and traveling to all the places where 
Polish exiled communities were dispersed.15 
 
      Although in subsequent years he persistently worked for the benefit 
of Catholics in Poland and in exile, his relations with the key figure for 
Polish Catholics, Stefan Wyszynski, were very complex. �is is partially 
because Gawlina was appointed as the Protector of Polish Emigration, 
and his prerogatives were maintained by the Vatican even after the publi-
cation of the Apostolic Constitution “Exsul familia” in 1952. In this way, 
the pope confirmed the necessity of keeping the pastoral care of emigrants 
separate, which was supposed to protect them in case the communists 
took control over the Church in Poland—a strategy which the commu-
nists had implemented in other countries of the region.16 It was only after 
the death of Archbishop Gawlina in October 1964 that, by the decision 
of Pope Paul VI, the function of the Protector of Emigration returned to 
the Polish Primate.17  
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       Nevertheless, even after this date, the hierarchy continued to function 
outside the country, its task being, among other things, to coordinate aid 
to Catholics in Poland, including maintaining contact with the American 
hierarchy.18 Symbolically a new phase began in 1978, when Polish Cardi-
nal Karol Wojtyła became pope and assumed the name John Paul II. �is 
created new possibilities for the Church in Poland as well as for the Polish 
Catholics who lived in the West. �e pope symbolically had care over all 
Catholics, and in this sense the division between Poland and the exiled 
ceased to be so distinct. �e position of the Protector of Emigration sur-
vived until 2011, though its aid activities had been reduced since the col-
lapse of communism.19 
 
       It should also be noted that in the period before 1989, any contact 
between the emigrants and those who remained in the country was con-
trolled by the state and security apparatus, which strongly obstructed any 
relief channels. For instance, the work of all priests in Poland was super-
vised by the special Office of the Proclamation of Faith, which prepared 
special guidelines for émigré parishes, studied attitudes, and prepared 
reports on the execution of tasks, treating it as an important element of the 
country’s foreign policy.20 �erefore, Catholics often resorted to sub-
terfuge, trying to cover their tracks and not to reveal the true origin of the 
aid. Informal and trust-based networks of benefactors, bishops, priests, and 
the faithful were the basis for such actions. 
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        19. Archbishop Szczepan Wesoły in 2011 published a text in which he asked the fol-
lowing question: “Czy potrzebny jest kościelny protektor emigracji?” [Do we need a Church 
Protector of Emigration?], Więź, 1 (2011), https://wiez.pl/2018/08/29/czy-potrzebny-jest-
koscielny-protektor-emigracji/ (accessed on December 15, 2020). Since 2011 there has been 
a function of the Delegate of the Polish Bishops’ Conference for Polish Emigration and the 
Chairperson of the Commission of the Polish Episcopal Conference for Polish Diaspora 
Abroad, which till 2022 was held by Bishop Wiesław Lechowicz. 
        20. Among many, see: Dominik Zamiatała, “Duszpasterstwo polonijne w latach 1945-
1989 w dokumentach Urzędu do Spraw Wyznań—rekonesans po zasobie archiwalnym 
Archiwum Akt Nowych w Warszawie” [Pastoral care of the Polish diaspora in the years 
1945–1989 in the documents of the Office for Religious Affairs—a reconnaissance through 
the archival resources of the Central Archives of Modern Records in Warsaw], in: W kręgu 
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145-63. 



       In Europe the most important tool that the Protector of Emigration 
had at his disposal for mobilizing émigré Catholics to help the home coun-
try was the network of Polish Catholic missions around which the Polish 
parishes gathered. Missions were established not only for England, Wales, 
and Scotland, but also for France (beginning in 1922),21 Belgium, �e 
Netherlands, Spain, Switzerland, Sweden, and Denmark, as well as in 
South America (Argentina, Chile, and Brazil), in Australia and New 
Zealand, and in the Union of South Africa (later South Africa).22 �ere 
were also some special places like the Polish seminary in Paris, run by Fr. 
Antoni Banaszak, which played an extremely important role as a type of 
“node” where aid threads from all over the world came together. It is easy 
to imagine the mobilizing capability of such networks, cemented by the 
conviction of the need to save the country’s Catholics as well as the need 
to fight godless communism. �ese networks also served as channels for 
aid that flowed into Poland from the USA, so that the communist author-
ities in the country did not always know where the aid came from. 
 

American Bishops’ Assistance 
 
       During the Cold War, the USA was the country best able to resist 
effectively the expansion of communism. It was here that the Marshall 
Plan was born, the National Committee for a Free Europe was established 
in 1949, and from here that the so-called Crusade for Freedom was 
announced.23 Religious rhetoric characterized not only ecclesiastical circles 
but also politicians engaged in fighting communism around the world. It 
was no coincidence that Christian Democrats were involved in this strug-
gle—both Europeans and Americans recognized that Christian democracy 
could be an effective counterweight to the communist promise of equality 
and social justice.24 Dianne Kirby rightly points out that recent accounts of 
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Cold War history emphasize both the importance of religion as well as the 
eschatological nature of the Cold War clash, in which the good embodied 
by the West and the U.S. clashed with the evil of the Soviet Union and 
communism.25 
 
       On this battlefield, the fate of the only Catholic university behind the 
Iron Curtain grew to become a symbol of the struggle between good and 
evil. In this struggle the Catholic community in the West, especially in the 
USA, was obliged to somehow support the Polish “David” against the 
“Goliath” of the godless state education system. However, the mobilization 
of the exile Catholic community in the USA looked different than in 
Europe. Although thousands of Polish refugees crossed the Atlantic, their 
organization had to take into account the already-existing old structures, 
strongly rooted in the structures of the Catholic Church in the USA, 
whose aid potential could be easily activated. Even before World War II 
there were over eight hundred Polish parishes there, and the number of 
Polish priests working in the USA—supported by thousands of nuns—
exceeded 1,500. Immediately after the war these numbers increased.26 
�erefore, it was unlikely that new structures would be created with the 
influx of new emigrants. Polish parishes had a personal character and were 
directly under the jurisdiction of the American hierarchy. Additionally, 
Polish communities were more scattered than in Europe, and Bishop 
Gawlina’s care facilities in the area were severely limited. During his visits 
to America and Canada, he tried to meet with local hierarchs to talk to 
them about pastoral care for emigrants.27 He could count on the help from 
American bishops, who saw both the problems of the emigrants them-
selves28 and the needs of the Church behind the Iron Curtain.29 In this 
regard, the policy of the Catholic Church in the USA coincided with the 
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anticommunist policy of the USA at the time. Communism was a threat 
to democracy as much as to the Catholic religion. 
 
       Relationships with American bishops were extremely important from 
the beginning of his term as Protector. It was from the National Catholic 
Welfare Conference (hereinafter “NCWC”) that the funds for the main-
tenance of the Roman office came30 with the support from Pope Pius XII 
himself.31 �e direct contact and correspondence maintained by Gawlina 
with American hierarchs and such key persons as Fathers Edward 
Swanstrom and Aloysius Wycislo were also of great significance.32 Both 
Swanstrom and Wycislo were recruited to the War Relief Service person-
ally by Patrick O’Boyle, then a prelate strongly involved in the charity and 
relief operations, later archbishop of Washington.33 Although the activities 
of American bishops in this regard seem obvious, they have not yet found 
a good illustration in the literature.  
 
       Above all, it should be underlined that the American bishops took a 
keen interest in the affairs of the Polish Church and received first-hand 
information on the subject. �ey were very well informed about any mat-
ters related to the liquidation of the Caritas, or the state of Church-State 
relations. An example could be a detailed report sent by Fr. Wycislo to the 
General Secretary of the NCWC, Prelate Howard J. Carroll. Among the 
numerous facts quoted, Aloysius Wycislo ended with a conclusion: “�e 
greatest fear of Catholics in Poland is that they will be forgotten by their 
brethren in the outside world. Fear is beginning to tell and wear upon 
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nerves. […] �e impression felt by many behind the Curtain is that Com-
munism is gaining and that the West is losing its political battles.”34 
 
       Other channels of information came from France, where Fr. Antoni 
Banaszak, rector of the Polish Seminary in Paris, had many opportunities 
to talk with priests and Catholics coming from Poland. But he also had an 
opportunity to talk directly to Archbishop Wyszyński during his stay in 
Rome in 1951. Banaszak paid attention primarily to the activities of the 
authorities that were likely to cause schism in the Polish Church. He also 
wrote: “�e Archbishop Primate, with much gratitude, spoke of the aid of 
the American Catholics. He was well-informed and mentioned the deep 
gratitude of Catholic Poland for all that the American Catholics have done 
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for Poles following the war.”35 �e Apostolic Nuncio in the USA, Arch-
bishop Amleto Giovanni Cicognani, also passed on the request to the Vat-
ican Secretariat of State to send “books of religious culture into Poland and 
of radio broadcasts of programs designed to sustain Catholic Faith and the 
morale against systematic attacks of communistic propaganda.”36 
 
       When Primate Wyszyński was arrested in September 1953, the whole 
Catholic world was outraged. Pope Pius XII excommunicated everyone 
“who were in any way concerned with the suspension of Stefan Cardinal 
Wyszynski, Primate of Poland, from his ecclesiastical duties and his 
internment in a monastery.”37  �e Apostolic Nuncio Cicognani this time 
asked the NCWC to disseminate information about the persecution of the 
Church in Poland.38 �ere are many examples of the outrage and protests 
that it caused in the USA. �e then-Archbishop of Washington (D.C.), 
Patrick A. O’Boyle, issued on behalf of the American episcopate a special 
letter in which he emphasized Cardinal Wyszyński’s heroism and assured 
the Poles that he was praying for them. He also wrote: 
 

�e Church in the United States, Bishops, clergy, and laity alike, 
embrace their fellow Catholics of Poland in the bonds of love and affec-
tion in this, one of the darkest hours of their history. We reassure them 
of our sympathy, and of our admiration for their courage, fidelity and 
Christian fortitude.39 

 
       Letters condemning the actions of the authorities in Poland were 
written, among others, by Secretary of State John Foster Dulles and Pres-
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ident Dwight Eisenhower himself.40 Alongside these extremely important 
symbolic gestures, new ways of effective support for the Church in Poland 
were looked for, although it became clear that any help would be increas-
ingly difficult. 
 

Saving the Catholic University of Lublin 
 
       Aid for the only Catholic university in postwar Poland was provided 
immediately after the war, thanks to numerous appeals also addressed to 
American bishops through, among others, the US Ambassador to Poland, 
Arthur Bliss-Lane. As early as the autumn of 1945, the vice-rector of 
KUL, Fr. Zdzisław Papierkowski, asked the ambassador for help, explain-
ing the current needs of the university, impossible to satisfy in the univer-
sity’s current situation—that is to say, having been destroyed during the 
war, operating in a country damaged by the war, and unable to count on 
either sufficient private subsidies or state support. Among the most urgent 
needs, the vice-rector mentioned the necessity of completing the library 
collection (which had been practically completely devastated during the 
war), of renovating the buildings, and of organizing apartments for the 
teachers and dormitories for students.41 Ambassador Lane, as promised, 
handed this memorandum to the NCWC.42 At the same time, a request 
for books by the then-English teacher also arrived there, which only served 
to more clearly reveal the real picture of the difficult conditions in which 
the university found itself.43 Both these requests met with understanding, 
although Cardinal Samuel A. Stritch, the Metropolitan of Chicago and 
the then-Chairman of the Bishops’ Committee for War Emergency and 
Relief, was worried about whether the book posting campaign made any 
sense at all if the university could be closed down at any time.44 It was also 
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difficult to count on the help of the Jesuit Fordham University. Although 
it had symbolically “adopted” the Catholic University of Lublin back in 
1943, it chose to provide material support first to the Jesuit Ateneo de 
Manila University in the Philippines destroyed during the war.45 In fact, 
there were similar situations all over the world and in this sense neither the 
case of KUL nor the Church in Poland was exceptional. �at is why the 
bishops in the USA planned to treat such assistance as a whole, preparing 
for this purpose a coherent program and entrusting matters of assistance to 
Poland to the Bishops’ Committee for Polish Relief, whose treasurer was 
Bishop Stephen Woznicki. Within one year he managed to raise almost 
$312,000, which he then distributed to satisfy the needs of the Church in 
Poland and abroad. In the letter to Archbishop Stritch he wrote: 
 

Above all, and this gives me more satisfaction than anything else, we were 
able to get a considerable amount of funds into the country, without which 
the Church would find it almost impossible to operate some of its most 
necessary educational and charitable undertakings, such as the Catholic 
University of Lublin and the relief organization known as “Caritas.”46 

 
       �e amounts that were supposed to go to KUL were hidden in the 
item entitled “to the Church in Poland—direct” with the following com-
ment: “their distribution is left to responsible persons.” �e lack of names 
even in such a document shows how far discretion went. It is confirmed by 
a similar document prepared for the years 1947–48, when the entire budget 
available to Bishop Woznicki was already $500,000. �ere, the amount of 
$183,000 allocated “directly” to the Church in Poland was commented on: 
“[we] will try to get more funds into hands of responsible clergymen and 
important institutions like [the] University in Lublin.”47 In a separate 
place, in an undated document prepared on NCWC letterhead, there are 
amounts that the Bishops’ Committee for Polish Relief was supposed to 
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have at its disposal, including e.g. $10,000 for Bishop Gawlina for Polish 
seminaries or $20,000 for KUL.48 �e literature confirms that the account 
of the university was in fact credited with such an amount as early as 1946, 
largely contributing to its budget in times when the economy was hit by 
inflation and exchange rates were artificially regulated by the state.49 
Although in 1948 Bishop Woznicki continued to support the Polish 
Church and had $150,000 reserved for this aim, the structure of the budget 
changed. Anticipating, among other things, the possible liquidation of 
KUL, the funds were provided to support Polish priests who came to 
Rome to study and to support the Polish seminary opened in Paris.50 
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      Cardinal Adam Sapieha, the most important hierarch in Poland and 
curator of Caritas, immediately after the war appreciated the enormous 
amount of support received by the Polish clergy and Catholics in this way. 
In a letter to Archbishop John T. McNicholas, the then-Chairman of the 
Bishops’ Committee for War Emergency and Relief wrote: “it is with 
deepest gratitude that—looking back at the past two difficult postwar 
years—we think of the magnanimous help of the American Catholics, 
who, through their unprecedented generosity, enabled the Catholic 
Church in Poland to accomplish [the] difficult task of saving hundreds of 
thousands of people who had nothing to eat nor to clothe themselves 
with.”51 In the case of KUL, the funds were indeed used for the develop-
ment of the university, but this in turn aroused the suspicion of the author-
ities. Finally, in the fall of 1951, Fr. Antoni Słomkowski was deprived of 
his post as rector of KUL and then arrested and charged with economic 
crimes, but the charge was eventually withdrawn.52 
 
       Despite this help, the university’s situation was not easy. In the follow-
ing years, the university was infiltrated by the communist agents,53 like other 
church institutions, deprived of its property, and had imposed on it a so-
called “tax surcharge” that could not be paid without adequate income. �ere 
were many moments when the university was hanging by a thread. More-
over, before 1956 any help from the outer world was limited or simply 
blocked as Poland was relatively closed in terms of any contacts from abroad.  
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       �e year 1956, with the political changes it brought in Poland, opened 
new forms of exchange, such as aid. In the mid-1950s, the figure who was 
personally involved in appeals for help for KUL was Primate Stefan 
Wyszyński, a former student of the university.54 In the spring of 1946, Fr. 
Stefan Wyszyński had been appointed bishop of Lublin and became 
Grand Chancellor of KUL, giving lectures at the university. His ties to the 
university remained strong even in the following years. After taking up the 
position of Primate of Poland on January 8, 1949, he received his first visa 
to travel to Rome in 1951, where he spent almost the entire April.55 How-
ever, he was extremely busy with the fresh persecution of the Church in 
Poland, administrative issues, schism between the priests who decided to 
cooperate with communists, and the fallout of having finally signed an 
agreement between the Church and the authorities a year earlier. It was 
undoubtedly a great opportunity for the Primate to inform the community 
in the West about the difficult situation of the Polish Church. �e years 
spent by the Primate in internment (1953–56) made it impossible for him 
to continue these contacts. Only after his release in 1956 and political 
changes in Poland did the new opportunities arise. In May and June 1957, 
the Primate stayed in Rome, during which time he not only received the 
dignity of cardinal (in fact he had been already made cardinal by Pope Pius 
XII in November 1952 during a secret consistory), but also had an oppor-
tunity to meet the priests in exile, including Archbishop Józef Gawlina.56 
It was not a coincidence that shortly after this visit, Gawlina appealed to 
the NCWC to increase help for the Church in Poland.57 As early as in 
May 1957, he also sent letters to the rectors of the Polish Catholic Mis-
sions in Europe, forwarding a request of the Rectorate of KUL for support 
and the establishment of Friends of KUL Societies.58 Immediately after 
that letter he also sent the bylaws of such societies abroad, approved by Pri-
mate Wyszyński.59 
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       Wyszyński’s visit gave a strong incentive to create such societies across 
the globe, with the most active ones in the United Kingdom, France, Italy, 
and other countries in cooperation with Polish Catholic Missions in 
Europe and Catholics in other parts of the world. Once again aid for the 
scholars of Lublin University came in the forms of books for the library and 
offers of scholarships at Western universities, as well as other types of 
material and financial help. 
 
       A similar appeal was directed to Catholic émigré communities in the 
USA. After the visits of professors from KUL to Canada and the USA, 
new initiatives appeared there too. As early as in September 1957, the 
Polish Catholic University Foundation was established in Montreal, 
Canada. In the USA, Friends of KUL Societies were formally established 
only in the 1970s, with branches in Chicago,60 New Haven,61 Brooklyn 
(parish of Stanislaus Kostka, Greenpoint), and some other places. Chicago 
in particular, with around sixty Polish parishes (according to the estimates 
by Dominik Pacyga), had especially good conditions for the organization 
of help for Lublin university. In 1976, Friends of KUL in Chicago had 
around a hundred members,62 and two years later as many as three hundred 
and fifty.63 Many friends of Lublin University and diaspora organizations 
like the Polish American Congress cooperated in similar actions.64  
 
      �is variety of actions and the relatively late establishment of the 
Friends of KUL Societies were due to the specificity of the American 
region. �e Bishops’ Committee for Polish Relief still existed there. In 
the late 1950s it had at its disposal $90,000 a year, which it donated for 
the purposes of the Church’s activity in exile, according to the recommen-
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dations of Archbishop Gawlina. Only small sums of money were sent to 
Poland into the hands of individual priests, and even combined these 
sums were significantly smaller than those transferred immediately after 
the war.65 
 
       As early as in 1957, Cardinal Stefan Wyszyński ordered Bishop Karol 
Pękała—the Head of Caritas in Poland, 1945–48—to report the affairs of 
the whole Polish Church to Prelate Aloysius Wycislo, who represented the 
National Catholic Welfare Conference.66 Bishop Pękała, during his two 
month-long trip in the fall of 1957, met with the Apostolic Nuncio in the 
USA and was able to gain financial support from the NCWC, probably in 
the amount of $40 million.67 But the imposition of heavy tariffs by the 
Polish Communist state halted any direct transfer of this help to Poland.68 
A portion of this lost aid had been designated for KUL as well. 
 
       As the transfer of larger funds directly to Poland was encountering 
logistical difficulties, alternative channels for reaching Poland were sought. 
Among others, help from Fr. Antoni Banaszak (the previously-mentioned 
rector of the Polish Seminary in Paris) was of use and was approved by the 
Polish episcopate.69 Via that route, the donation of such goods as carpets 
or equipment for university kitchens were sent in the 1960s.70 Protectors 
of Polish Emigration, i.e. bishop Gawlina and his successors, also partici-
pated in unofficial transfers of funds to Lublin. �ere are many examples 
of such transfers, from $300 collected during the gathering of the Catholic 
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League of America71 to money sent to the Lublin bishop to cover the costs 
of printers for KUL,72 until a special fund of around $150,000 was estab-
lished in 1976 to cover the costs of a roof plate for a new university build-
ing.73 Generally, it is very difficult to estimate how much aid was sent to 
Poland during the Cold War years. �ere are estimations that Polish 
Americans had been sending annual packages worth $3 million to Poland, 
amounting to about $12 million in total.74 
 
       But material and financial help for KUL is only one side of the story. 
�e real struggle was over minds. �e university required not only financial 
and material support, but also help in reaching western scientific and intel-
lectual centers. For this purpose there were special exchange programs 
launched, which would have been completely unfeasible without the 
involvement of Western Catholics and, again, the American bishops. After 
the first scholarships of American foundations were granted to, among 
others, scientists from KUL, some decided to stay in the West (e.g. Jerzy 
Łukaszewski) while others, after returning to Poland, found out that their 
faculty was being closed down (such as the English Studies) and had to 
look for employment at other secular universities. �is exchange was sup-
posed to ensure that the Catholic University of Lublin did not lose its aca-
demic attractiveness and contact with Western science. After all, the uni-
versity could not count on exchanges organized through official state 
channels, for, as Professor James J. Zatko from the University of Notre 
Dame has written: “More disastrous has been the Catholic University of 
Lublin’s exclusion from an exchange program sponsored by the govern-
ments of the United States and Poland. �is deprives the university of sig-
nificant contacts with American universities; such contacts are important 
in present-day Poland for education as well as for morale.”75 
 
       Such support required new channels, and this time the so-called 
Catholic Relief Services (CRS), also associated with the NCWC, was 
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involved.76 It was headed by Bishop Edward E. Swanstrom and, until 
1959, the Assistant Director was Prelate Aloisius Wycislo (the later Aux-
iliary Bishop of Chicago and eventual Bishop of Green Bay [1968–83], 
and one of the Second Vatican Ecumenical Council fathers). �is ecclesi-
astical institution was dedicated to helping the Catholic community in 
many places around the world, including Poland. CRS was also one of the 
largest “private voluntary organizations” in the USA (PVO), i.e. private 
social organizations that provided assistance in the world. �erefore, 
CRS’s activities should be viewed in the context of the US global human-
itarian aid policy. It was related to the fact that the funds that CRS had at 
its disposal were often 60–70% of those of the American government.77 
�e relationship between the US administration and this Catholic organi-
zation was obvious. Furthermore, Wycislo himself—being, as one of the 
heads of CRS, a representative of one of the religious aid organizations—
was consulted by Gen. Eisenhower in humanitarian aid matters.  
 
       It was CRS’s agency that made it possible to provide scholarship assis-
tance for KUL researchers. Swanstrom was determined to start a new pro-
gram for Poland already in 1959. He wrote to Woznicki: “I am planning 
to ask the Board at the November meeting to appropriate at least $100,000 
next year to meet some of the requests of Cardinal Wyszynski. I also am 
trying to find a suitable representative to send to Poland to explore the pos-
sibility of our reestablishing an on-going relief program in that country.”78 
Bishop Woznicki agreed that this aid should go through official channels, 
but warned against using a special state financial institution for this pur-
pose, explaining that he was unable to send even $500 to one of the bishops 
through this route. He also wrote that apparently the Russians had too 
many spies in this place.79 
 
       Nevertheless, the financial injection came from an unusual source, and 
was the result of the efforts of Prof. Jerzy Łukaszewski, Ford Foundation 
grantee. In the early 1950s he was a professor at KUL. In late 1957 he was 
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awarded a scholarship from the Ford Foundation and came to Harvard 
University, where he spent two years. It was also during this time that he 
met American businessman and philanthropist Charles Merrill. After sev-
eral conversations about Poland, communism, and KUL, Merrill decided 
to grant Lublin university the funds necessary for foreign exchange. In 
March 1959, Merrill wrote to Łukaszewski: “�e money would be avail-
able for Lublin if it could be clearly described [as] a Catholic charity and 
not as educational. �is means that it should be transferred through a 
Catholic religious group such as the Jesuits […].”80 Eventually, Charles 
Merrill Trust transferred around $30,000 to the account of CRS. 
 
       Aloysius Wycislo was to administer this amount, while Łukaszewski 
had the right to indicate persons eligible to receive the money from this 
source. He did it throughout the next decade, in cooperation with the rec-
tors of KUL, and was greatly indebted to the long-time experience of 
Wycislo. �anks to this action, over forty professors and lecturers from 
KUL were able to visit Western universities and research centers, which 
surely developed the scientific potential of the university in ways impossi-
ble to evaluate. Some of the scholars received grants multiple times and 
could stay at their foreign universities for a year. Łukaszewski made sure 
that every research project had ample justification. Money administered by 
CRS was also used to purchase books for the university library.81 �e whole 
operation ended in the early 1970s when the funds ran out and 
Łukaszewski became Rector of the College of Europe in Bruges.82 His 
efforts were one of the first of such a character and scale. Later on, many 
other centers offered scholarships for scientists from KUL.83 
 
       In the spring of 1981, at a time when the “Solidarność” movement was 
flourishing, CRS again got involved in helping Poland and Cardinal John 
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Krol became the head of the program entitled “CRS/Poland.” With the 
approval of the authorities in Poland, with the blessing of John Paul II, and 
in coordination with the Polish Episcopal Charity Commission headed by 
Bishop Czesław Domin, help was to come again from the USA84—but this 
is a topic for another article. 
 

Conclusion 
 

       For the Church in Poland, the Cold War meant not only repressions 
in the country, but also dispersion of a huge émigré community. Paradox-
ically, this very dispersion, reinforced by the cooperation with local 
Catholic communities, proved to be extremely effective in the arrangement 
of various aid campaigns for Catholics in Poland. 
 
       �e division of the world into two warring blocs, and the repressions 
to which the Church was subjected in the countries of the Soviet bloc, 
caused the Church in the West to try to support both émigré Catholics and 
Catholics in Poland. An important role in this policy was played both by 
ecclesiastical structures created specifically to care for the emigrants and by 
the structures of local churches, as the example of American hierarchy 
shows. A global network of hierarchs, parishes, and individuals created 
unique conditions for different types of aid to reach Catholics in Poland. 
 
       Catholics in exile, together with the faithful and the hierarchy in the 
West, were engaged in numerous activities to defend the Church in Poland 
and supported it in various ways throughout the communist period. �e 
mobilization of Catholics was widespread. �e activities of the Aid to the 
Church in Need (German: Kirche im Not) and the aid that went through 
the American bishops and the NCWC or CRS illustrate this phenomenon 
perfectly. �ese examples also show how important discretion and mutual 
trust were. Had it not been for such help, the survival of the Church itself 
in Poland, its relative independence from the communist authorities 
gained over time, and the preservation and strengthening of the only 
Catholic university that remained in the entire Soviet bloc for many years 
would not have been possible. To paraphrase the title of John Connelly’s 
book, it was thanks to such help that KUL—in comparison with other uni-
versities—was not such a “captive university.”85 An even clearer picture 
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emerges when one juxtaposes it with the history of the Church in other 
countries of the region such as in Czechoslovakia, Hungary, and 
Romania.86 In those nations the brutal repression and atheization of social 
life led to a significant erosion of church structures and negatively affected 
the state of society’s spirituality. However, there remains an open question 
about the extent to which these Churches were able to count on the help 
from their own emigrants and Catholics across the world. Undoubtedly, 
the example of Poland—with a predominance of Catholics in society, a 
large group of Catholics who organized communities in exile and, finally, 
the election of Karol Wojtyła as pope—compels such questions and further 
comparative research in this area.
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Priests without Ordination: 
Catechists in Villages beyond Missions, 

Western Tanzania, 1948–1978 
 

SALVATORY S. NYANTO* 
 

�e growth of Christianity in mid-twentieth-century western Tanza-
nia depended on the activities of African catechists (both men and 
women) and teachers. �ese catechists lived in villages beyond the mis-
sion stations, administering catechesis to youth and adult catechumens 
in preparation for baptism, leading the congregation on Sunday serv-
ices, and translating religious texts into the indigenous languages, to 
mention just a few preoccupations. �eir work subsequently increased 
the number of Christians in village outstations (vigango). Despite 
their contribution to shaping the course of Christianity throughout the 
twentieth century, catechists have remained in the margins of the mis-
sionary enterprise, depicted simply as “examples of successful mission 
work.” �is paper brings to prominence the hitherto-muted role of cat-
echists in shaping the development of African Christianity in western 
Tanzania, in order to demonstrate that they were as important as mis-
sionaries. Furthermore, the paper intends to show that as life in vil-
lages became untenable, catechists ultimately mounted a rebellion 
against church authority. Nevertheless, the ideals of socialism 
(ujamaa), which had dominated religious and political discourse of 
1960s Tanzania, divided the Catholic clergy on sustaining catechists 
in villages. 
 
Keywords: catechists, catechetical instruction, Christianity, dis-
sent, Western Tanzania 

560

        * Salvatory S. Nyanto is a senior lecturer in the Department of History, University of 
Dar es Salaam. (P.O. Box 35031, Dar es Salaam). Research areas include religion and empire, 
slavery and missionaries, and Christian-Muslim relations. Email address: ssnyanto@gmail.com.  
�e author is grateful to the three anonymous evaluators, whose comments and suggestions 
have shaped the paper’s arguments regarding the subject matter. 



Catechists as Priests without Ordination: Context, Argument, 
and Sources 
 

�e catechists must receive such a training that they will be a kind of 
‘priests without ordination;’ or in the case of women that they may be a 
sort of substitutes for Sisters.1 

 
       �is excerpt by Rt. Rev. Msgr. H. Goertz, Secretary General of the 
Pontifical Society for the Propagation of the Faith (Latin: Propaganda 
Fide, currently referred to as Congregatio pro Gentium Evangelizatione) in 
Rome was one of the three conditions for sponsoring catechists in western 
Tanzania. He issued the statement on July 4, 1962, in response to a letter 
from the Vicar General, Father Roger Fouquer WF/M.Afr., who had 
written on behalf of Archbishop of Tabora, Marco Mihayo, asking the 
Society for financial aid for eleven catechists who were already “in action,” 
meaning that they had already been working in villages.2 Monsignor 
Goertz outlined conditions for financial aid to catechists: there had to be a 
real catechist school, training had to last for two years, and the scholarships 
had to be used for the students’ board, lodging, and study materials, and 
anyone who would use the money for other purposes “[would] offend 
against the benefactor’s intention.”3 
 
       By the second half of the twentieth century, a sizable number of cate-
chists had been working in villages, some of them as residents and others 
as volunteer catechists. Both resident and volunteer catechists began work-
ing in villages after a two-year course at Ndala Catechetical School. �e 
Ndala School also organized special courses for the wives of catechists, 
especially in Homecraft and rudimentary Social Sciences. Church author-
ities believed that the wives of catechists ought to be worthy partners to 
their husbands and therefore their level of education could not be too far 
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below their husbands. By educating the wives of catechists, insisted the 
church authorities, they would have a “wholesome influence on their envi-
ronment, especially on the women of the place where they [would be] sta-
tioned.”4 Unfortunately, as the eleven catechists were already in action, like 
their contemporaries, the Society for the Propagation of the Faith could 
not help the Archbishop in that matter. Instead, it initiated a program for 
the education of catechists (men and women) who aspired to work in the 
villages. �e Society therefore, insisted Msgr. Goertz, “[took] over the 
sponsorships for catechists who enter[ed] training school.”5  
 
       In addition to outlining the training and what catechists ought to do, 
the Society put in place two other conditions for participating in the spon-
sorship of catechists in the archdiocese of Tabora. First, the Society 
insisted that the diocese had to either establish its own catechetical school 
or find the means for the archdiocese to send its catechist-students to 
neighboring dioceses for training. Second, it urged the archbishop that all 
student-catechists ought to undergo a two-year systematic instruction, 
rather than a temporary course of two months, insisting that “the time of 
half-educated catechists [was] gone.”6 In his letter to the Archbishop, the 
vicar general, Father Roger Fouquer, told him in response to Msgr. 
Goertz’s letter that two of the three conditions had already been imple-
mented: the Catechists’ School at Ndala was in operation and catechists 
underwent a formation of two years. However, he doubted whether the 
two-year training would make male catechists become “priests without 
ordination” and women catechists “substitutes for Sisters.”7 
 
       Notwithstanding the vicar general’s reluctance, which was evident also 
among his contemporaries regarding the marginal position of catechists, 
Msgr. Goertz’s claim that male catechists would essentially become as 
priests without ordination and female catechists as substitutes for sisters 
was worthwhile in the evangelization of western Tanzania. Christian evan-
gelization in villages beyond the missions, despite the contribution made 
by the White Fathers and White Sisters, would have been unsuccessful had 
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catechists taken merely a passive role. Indeed, the work of catechists (both 
men and women) and of wives of catechists in these villages significantly 
contributed to the evangelization of western Tanzania. Catechists and 
teachers taught catechumens in village outstations in preparation for bap-
tism, making sure that the pupils had memorized the answers from the cat-
echism before they were allowed to take an entry examination for baptism. 
To help students remember the answers, catechists would set the answers 
to simple tunes and teach these songs to the students to simplify memo-
rization of the catechism.8 In addition to religious instruction, catechists 
visited Christians in villages, taught the fundamental doctrines of the 
Catholic Church, and led congregants during Sunday services. In areas 
where the influence of chiefs remained potent against Christianity, the 
visits of catechists “would make friendly relations [between chiefs and mis-
sionaries] possible.”9  
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Ndala Catechist School. Photograph, taken by the author, November 23, 2016. 
Each student-catechist, together with his family, lived in one of these houses for 
two years until the end of the course. �e nature of the compound of these houses 
enabled student-catechists and their families to build a community based on 
mission experience.



       Catechists’ agency in evangelization also proved invaluable in the 
translation of religious texts (hymnodies, the Bible, prayer books, and 
songs).10 Because most missionaries were relatively unversed in the 
Kinyamwezi language and culture, translation was made effective through 
the medium of catechists because they knew well their own indigenous lan-
guages and culture. With their mastery of the Kinyamwezi languages, 
these African catechists interpreted the scripture in their own ways, appro-
priated Christianity, and became “masters of new ways” in the villages 
because they could read and write, and were well-immersed in their own 
culture with which they were working.11 Employing the linguistic skills 
and some rudimentary training from the mission schools, catechists  
“crossed linguistic and cultural boundaries to [preach, teach,] and spread 
the faith” in villages beyond the missions.12 Wives of student catechists, 
too, were instrumental in shaping the nature and character of Christianity 
because they attended three classes of catechism every week, as well as 
courses on home crafts, cooking, and handicrafts. Women who had never 
been to school also attended classes in reading and writing to form part of 
the new identity of the literate Christian community.13 
 
       Although missionaries relegated catechists to the margins of the mis-
sionary enterprise, their immeasurable contribution to the shaping of the 
course of Christianity in twentieth-century western Tanzania is worth 
acknowledging. �is paper, therefore, fills this void by examining the place 
of unordained catechists to the growth of Christianity in villages where the 
influence of missionaries was almost negligible. Because of the geography 
of the archdiocese of Tabora, the limited number of missionaries rarely vis-
ited the village outstations; some were visited only once in a year, leaving 
catechists to shoulder the mission work.14 Finally, this paper seeks to show 
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that Tanzania’s policy on socialism—in particular, on socialism and self-
reliance (ujamaa na kujitegemea)—had bearing on shaping the course of 
Christianity because its ideals filtered into rural areas, and, thus, domi-
nated the religious and public spheres. As life in the villages became inde-
fensible for catechists, they mounted rebellion against church authority, 
calling for recognition and remuneration to sustain their living. Sustaining 
catechists, in consequence, divided the clergy in the archdiocese of Tabora 
between the White Fathers, who thought that the demands of catechists 
were worth handling, and African priests, who objected to the proposition 
in favor of the nation’s policy of socialism and self-reliance.  
 
       To tell this story of catechists and their contributions to shaping the 
growth of Christianity in the villages, this study relies on primary sources 
deposited in the archives of the archdiocese of Tabora, covering the period 
between post-Second World War Tanzania and 1978, when the White 
Fathers (and the Church in general) celebrated the hundredth anniversary 
of evangelization in western Tanzania. �e archives contain correspon-
dences between the clergy in the archdiocese of Tabora and church author-
ities in the Society for the Propagation of the Faith in Rome. �ey also 
include correspondence between catechists and the clergy in Tabora and 
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�e Catechist and his Family at Ndala School. Photograph, unknown date, 
unknown photographer. Image is courtesy of the Archdiocese of Tabora.



general correspondence and reports about the development of the Ndala 
Catechist School. �ese sources encompass several issues, ranging from the 
nature and character of the religious instruction offered to catechists in the 
School, timetables, letters of support to catechists, reports about catechet-
ical training in missions and village outstations, and letters about cate-
chists’ dissent in pursuit of equality and recognition in the Church. �e 
varied experiences of catechists in villages undoubtedly suggest that the 
growth and consolidation of Christianity in twentieth-century western 
Tanzania was inextricably linked to the zealous efforts of catechists. �is 
study supplements information from primary sources with secondary 
sources about the missionary enterprise, Christianity, and community-
building in East Africa. 
 

Catechists and Evangelization: Historical, Anthropological, 
and Theological Discourses 
 
       For the most part, scholarship on the expansion and rapid spread of 
Christianity neglected the place of catechists and, instead, “described it 
almost entirely as a spiritual phenomenon.”15 Some studies, however, have 
demonstrated the centrality of catechists in creating “local theologies” by 
acting as “community-based agents of evangelization.”16 Some studies have 
extended the discussion on local theologies by examining how catechists 
became instrumental in “domesticating a religious import” through incul-
turation and reinforcing mutual relationships between the evangelized and 
missionaries across time and space.17 Studies of this sort show the promi-
nence of catechists in the missionary enterprise by establishing themselves 
among the evangelized and becoming part of the “long conversation” 
between missionaries and people. Because of their mastery of the culture, 
studies show that catechists helped Christianity establish a “local setting for 
itself” by shaping interdependence between missionaries and the society.18 
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      Some studies centering on translation and the dialectics of conver-
sion have demonstrated the place of catechists in the translation of reli-
gious texts into their own languages.19 Studies have demonstrated that 
the mastery of culture and language enabled catechists to form “the basis 
for the modern intelligentsia” by becoming “mission agents” and “scrip-
ture readers,”20  and that the readership culture made catechists become 
independent interpreters and intellectuals in shaping an African interpre-
tation of Christianity as they helped people read and understand the 
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scriptures.21 Some studies concentrating on texts have revealed ways in 
which translation not only created “textual communities,” but also cre-
ated entanglements between missionaries and catechists, leading to a 
particular Christianity which was “historically contingent” and “distinc-
tively [African].”22 Of course, the centrality of catechists has prompted 
studies to examine the place of gender in translation and evangelization. 
Studies of this category argue that women, as evangelists, worked side by 
side with men in spreading the Christian faith.23 
 
       In addition to translation, while some studies show that missionaries 
regarded catechists as “filial adjunct[s]” to the missionary enterprise in 
Africa and beyond, others show, instead, that catechists made significant 
contributions as “self-reliant missionary activists.”24 �e contributions 
made to evangelization by catechists as self-reliant missionaries have 
inspired studies to examine ways in which the learning and experience of 
missionaries who were returning from Africa and other parts of the world 
offered an important contribution to the development of Christian com-
munities which honored the abilities of the laity.25 �at catechists became 
a model for reinforcing Christian communities at home seems to suggest 
what studies in church history have regarded as “bringing it all back 
home.”26 �e influence of catechists and teachers in Africa and other parts 
of the world on the missionaries at home is suggestive of what imperial his-
torians have long regarded as “empire coming home.”27 
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       In recent decades, however, studies centering on catechesis as an 
essential facet of evangelization have demonstrated the place of catechists 
in laying the groundwork for Christian communities in villages. �ey show 
that regular instruction administered by catechists became an “enriching 
category for religious education” because they provided converts with 
glimpses into the Christian faith.28 Others have demonstrated how catech-
esis influenced catechists’ practices, religious lives, and catechetical learn-
ing environments, arguing in favor of mutual learning during instruction. 
�ey believe that as catechists taught converts and catechumens, they were 
also nourished by the teachings.29 Yet, other studies show that, although 
catechists remained a marginal group of actors in the historiography of the 
colonial and missionary enterprise, their contribution to the development 
of the early colonial education system affected the growth of African 
Christianity, social change, and the newly emerging class of educated 
Africans in the colonies.30 
 
       �is study tells the story of catechists in order to show their contribu-
tion as “self-reliant missionaries” to the growth of Christianity in twenti-
eth-century western Tanzania. It begins the narrative from the post-
Second World War period, where decolonization, which included such 
ideals as independence and Africanization, became an important force to 
reckon with. Because catechists worked in village outstations far from the 
centers of mission stations, they used their intellectual and cultural creativ-
ity to teach prayers and songs and lead the congregants on Sundays. �ey 
became intellectuals who were influential in shaping congregants’ interpre-
tation of Christianity as they appropriated Christianity within the realm of 
Unyamwezi culture. �e daily interactions at Ndala Catechist School 
helped catechists to create an idealized Christian community based on 
mission experience, and to maintain relationships as they worked in the 
village outstations. �is study departs from the linear outlook of catechists 
as passive actors in the missionary enterprise. Instead, it treats them as 
active participants who sometimes challenged the clergy over matters that 
affected their wellbeing and mission work in the villages. As life increas-
ingly became untenable in the village outstations, some catechists gave up 
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the work and relocated to larger towns to make ends meet. However, 
others relied on their pre-existing networks and mission experience at the 
Ndala Catechist School to organize rebellion against the clergy over remu-
neration, equality, and recognition of their work in the villages. �is rebel-
lion not only caused evangelization in some village outstations to remain at 
a standstill, but also divided the clergy in its attempt to find workable solu-
tions to their demands. 
 

Catechists in Need: Tensions of Empire, Decolonization, and Vatican II: 
The 1 9 5 0 s– 1 9 6 0 s 
 
       �e need for catechists in villages in post-war Tabora stemmed from the 
socio-political and religious contexts of the 1950s and 1960s in western Tan-
zania and the British Empire. �e end of the Second World War ushered in 
a new era of intensive exploitation to revamp the dilapidated British econ-
omy. Following the Second World War, British colonial authorities 
increased the exploitation of colonial resources to rebuild the empire through 
what has been called the “second colonial occupation.”31 �e war’s course 
coincided with severe drought as poor rainfall resulted in a shortage of food 
crops in the Tabora, Nzega, and Kahama districts. After the war, sleeping 
sickness, rinderpest virus, drought, and famine lingered in many parts of 
Unyamwezi.32 Besides deaths, the outbreak of sleeping sickness caused a 
scarcity of cattle and, subsequently, increased the price of meat in 
Unyamwezi. �e glaring shortage of cattle became evident between the 
1940s and 1950s in Ussoke, Ndono, Kitunda, Tabora, Kahama, and Nzega. 
In Ussoke and Ndono alone, the number of cattle declined from 6,689 to 
2,093 between 1952 and 1954 due to the rising tide of sleeping sickness in 
the area.33 �e persistence of tsetse flies in various parts of Unyamwezi dis-
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couraged settlement and agriculture. Areas such as Ilalangulu, Kaliua, 
Urambo, Ndono, Ussoke, Mabama, Loya, Ntankwa, and Ussangu II 
remained mostly uninhabited and uncultivated due to limited migration into 
the region, causing suffering, disturbances, and complaints among families.34 
 
       In the Nzega district, however, the tsetse fly areas of Mambali, Wem-
bere in the southeast, parts of the north and west of the Iborogero-Igurubi 
road up to the Manonga river, and the west of Bukene, the area had 
become clear of the tsetse fly, and people could settle in villages.35 �e 
depopulation of villages as well as compulsory resettlement caused Chris-
tians to relocate to other village outstations. Christians joined churches in 
the resettled villages and carried with them the ethos of the Christian com-
munity from their old missions and villages. �e growing number of 
Christians increased the need for catechists and teachers in the villages.36 
Further, the Second World War affected crop production, making exports 
a more formidable challenge. In addition to economic difficulty, rinderpest 
virus broke out in the districts of Unyamwezi, and the export of cattle was 
almost negligible. Locusts were spread over the country in great propor-
tions, halting farmers’ prospects, and prolonged drought affected various 
parts of Unyamwezi.37  
 
       By the mid-1950s, as the crisis deepened, decolonization in Tan-
ganyika seemed an ideal solution to curb increased colonial exploitation. 
As in other parts of Tanganyika, Unyamwezi residents expressed their dis-
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content through strikes and the formation of political parties. For instance, 
Christopher Kasanga Tumbo, a Nyamwezi from Usoke, who was working 
as the general secretary of the Tanganyika Railway Workers’ Union 
between 1960 and 1962, made the “strike inevitable” because he did not 
consent to “sell the independence of workers’ unions in the country.”38 He 
mobilized African railway workers to mount a rebellion against the author-
ities in demand of better wages and good working conditions until officials 
of the international trade union in Dar es Salaam asked the railway workers 
for mediation.39 In due course, ideas of independence spread in rural and 
urban Unyamwezi under the party’s patronage, the Tanganyika African 
National Union (TANU), and dominated political and religious spheres 
such that “even in churches, Christians began talking about independ-
ence.”40 �ese events, to borrow a leaf from Ann Laura Stoler and Freder-
ick Cooper, demonstrated the “tensions of empire” and, thus, inspired the 
White Fathers and White Sisters to “examine their own hegemony” and 
“[alter] their visions when faced with the challenges from the people they 
were trying to [convert].”41 �ese changes, writes Elizabeth Foster, also 
marked “a critical historical juncture” that “change[d] perceptions of colo-
nizers and the colonized regarding the empire.”42 
 
       Amidst decolonization, people found themselves in a “spiritual crisis” 
as they reconciled their Catholicism with the political and cultural shifts of 
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1950s Tanganyika. �ese dilemmas put the Catholic Church “at [a] cross-
roads in the postwar period” as Africans began to question European polit-
ical and cultural hegemony. �e Second Vatican Council “read the signs of 
times” in “negotiating decolonization” of the twentieth century and subse-
quently became instrumental in shaping the course of African 
Christianity.43 �e Sacrosanctum Concilium (�e Constitution on the 
Sacred Liturgy), which Pope VI issued on December 4, 1963, outlined the 
main goals of the Council: to impart an ever-increasing vigor to the Chris-
tian life of the faithful; to adapt more suitably to the needs of our own 
times those institutions which are subject to change; to foster whatever can 
promote union among all who believe in Christ and to strengthen whatever 
could help to call the whole of humankind into the household of the 
Church.44 Further, in his Evangelii Nuntiandi (On Evangelization to the 
Modern World) to mark the tenth anniversary of the closing of the Second 
Vatican Council, Pope Paul VI called the Church to adapt to diverse cul-
tures of the evangelized to “make the Church of the twentieth century ever 
better fitted for proclaiming the Gospel.”45 To show the importance of cul-
ture to the evangelization in the twentieth century, Pope VI reiterated the 
statement he had made before the Sacred College of Cardinals on June 22, 
1973 that “the conditions of the society in which we live oblige all of us 
therefore to revise methods, to seek by every means to study how we can 
bring the Christian message to modern [human beings].”46  
 
       Fr. Marko (alias Marcus) Mihayo, who was appointed Archbishop of 
Tabora in 1960, attended the Council, and, upon his return, he commis-
sioned two priests (Fr. Grondin Eloi and Fr. John Kabeya) to translate the 
decrees of the Council into Kiswahili “for the doctrines to penetrate the life 
of the Church, to bring health and new life in the souls of Christians.”47 
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Archbishop Mihayo called for more catechists to work in villages because 
he was also concerned with catechetical matters in his diocese. He labored 
to produce a small catechism known as Katekisimu Yetu, which could be 
used as a tool in catechizing.48 He hoped that catechists would make use 
of the catechism because they were better placed to accommodate these 
changes as they interacted with Christians in villages and knew well the 
culture of the people to whom they evangelized. He also saw catechists as 
pillars of the parishes in his archdiocese because they were “successors of 
the seventy disciples who [worked in places] where he himself would go 
forward.”49 Before he sent priests to parishes and villages, added Arch-
bishop Mihayo, “catechists [would be] sent to evangelize and to dispose 
the local people to receive the priest . . . [and to prepare] them religiously 
in mind and heart.”50  
 
       Political and economic changes that shaped mid-twentieth-century 
western Tanzania and Tanganyika corresponded to the decline in voca-
tions in Europe. �ey affected many missionary activities in western Tan-
zania. For the most part, missionaries could not administer all mission sta-
tions, and African clergy were considerably few. Many mission stations 
were understaffed, and for the most part, catechists shouldered the respon-
sibilities in missions and village outstations. With an increasing shortage of 
religious men and women to coordinate all pastoral and social services in 
Tabora, the White Fathers and White Sisters revised the management of 
parishes in western Tanzania. �ey toured villages, asking catechists to 
conscript the young to join seminaries and religious communities. To cater 
to the increased demand for catechists, the White Fathers made frequent 
visits to the village outstations of Ndala, Kahama, and Tabora, the priests 
looking for young men who aspired to become catechists. In conjunction, 
the Archbishop made frequent requests to the Propaganda Fide for finan-
cial support for their training.51 
 
       In 1967 the nationalist government launched the Arusha Declaration, 
which delineated the policies of “Socialism and Self-Reliance” and “Social-
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ism and Rural Development” to promote people-centered development. �e 
policies advocated egalitarianism, social and spatial equalities, and communal 
life and production in settled ujamaa villages.52 By living together in ujamaa 
villages, Nyerere envisioned, people “would live and work together for the 
benefit of all.”53 Nyerere’s conviction on communal life and distribution of 
resources stemmed from his belief that “every human being is equal” and that 
“equality in human dignity and status” is vital for achieving “economic equal-
ity.”54 �e Church responded to the policy of Socialism and Self-Reliance by 
establishing Small Christian Communities (Jumuiya Ndogo Ndogo), inter-
preting Ujamaa to mean familyhood.55 Ideas of Ujamaa (familyhood) 
attracted the attention of authorities of the Church. �ey corresponded with 
the decree of Vatican II, the Pastoral Constitution on the Church in the 
Modern World (Gaudium et spes), which stressed solidarity in families, clans, 
communities and villages. Increasingly, the Church in Tanzania regarded 
both Ujamaa and Gaudium et Spes as integral to human development because 
they prioritized human dignity, development, and peace.56 

 

Catechists, Training, and Everyday Life at Ndala Catechist School: 
1948–1978 
 

       In the early decades of the twentieth century, missionaries relied on 
the formerly enslaved men and women to work as resident catechists in the 
missions. �ese people were among the slaves from various parts of the 
East African interior who had joined mission communities at the turn of 
the twentieth century. At the Catholic mission station of Ndala, Leo 
Kalenga, a former slave from the Congo, taught catechumens in prepara-
tion for baptism and confirmation.57 At the Ushirombo mission, the for-
merly-enslaved Gerado Kazoza and Matorino Mulindwa worked as cate-
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chists of the Ilyambamgongo and Namabuye villages.58 �e “resident cat-
echists” did not have formal training. �ey were few in number and were 
mostly confined to the missions and villages near the missions. Although 
resident catechists had become part of the mission community, their slave 
status lingered for the most part and considerably affected their work, as 
most of them could not command respect from the Christians.59 Despite 
the challenges rooted in slavery, early “resident catechists” were still 
regarded as “masters of the new ways” because they were closer to the alien 
missionary mode; they attended mission schools which inspired them to 
read, write, and prepare children and adults for baptism.60  
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       The number of Christians increased in the first half of the twentieth 
century, which posed a more formidable challenge to handle due to the 
limited number of missionaries in western Tanzania. For the most part, 
many village outstations that were far from the missions remained closed, 
leaving congregants stranded because missionaries could not regularly 
visit them. Because “resident catechists” were alien to the culture of the 
people in the villages, they were confined to the premises of mission sta-
tions. To meet the demands of the increasing number of Christians in 
the villages, the Catholic White Fathers found it imperative to establish 
a school (famously called Misongeni) for training catechists who would 
work in the villages as cultural brokers. The school opened in Ndala in 
1928, becoming the center for the everyday life of catechists at Ndala, 
who extended networks of friendship and support to residents of the mis-
sion as well as villagers. 
 
       �e euphoria that became a characteristic feature of the Ndala Cate-
chist School was short-lived. No sooner had it become an important force 
to reckon with the growth of Christian culture than it was closed for a 
while before the Second World War. �e school was closed as people 
abandoned villages for the fear of the war, but it was reopened immediately 
after the war in 1948. �e school admitted those who had worked as cate-
chists but needed further training. �ere was neither an age limit nor an 
entrance fee; married men with families, unmarried men, and those who 
volunteered to work as catechists could all attend the school. �e only cri-
terion was that they should have reached a standard of education sufficient 
to teach children in the village outstations, and to teach religion classes in 
primary and secondary schools.61 �e course lasted for two years and 
Kiswahili was used throughout as a medium of instruction. In the villages, 
however, catechists used both the Kiswahili and Kinyamwezi languages to 
teach children about baptism and lead prayers. �e school capped the max-
imum number of student-catechists at twenty-eight per intake to limit 
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costs. Student-catechists earned a salary, though it remained below twenty 
shillings per month. Finding the salary insufficient, catechists made fre-
quent requests for raises.62 
 
       Mission culture coupled with a tight schedule dominated the daily 
undertakings of student-catechists at Ndala. �ey attended thirty classes 
per week, of which eight classes were devoted to learning about the cate-
chism. Catechists devoted other classes to learning Bible Knowledge, 
Church history, Mathematics, Liturgy, Hygiene, Music, and the Kiswahili 
language. �ey took written examinations in all subjects at the end of each 
month.63  In addition to studying, catechists had an hour of manual labor 
each day after classes, working in the field and growing various crops. 
Every �ursday in the afternoon, they went into the bush to collect fire-
wood. Every Saturday in the afternoon, catechists were occupied with 
cleanliness and the rehearsal of songs for Sunday masses. �ey spent their 
leisure hours listening to the radio, playing cards, and playing soccer 
matches with the villagers of Ndala.64 �e range of activities in the mission 
helped catechists extend networks of friendship among themselves and 
with the villagers of Ndala through these soccer matches, as well as into the 
villages after the two-year course at the Ndala mission.65 

 
       �e mission culture integrated the wives of the student-catechists as 
part of the community in the school. Like their husbands, the time table 
and the range of activities not only shaped their lives but they also deter-
mined what they could do at the school. As part of the community, the 
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clergy ensured that wives of student-catechists attend three classes of cat-
echism every week as well as courses on home craft, cooking, and handi-
crafts. Women who had never been to school also attended classes for 
reading and writing. In this way, they formed part of the new identity of 
the literate Christian community. European missionaries at the school and 
of course during the sermons referred to the literate Christian community 
as vasomi (literate people) because they could read religious texts and write. 
Wives of student-catechists spent most of their free time on handicrafts.66 
�ese activities provided them with opportunities to establish friendships 
with women in the mission and those living in the village of Ndala, who 
were not part of the mission community. �ey also rehearsed songs with 
the men on Saturday evenings in preparation for Sunday masses. In addi-
tion to studying, wives of student-catechists also shouldered the responsi-
bility of child care.67  
 
       �e classes for wives of student-catechists were not meant to train them 
to work as catechists in villages. �is view, however, does not imply that 
women never worked as catechists. For instance, until 1930 about twelve 
women had been working as “lay catechists” in Tabora. Some joined the 
congregation of the Daughters of Mary, becoming the first lay sisters in the 
region.68 But for wives of student catechists, European missionaries 
intended to prepare them to demonstrate a model Christian family. Mis-
sionaries hoped they would provide an example of how Christian women 
should manage their domestic responsibilities, prepare food for the family 
and take care of children.69 Yet at the same time, the range of activities per-
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formed by catechists and their wives in the mission helped them to extend 
their “fictive kinship” or “networked kin” beyond their blood relations in the 
villages where they worked after the two-year course at Ndala.70 �eir mis-
sion experience further inspired catechists and their wives to build an “affec-
tive community” of Christians in the villages which was not based on family 
connections but rather on spiritual connection.71 
 
       At the end of the two-year course at Ndala, catechists and their fam-
ilies returned to the village outstations to take up their duties. In the out-
stations, catechists taught the rudiments of religion to beginners, prepared 
catechumens for baptism, and instructed all of the Christians in the vil-
lages. Other responsibilities included leading prayers on Sundays and fes-
tivals, visiting families in the villages at least once in a week, holding peri-
ods of instruction every evening, and teaching religious classes in nearby 
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schools.72 All catechists earned a minimum salary, but most catechists 
farmed to ameliorate their financial situation. Some had to leave their out-
stations and villages from time to time to take temporary jobs or to collect 
wild honey in the forests.73 
 
       Initially, the catechetical committee held that catechists should not 
necessarily go back to their natal parishes unless needed. Nonetheless, 
many catechists returned to work in their home villages which had no cat-
echists. For instance, after completing his studies, Tito Nsimbila returned 
to his village, Kaguwa, to work as a catechist; and Philipo Manyelo from 
Iyombo returned to work in his village as a catechist. Similarly, Gaspali 
Sunhwa returned to work at Puge after he completed the course.74 In all 
these areas, catechists led the people in prayer during Sunday services, pre-
pared children for baptism, and taught religion in schools. Prayers and the 
liturgy in general were in Latin and Kinyamwezi. Although catechists were 
unfamiliar with Latin, they relied on the catechism, which was written in 
Kinyamwezi. �ey occasionally used Kiswahili, as it was well-known in the 
region. By teaching children and adults, and by leading Christians to pray, 
they contributed to the growth of Christianity in their villages. In this way, 
male catechists in villages worked as “priests without ordination” and 
female catechists as “substitutes for sisters.”75 
 
       In addition to official catechists in mission and village outstations, a 
sizable number of volunteer catechists and lay Christians bought books to 
learn to read, and some catechists in villages established their own schools, 
teaching methods, and ways of obtaining pupils for instruction. Others 
volunteered to teach catechism in the missions and outstations without 
pay. �e sources do not inform the reader about volunteer catechists; the 
only clue available is that they were very few in comparison to the 
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employed catechists, commonly referred to as resident catechists, in the 
villages. Some volunteer catechists attended the Ndala School, while 
others did not attend the school but volunteered to work as catechists 
because they had attended mission schools and understood the rudiments 
of the religion. However, it is evident from sources that around Tabora, 
some people wanted to learn to read and write, and for that purpose they 
bought books from the mission and studied them by themselves. Some 
succeeded in teaching themselves how to read and write and established 
their own schools to teach pupils and adults in the villages.76 Mlewa was 
one of the catechists who established his own village school. He attended 
the Usoke Moravian mission school, acquiring knowledge there that 
increased his desire to establish his own school. �erefore he went to the 
Catholic mission at Tabora to obtain books and enrolled groups of pupils 
into his school at Usungu village.77 In 1929, at his own expense, Mlewa 
built a classroom to accommodate pupils in the village. In 1931, catechist 
Mlewa completed the first year’s instruction with 150 pupils. On visiting 
the village of Usungu, one priest reported that Mlewa’s class was “in 
progress . . . most [pupils] knew the first part of catechism and had learnt 
the prayers too.”78   
 
       �e volunteer catechists’ schools preserved an informality that permit-
ted some adaptation to the indigenous culture. �e growth of schools in 
villages that were run by volunteer catechists, including Mlewa’s school, fit 
easily into the school system of the missions. Volunteer catechists built 
classrooms at their own expense with assistance from pupils, designed writ-
ing tables to facilitate learning to read and write, and attracted both the 
young and the adults of the villages to come and learn.79 In addition to 
teaching catechism, a group of catechists trained at Ndala designed a 
simple method of reading and writing alphabets on the writing tables. 
Francis Nolan argues that they even “designed their own alphabet by 
means of which they corresponded with each other in a quite original 
script.”80 However, the absence of written records of these catechists makes 
it challenging to dig deeper into the methods of teaching and what Nolan 
regards as “new alphabets.” By virtue of such initiatives, these volunteer 
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catechists fit into the category of “peasant intellectuals” or “local intellectu-
als,” because they designed teaching aids to suit the needs of pupils and the 
milieu of village life.81 
 
       Like employed catechists, volunteer catechists in the villages assessed 
their pupils with regular examinations and tried to place their students on 
the same footing as students of employed catechists.82 In addition, volun-
teer catechists invited bishops and priests to visit them, built chapels, and 
organized Christians to construct paths to facilitate communication 
between villages and missions. Having worked for a considerable period, 
some volunteer catechists came to be considered “official mission cate-
chists,” but the majority continued to work without pay to “save the honor 
of being a mwalimu” (teacher).83 At the Mwale village outstation, which 
was located some twenty miles to the south of Tabora, no missionary vis-
ited the outstation for four years, but the volunteer catechist continued his 
classes with a sizable number of catechumens. At Igalula, to the east of 
Tabora, five volunteer catechists organized classes with catechumens from 
the village outstation.84 
 
       �e work of catechists (both volunteer and employed catechists) in vil-
lages increased the importance of schools as a means of attracting children 
and catechumens to Christianity. At Ushirombo, one diarist commented, 
“the wind is blowing towards the school; people speak only of schools; 
there is no salvation outside school,” implying a growing interest in schools 
among the Nyamwezi young men, adults, and children.85 With increasing 
interest in schooling, catechists gradually became figures of considerable 
prestige and influence in Unyamwezi. �e influence of catechists under-
mined the authority of chiefs in Unyamwezi, and, accordingly, became a 
source of contention between chiefs and catechists. On occasion, chiefs 
complained that catechists used their position to prevent their pupils from 
working for them.86 At Ndala, the catechist Anthony Nkisa led the Chris-
tians to rebel against the imposition by the chief of thirty days of forced 
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labor instead of the customary one or two days a month.87 �e movement 
against the chief of Ndala demonstrates the declining authority and influ-
ence of chiefs over the people as some missions and outstations grew to 
become centers of dissent in the region.  
 
       With the increasing number of Christians, including both volunteer 
and ‘official’ catechists working in villages, dependent outstations grew to 
become independent parishes in areas beyond Ndala parish. �e Catholic 
parish of Usongo was founded in 1930, while Kitangiri, Mwisi, and Puge 
became parishes in 1949.88 By 1950, catechists completing the training at 
Ndala worked in villages of many parishes in Unyamwezi. �ey included 
Ushirombo, Lububu, Ndala, Tabora, Kaniha, and Ngaya parishes. Other 
parishes included Kitangiri, Bulungwa, Kahama, and Usongo.89 
 
       �e work of catechists influenced other men to join the college at 
Ndala to work as catechists after completion. Joakimu Soteri is an example 
of a man who became motivated by the work of catechists and joined the 
school to work as a catechist. He began work as a catechist in 1952 and was 
heavily influenced by his brother-in-law, who was also a catechist. Soteri’s 
first outstation was at Chapela in Uyui where he worked between 1952 and 
1957 before relocating to Mabisilo. He used Kinyamwezi in worship and 
daily communication, a practice which enabled the Nyamwezi Christians 
to understand the liturgy better than the Latin version.90 Similarly, the 
lives of the wives of catechists influenced women in villages where their 
husbands worked. Village women learned from the wives of catechists the 
skills, including handicraft and reading and writing, that they had acquired 
throughout the two years of their stay at the Ndala mission.91 
 
       Apart from attracting the Nyamwezi villagers to Christianity, cate-
chists encouraged some of their sons and daughters to become teachers, 
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nuns, and priests. For example, Adelado Nkunde, a catechist who worked 
at various outstations, was a brother of another catechist and a father of 
priests. Adelado worked at the Catholic mission of Ndala while his 
brother, Benedicto Inega, served in the parishes of Lububu and Kitangiri.92 
Adelado’s sons, John Kabeya and Ambrose Mhaliga, were ordained priests 
and played important roles in shaping the course of Catholicism in 
Unyamwezi. Father Kabeya wrote a well-known history of Mirambo, 
Mtemi Mirambo, while Fr. Mhaliga composed Kinyamwezi songs for use 
in the liturgy. His songs were widely used in Unyamwezi, as they departed 
from Latin and used Kinyamwezi idioms and references to Nyamwezi cul-
ture. Several daughters of catechists attended mission schools and worked 
as teachers, while others formed the basis for the first generation of indige-
nous nuns in Unyamwezi. By the 1940s, the Society of Daughters of Mary 
(Kiswahili: Mabinti wa Maria) had incorporated twelve women into the 
congregation, some working as lay catechists and others becoming nuns. 
�e included Mama Odilia, Maria Mukola, Agnesi Balakatunga, Anna 
Nakatoto (Doto), Katharian Ifunzya, Virginia, Paulina, Magdalena, 
Getruda Shilambele, Priscila, Martha Nyamizi, and Josepha.93  
 
       �e growth of Christianity in the first half of the twentieth century 
was due in good part to the zealous works of catechists, and indeed, the 
sources are indicative of their contribution. One learns from the sources 
that catechists in the Catholic missions of Unyamwezi increased after the 
establishment of the Ndala Catechist School. By December 1966, there 
were twenty-three parishes with 464 catechists working in missions and 
village outstations.94 �e increase in the number of catechists permitted an 
increase in village outstations. Consequently, the Catholic population 
increased from 17,697 in 1948 to 27,800 in 1956.95 �e increase in the 
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number of Christians corresponded to the steady increase in the number of 
baptized Christians in postwar Tabora’s missions and village outstations. 
One learns, for instance, that the number of baptized Christians at the 
Ndala mission (including its village outstations) increased from 4,661 in 
1948 to 6,943, while the number of Christians in the Tabora mission 
increased from 1,251 to 1,948. Similarly, the number of baptized Chris-
tians in Mbulu increased from 1,614 in 1948 to 2,500 in 1956, and the 
number of Christians in Lukula increased from 1,346 to 1,680.96 Indeed, 
the expansion and growth of Christianity can be attributed to the works of 
unordained catechists whose two year-course at the Ndala Catechist 
School helped them carry the ethos of Christianity into villages beyond the 
mission stations. 
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Number of Baptized Christians in the Missions and Villages, 1948–1956 

YEAR                      1948      1949      1950      1951      1952      1953      1954      1955      1956 

Tabora                  1251     1283     1451     1300     1345     1424     1554     2179     2137 

Itaga                      2797     1500     1800     2217     2285     2290     2137     2213     2374 

Ndonno                             3500                 1600       600       675     1007       856       917 

Ndala                    4661     4864     4900     4500     4728     6023     6208     6468     6943 

Ussongo                1600     1625     1352     1380     2150     2400     1705     1799       752 

Lububu                 1320     1700       942       973     1021     1057       968     1060     1096 

Ushirombo            1089     1141     1141     1224     1306     1414     1541     1619     1470 

Bulungwa                870       785       821       958     1006     1093     1057     1127     1248 

Itamuka 

Mbulu-Kahama    1614     1806     1888     1952     2025     2100     2450     2500     2500 

Makiungu 

Ngaya                      800       840       774       800       880       998     1250       950       985 

Kipalapala                           420       420       403       400       400       368       392       402 

Kaniha                    810       934     1007     1158     1061     1135     1505     1555     1549 

Bussanda 

Lukula                   1346     1337     1385     1418     1527     1513     1453    1508     1680 

Igalula                     409       409       450       450       445       465       465       442       480 

Kitangili                                           817       905       919       874       926       853       864 

Urambo                                                                  4050     2160     1363     1245     1388 

Igumo                                                                                                                       1015 

TOTAL            17,697  22,144  18,169  21,238  25,748  26,021  25,957  26,766  27,800 



Catechesis, Religious Instruction, and Christianity in Villages: 
The 1950s–1975 
 
       Catechetical instruction dominated the daily routine of catechists in 
twentieth-century western Tanzania. In addition to leading services on 
Sundays, catechists were preoccupied with teaching catechism to youth 
and adult catechumens in preparation for baptism and confirmation. �e 
Kiswahili catechism, Katekismu Yetu (literally, Our Catechism), which had 
the imprimatur of the archbishopric, became the “proper tool for catechet-
ical instructions” across parishes and outstations.97 In teaching catechism, 
catechists made pupils (wanafunzi) recite words from the catechism to 
make them learn the text by heart before they could take an entry exami-
nation for baptism and confirmation. �en the catechists accompanied 
pupils’ recitations with answers, explanations, and analyses of the text, even 
word by word.98 To help students remember the answers of the catechism, 
catechists would sing the answers to simple tunes.99 Catechists also accom-
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panied recitation and the singing of the catechism with the copy of the 
Hadithi ya Dini (in English: �e Story of Religion), which they would read 
to students to serve “as explanations of the questions and answers in the 
Catechism.”100   
 
       Teaching catechism corresponded with religious instruction in vil-
lages. Because of the increasing number of pupils aspiring to become 
Christians, catechists found it imperative to extend the scope of religious 
instruction beyond the milieu of village outstations to government schools 
(primary schools) in the villages. Some lay teachers joined hands with the 
catechists as they volunteered to teach religion in schools and colleges. �e 
work of Pamphil Chubwa and Mwalimu S. Sadiki (a Muslim who had 
converted to Catholicism) as volunteer teachers of religion classes at the 
Tabora Teachers College and Uyui Secondary School leaves no doubt that 
a considerable number of lay Christians taught religion in schools and col-
leges on their own volition.101  
 
       Catechists and “volunteer” teachers covered several topics, including life, 
work, and leisure in a changing society, as well as justice, service, and loyalty 
to the society. �ese topics aimed to help pupils “deepen the meaning of 
their Christian life” and to be a guide to the “orientation of their lives” in the 
Church and in society at large.102 In due course, vocation clubs in villages, 
which were under the patronage of catechists, provided pupils with a useful 
platform to dig deeper into their Christian faith. Vocation clubs became 
important facets of refashioning Catholicism in twentieth-century western 
Tanzania because they prepared students for major seminary after their sec-
ondary education. In so doing, they laid the basis for the consolidation of 
African clergy and successive generations of catechists in villages.103  
 
       �e diocesan catechetical committee designed correspondence courses 
to ensure effective religious instruction in the villages (masomo kwa njia ya 
barua). �e committee designed the course as part of distance learning so 
that catechists would improve the learning and teaching of religion in vil-
lage primary schools. �e course designers drew questions from the Bible, 
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reflecting the liturgical year, for catechists to deepen their faith and 
“enhance learning and thinking about religion” (kujifunza na kufikiri juu ya 
dini).104 �at the committee expected the course to broaden catechists’ 
thoughts about religion seems to suggest that it had envisioned building an 
independent literate community (vasomi ) of catechists in the villages who 
could help adherents to read and interpret scriptures. Catechists could read 
and respond to the questions, and then the responses would be mailed to 
the diocesan catechetical committee for feedback. Initially, the committee 
proposed that catechists cover the costs for the course pack, but because life 
in the villages was becoming increasingly unsustainable, many could not 
afford a regular subscription. Hence, the parishes of the villages in which 
the catechists worked paid the cost for the course pack and postage.105  
 
       Catechetical training was not an easy ride, as several circumstances in 
the villages brought the program to a virtual halt. While the correspondence 
course seemed ideal in shaping the nature and character of Christianity in 
twentieth-century western Tanzania, it was confronted by a number of 
problems. No sooner had the correspondence course been introduced than 
it fell out of favor among the catechists in the villages. Parish priests had 
little interest in the course, and, subsequently, “few catechists bothered to 
answer the questions.”106 �e diminishing interest among the clergy and 
catechists meant that the culture of independent reading and interpretation 
of the scripture was inevitably doomed to collapse like a house of cards. Fur-
ther, the presence of many outstations meant that catechists would turn in 
as many responses as possible, causing difficulties in grading the papers and 
conveying payment to the priests entrusted with the task. �ese two prob-
lems, commented Fr. L. Saint-Pierre, who was working as director of the 
archdiocesan catechetical committee, “would probably be big enough to kill 
the project before it was born.”107 Apparently, the course seems to suggest 
that its existence was dependent on the personal initiatives of the founding 
director, Fr. L. Saint-Pierre. It is no wonder the course stopped when his 
tenure came to an end.108 
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       Furthermore, books and methods of catechetical instructions across 
western Tanzania varied from one place to another depending on cate-
chists’ modes of teaching. �e lack of a single text to be used across the 
entire archdiocese of Tabora culminated in differences in understanding 
and approaches to religion among catechists and students in the village pri-
mary schools. �e report on the progress of catechesis for the year 1950 
suggests a lack of common methods of instruction across the village out-
stations of the Ushirombo, Ndala, Kahama, Usongo, Tabora and Lukula 
missions.109 While some missions insisted that catechists rely on Mungu 
wa Wanadamu (People’s God) as a standard text for catechism classes in 
missions and villages, some missions, on the other hand, placed the 
emphasis on Katekismu ya Kiswahili Tanganyika (Tanganyika’s Swahili 
Catechism).110 Despite the differences in texts, catechists relied on recita-
tion of texts coupled with explanations as a method of instruction. Never-
theless, Fr. J. B. Cuierrier—a member of the catechetical committee and 
parish priest of Usongo—objected to this method as simply “soul-killing, 
ineffective, not pedagogical and boring.”111 His rhetorical questions were: 
How can a Mnyamwezi love to attend such lessons? and, How can he be inter-
ested? �e situation seems to suggest that learning the catechism by heart 
was not wholeheartedly supported by the clergy as a proper method of 
instruction because it deprived pupils and catechumens of independent 
reading and interpretation of texts. Consequently, the Nyamwezi learned 
by heart the answers of the catechism in preparation for the examination 
without knowing the meaning of the words. �is method, to reiterate Fr. 
Cuierrier’s remark, seemed “useless.”112  
 
      Adding to the difficulty, most catechists seemed unfit for teaching 
pupils in primary schools. Of course, the majority were “not up to stan-
dard” because they had insufficient education to tackle the subject matter. 
Hence, many catechists presented a serious objection to teaching Grade 
Six and Grade Seven because “it was difficult to teach those classes.”113 
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Initially, the catechetical committee succeeded in instituting the 
refresher course, but the better-trained catechists it was meant to provide 
did not materialize, because it could not “make up for brains” and the 
only solution to the problem was to transfer an “inefficient” catechist and 
“bring a new and better one on the spot.”114 Head teachers of various pri-
mary schools in villages complained to the parish priests that catechists 
were lazy and often missed classes or arrived too late to attend to their 
pupils. For that reason, some head teachers refused to give more religion 
classes for the fear that pupils would not be taught. Nevertheless, the 
complaints against catechists’ inefficiency were built on false premises, as 
they did not take into account the real situation in the villages. In fact, 
some catechists objected to teaching those classes (especially Grades Six 
and Seven) which required more time to prepare the lesson plan, because 
they taught more than twenty classes in schools located far away. The 
distance to the school often impeded catechists’ efficiency, sometimes 
leading to missed classes.115 
 
       �e last, but by no means least, challenge concerned the syllabus of 
catechetical instruction. Catechists used the syllabi developed between 
1950 and 1971, which of course left a lot to be desired. For instance, the 
Gaba Pastoral Institute in Kenya developed one syllabus, which was 
famously called Gaba Syllabus (Mtaala wa Gaba). It had three obvious 
major weaknesses based on content, method, and concepts. Fr. B. 
O’Rourk, one of the members of the catechetical committee, summarized 
the weaknesses as follows:  
 
       For content, Fr. O’Rourk said that the entire syllabus appeared to be 
western-oriented, ignoring African orientations. �e emphasis was put on 
the “wrong points” because the syllabus writers paid no attention to the 
personality and the community aspects of the lives of the students. In this 
case, said Fr. O’Rourk, “religion was authoritarian.”116 As for method, the 
syllabus rendered students incapable of talking and discovering things for 

                                                                SALVATORY S. NYANTO                                                       591

[Meeting on the Catechetical Committee], Tabora, April 21, 1970, stored in Tabora Town, 
AAT, Box 325, fol. 200. 
        114. Fr. L. Saint-Pierre to Archbishop Marko Mihayo, Kahama, March 26, 1967, 
stored in Tabora Town, AAT, Box 325, fol. 200. 
        115. Fr. Saint-Pierre, Kahama, to Archbishop Marko Mihayo, March 26, 1967, stored 
in Tabora Town, AAT, Box 325, fol. 200; and Kamati ya Mafundisho [catechetical commit-
tee], Tabora, April 21, 1970, stored in Tabora Town, AAT, Box 325, fol. 200. 
        116. Mkutano wa Walimu Wafundishao Dini katika Shule za Sekondari za hapa 
Tabora [Meeting for teachers of religion in Secondary Schools, Tabora], March 4, 1974, 
stored in Tabora Town, AAT, Box 325, fol. 200. 



themselves. �e syllabus was designed to enable students to pass the exam-
inations, not to inculcate them with ingenuity and the ability to do inde-
pendent interpretation of texts. With regard to concepts, the ideas in the 
syllabus were “very intellectual and not [about] life.” �e teachers’ notes 
seemed to be mechanical as they did not relate to the students’ lives, and, 
above all, the language “was not well understood” by the catechists, the 
majority of whom had only basic education.117 

 

Sustaining Catechists: Contestations, Ruptures, and Dissent in 
Catholic Missions: The 1950s–1975 
 
       �e work of catechists (through both catechesis and religious instruc-
tion in schools) leaves no doubt that by the mid-twentieth century, Chris-
tianity in Unyamwezi had established itself in villages beyond the mission 
stations. �e phenomenal expansion of Christianity and the enormous 
increase in the number of Christians was associated with the passionate 
efforts of catechists working in the villages. Christians in some village out-
stations which were peripheral to the mission stations rarely saw priests. 
�e villagers’ interaction with catechists through Sunday services, teaching, 
and learning earned catechists a commendable reputation as “teachers” and 
“masters of new ways” (reading and learning) in villages.118 While the work 
of catechists in establishing Christianity became an important force with 
which to reckon in the development of Christianity, life in the villages pre-
sented a formidable challenge to their attempts to meet familial and reli-
gious obligations. Teaching catechumens and children, leading believers 
on Sunday prayers and services, and visiting the sick and the Christians of 
the villages dominated the day-to-day undertakings of catechists, in addi-
tion to shouldering their familial responsibilities.119 
 
       While all catechists performed similar tasks (catechetical instruction, 
singing, and leading congregants on Sundays), differences between them in 
the monthly salaries and remunerations (posho) indicated unequal treat-
ment and divisions, and led to decreased morale of catechists in the vil-
lages. In some missions’ village outstations, catechists earned one hundred 
shillings per month, while others received seventy, twenty, or as low as 
twelve shillings. In other missions, catechists earned thirty, twenty, and 
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twelve shillings.120 Church authorities attributed the differences in cate-
chists’ salaries and remunerations to “hard work and zealous efforts” in 
teaching, singing, prayer, and an increased number of students attending 
religious instruction.121 �ese discrepancies, nevertheless, created an apple 
of discord between catechists and church authorities that discouraged a 
great deal of the catechists’ work in the villages. Differences in payment 
further increased discontentment and grudges among catechists, who 
could not see a “clear cut between their responsibilities and hard work.”122 
 
       Persistent complaints of unfair treatment and life challenges in the vil-
lages encouraged the catechists of Tabora, Upuge, and Ndono to call upon 
church authorities for an increase in salary and posho. Catechists from 
nearly all the village outstations of the three mission stations held a meet-
ing at Ndonno to discuss their work as catechists and the “real situation” 
in villages that “put their lives at risk.”123 �e pre-existing culture of friend-
ship, collegiality, and support established at the Ndala Catechist School 
helped catechists forge the necessary unity to share common experiences of 
their lives in the villages and to express their resentments against church 
authority. Networks of friendship and support continued in their post-
Ndala School lives, manifesting in regular communication, visits, and the 
sharing of personal experiences in working in the village outstations.124 In 
no time, catechists working in the village outstations of the Tabora, 
Upuge, and Ndonno missions united their efforts to bring to prominence 
the “subaltern voices,” using the letter of complaints as the “weapon of the 
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weak” against the dominant discourse of “hard work” and “salaries” 
imposed on them by church authorities.125  
 
       �e range of networks created at the Ndala School inspired catechists 
in other mission stations to mount their own rebellions against the clergy. 
At the Ndala mission, catechists held a meeting to discuss their dis-
gruntling lives in the villages, and subsequently submitted their resolutions 
to the Archbishop. �ey accused the bishop of having “forsaken them” and 
stated that “[catechists] were no longer servants of the bishop nor priests 
. . . they were free to live without interference.”126 Catechists further empha-
sized that “the priest would take his food to the village outstation” and that 
“no woman would be allowed to cook for the priest unless he paid 5 shillings 
for each day.”127 As for salary adjustments, catechists emphatically made it 
known to the bishop that “we would assess the amount we want to be paid” 
(tutapima kiasi tunachotaka kulipwa), implying salary raises would be subject 
to negotiations between catechists and church authority.128 
 
       Dissent snowballed in the village outstations of the Kahama mission 
station as catechists opposed church authority. �ey called for priests to 
gather and teach congregants “without assistance from catechists in vil-
lages.”129 At the Igalula outstation, the catechist-in-chief called for 
“democracy” for catechists to decide and do whatever they wished without 
priests’ interference.130 �at catechists had no democracy suggests that they 
were duty-bound to abide by the Church’s authority in exercising pastoral 
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works in villages. It also suggests asymmetrical relations that inevitably rel-
egated catechists to the edges of the Church’s hierarchy. Relations of this 
sort, coupled with a tight schedule, discipline and manual occupation in 
the missions and village outstations, culminated in the catechists’ com-
plaints that “they were being treated like schoolboys.”131 
 
       Catechists’ opposition to unequal treatment halted a great deal of the 
progress of Christianity in the villages. Many catechists felt offended, and 
therefore surrendered the good pastoral work in the villages and resorted 
to labor migration to towns, mining centers, and coastal plantations that 
provided men with avenues to earn the cash necessary to regain respectabil-
ity back in Unyamwezi.132 At the Ushetu mission, three catechists lost their 
hearts for the job. One catechist working in the outstation surrendered the 
work for good and left for the Mwadui gold mine (Williamson’s gold 
mine) in search of a decent job to sustain his family. Another catechist at 
Sikonge also decided to give up the job, and no one volunteered to replace 
him.133 �e fact that there was no replacement suggests that the villagers 
were aware of the hardships of the catechists, such that the younger gen-
eration did not dare to venture into the job. Although the available primary 
sources do not inform the reader about the fate of the Sikonge outstation 
after the departure of the catechist, it is clear that his absence persisted for 
some time until the situation turned to normalcy. It is also plausible that 
the networks the catechists had built at the Ndala school helped them 
communicate the message of their discontentment to the villagers, who 
found it reasonable not to let their youth become catechists.134  
 
       Catechists’ secession from pastoral work had noticeable implications 
for the growth of Christianity in Unyamwezi as the religious progression of 
believers, children and catechumens in the villages who had been attending 
religious instruction came to a standstill with no catechists. At Ndala, dis-
senting catechists affected the turnover of the catechetical school because 
they discouraged aspiring young men from joining it. Fr. J. B. Cuierrier, 
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working at the Ndala Catechetical School, complained that within only five 
days of his appointment, problems had already resurfaced. Fr. Cuierrier 
grumbled that “[he] had no students . . . only seven had applied.”135 He 
toured to other parishes looking for students but hardly got one. Young 
men desired to live a decent life and asked for a salary when Cuierrier 
approached them with offers to join the Ndala Catechetical School.136 He 
resorted to traveling to Kahama—an area that is peripheral to Ndala—with 
hopes of getting students, but his efforts yielded no substantial results. Cat-
echists’ dissenting voices against church authority in Kahama accounted for 
the declining interest among the youth to join the catechetical school. It 
also seems plausible to suggest that the catechists’ resolutions against 
inequality and unfair treatment among them, reached in the meeting of 
Kahama, had a bearing on Cuierrier’s disappointing results in the area.137 
 
       �e diminishing number of student-catechists at the Ndala School 
and catechists’ resignations in the villages called for the clergy to reconsider 
the payment of a monthly salary as a strategy for supporting catechists in 
the villages. Nevertheless, the decision to subsidize catechists divided the 
clergy in Unyamwezi. �e White Fathers believed that catechists should be 
paid salaries and other remunerations by donations from Europe because 
of their tight schedule in the villages. �e White Fathers’ insistence on 
subsidizing catechists encouraged a few mission stations of Ndala, Itaga, 
Tabora and Mbulu (Kahama) to pay catechists a salary.138 Conversely, 
Nyamwezi priests held the principium of self-reliance. �ey held a strong 
conviction that catechists should not be overworked like “slaves”; instead, 
“they should be taught to become self-reliant” by cultivating fields allo-
cated to them in villages.139 In so doing, Nyamwezi priests objected to an 
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idea of favoring some catechists, as benefactors as favoritism “aroused ter-
rific envy among the rest . . . [and would] cause harm to the parish[es].”140 
�e emphasis by Nyamwezi priests that catechists should be encouraged to 
become self-reliant corresponded to the 1960s ideals of ujamaa, villagiza-
tion, and rural development initiatives that filtered into rural Unyamwezi, 
calling for people to “stop begging” and instead work hard to build a 
“socialist Tanzania through [their] own sweat.”141 
 
       �ese divisions between the White Fathers and Nyamwezi clergy on 
sustaining catechists provided no lasting solution to the problem. Cate-
chists left for good, leaving village outstations unattended. �e increasing 
cases of catechists migrating to towns and elsewhere called for the 
Church’s authorities to address the problem. Ultimately, Archbishop 
Mihayo of Tabora suggested that priests adopt the Moravian model of 
monthly remunerations (posho) to evangelists, drawn from monthly tithes 
(zaka) and other contributions.142 Although the Moravian model of 
financing evangelists appealed to the Archbishop as a strategy for the dis-
senting catechists, he admitted that they would not succeed by using tithes 
and other contributions because “paying tithe[s] was not an obligation fol-
lowed by punishment to those who failed to pay (luduko). It was paid on a 
person’s volition.”143 Furthermore, agriculture depended on reliable rain-
fall, and consequently so did tithe contributions. �us, the Archbishop 
insisted that making tithe contributions a monthly obligation “would cause 
apathy, dissidence, and tension among Catholics.”144 Eventually, the 
Archbishop preferred remunerations (posho) to monthly salary for cate-
chists who had demonstrated efforts in their work and “presents” to cate-
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chists whom the Archbishop marked as “ordinary catechists.”145 While the 
bishop’s categorization of catechists seemed an ideal method of curtailing 
the problem, it reinstated binaries and hatred between the clergy and cat-
echists. It discouraged a great deal of the work of catechists in the villages 
as the majority received only occasional presents, which had less financial 
impact on their lives. 
 

Conclusion: Catechists as Carriers of Christian Culture in 
Western Tanzania 
 
       �e growth of Christianity in the many villages of western Tanzania 
was largely due to the zealous works of catechists. �e evidence presented 
in this paper indicates their immeasurable contribution to shaping the 
course of Christianity in twentieth-century western Tanzania, and pro-
vides a rebuttal to the scholarly expositions that have nudged aside their 
place in mission and church histories as simply “examples of successful 
mission work.”146 �is paper challenges received wisdom on evangelization 
as a triumph of missionaries, a view which ignores the work of the cate-
chists and volunteer teachers who worked in villages far removed from the 
mission stations. �e limited number of clergy in western Tanzania leaves 
no doubt that the bulk of the evangelization and consequent establishment 
of Christianity rested on the shoulders of catechists. In so doing, catechists 
became, to echo Msgr. H. Goertz’s remark, “priests without ordination” 
and wives of catechists “substitutes for Sisters,” implying that their works 
paralleled that of priests and religious except that they were not ordained 
to the priesthood or part of an order.147 �eir agency in the evangelization 
was apparent in the translation of texts, catechetical instruction, leading 
services on Sundays, and maintaining an “affective community” of congre-
gants based on village and spiritual experience.148 
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       Mission stations in western Tanzania often functioned as centers of 
Christian culture. Due to the small number of missionaries, many villages 
remained isolated from the new culture. Catechists took the ethos of the 
missions to the villages and added to them their cultural and intellectual 
creativity. In the end, they became “carriers of Christian culture” in villages 
whose missionary influence was almost negligible.149 In many villages of 
western Tanzania which rarely received priests, the growth of Christianity 
depended on the activities of African catechists (men and women) and 
teachers. �eir life in the villages became a model for Christian families. As 
masters of new ways, catechists administered catechesis, led the congrega-
tion on Sunday services, and translated religious texts into the indigenous 
languages using the knowledge they had acquired at the Ndala Catechetical 
School. �e increasing number of Christians following the mushrooming of 
village outstations in twentieth-century western Tanzania was largely 
attributable to the intellectual and cultural creativity of catechists in incul-
cating Christians to the basic tenets of the new religion. Nevertheless, divi-
sions between catechists, coupled with the instabilities of life in the villages, 
prompted them to mount a rebellion against church authority. Dissent 
among catechists was indicative of the struggle for equality and recognition 
of their work in the villages. �e use of overt and covert strategies in push-
ing for claims of remuneration to meet familial obligations in the missions 
and village outstations of western Tanzania were also suggestive of what 
Jonathon Glassman has argued as “consciousness fashioned out of frag-
ments of the hegemonic ideologies which they had found at hand.”150  
 
       In 1978, the Church marked the hundredth anniversary of evangeliza-
tion in Unyamwezi. �e then-Archbishop of Tabora, Marko (alias 
Marcus) Mihayo and Father Francis Nolan, W.F., issued two publications 
in Kiswahili and English that recorded the achievements of the White 
Fathers, White Sisters and the catechists of Ndala to the growth and con-
solidation of Christianity.151 Nevertheless, existing works on the mission-
ary enterprise in western Tanzania ignore the fact that, what with the lim-
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ited number of White Fathers, White Sisters, and African clergy working 
in the missions, the successes of Christianity in villages beyond the mis-
sions were largely attributable to the zeal and determination of catechists 
and their wives. 
 
       In commemorating the centenary celebrations, the church authority 
organized a retreat for catechists across western Tanzania to reflect on their 
future work in the villages. �e church authority had reverence for catechists 
because their work, beginning in the years of leading congregants and 
administering catechesis, made each catechist “chief in his outstation, advi-
sor to Christians, and an advocate of a priest” in the village outstations.152 
�e church authorities also called catechists to look ahead to the coming 
years of evangelization, urging each catechist to consider himself as “a ser-
vant of all in the village” (mtumishi wa wote kijijini) and stating that “Chris-
tians will respect the catechists because of the knowledge obtained at 
Ndala.”153 To maintain his reputation among the villagers and to promote 
successful evangelization, insisted the church authorities, a catechist ought 
to abstain from drinking beer, and instead he was duty-bound to demon-
strate exemplary character “to attract more people to Christian faith.”154
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GENERAL 
 
A Blessing to Each Other: A New Account of Jewish and Christian Relations. By 

Rebecca Moore. (New York: �e Crossroad Publishing Company. 2021. Pp. 
v, 300. $34:95 paperback. ISBN-13: 978-0-8245-9500-5.) 

 
        Rebecca Moore’s book, A Blessing to Each Other: A New Account of Jewish and 
Christian Relations, is a refreshing read because it offers a beacon of hope in a reli-
giously and racially divided world. It is a fiftieth-anniversary response to Pope John 
Paul II’s prophetic statement on the heroic acts of Jews as they resisted the Nazi 
invasion in Warsaw, Poland, during World War II. He stated, “As Christians and 
Jews, following the example of the faith of Abraham, we are called to be a blessing to 
the world” (p. 205). Moore’s book responds to this prophetic call by refashioning the 
dominant theological “master narrative” of Jewish Christian relations, which until 
now has unfortunately been focused heavily on animosity, conflict, contention, and 
discrimination (pp. 3, 6). Moore’s book emphasizes the importance of understand-
ing “that religious commitments” are not “firm and fixed” but rather are part of a 
“dynamic process” (p. 68). She contends that this hostile narrative “is incomplete 
and even inaccurate” (p. 4). Her analysis evaluates the sacred texts in both religious 
traditions as either a “bridge” or a “barrier” (p. 33).  She believes that if a “bridge” is 
to occur, the historical evidence of these “barriers” between Jews and Christians 
needs to be looked “in a fresh [new] way” (p. 7). �us, it is critical to contextualize 
specific times and places because of the complex relationship between the two tra-
ditions (pp. 4, 77, 79). Moore emphasizes that it wasn’t “until the late fourth cen-
tury” that these negative “barriers” were created (p. 67). Her book is distinctive 
because she broadens this dominant narrative by documenting a rich history of bib-
lical and non-biblical evidence, both “material” and “social,” that testifies to 
“bridges” of on-going trust, partnership, mutual respect, collegiality, and apprecia-
tion of Jews and Christians working together for a common cause (pp. 2, 207–208).  
 
       She brings fresh eyes to the methodological approaches of sociologist Lori 
Beaman and French philosopher Jacques Derrida, and sees a “history of tolerance 
and friendship” between Jews and Christians (pp. 7, 209). Beaman’s focus on “deep 
equality” emphasizes a recognition and acceptance of similarities and differences, 
while Derrida’s concept of “living well together” reflects the qualities necessary for 
the reciprocity of this complex relationship (p. 7).  
 
       To substantiate her claims, Moore documents concrete examples from the 
past as well as the present. Some examples of “deep equality” are Jewish and Chris-
tian biblical scholars engaged in interreligious dialogue (p. 83); Jews and Christians 
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equally helping Jews during and after World War II (pp. 121, 137–138); and 
Christian Churches acknowledging, and rectifying, antisemitism in liturgy and 
evangelization practices (pp. 151–152).  
 
       Moore’s book is an ambitious endeavor that could only have been successfully 
done by a scholar well-versed in biblical, Christian, and Jewish history. Her work 
is scholarly, comprehensive, substantiated with concrete evidence, and readily avail-
able to academics and non-academics alike (pp. 12–13). �is book is an extremely 
helpful resource for Christian and Jewish religious pastoral leaders, theological aca-
demics, and educators.  
 
        A Blessing to Each Other is inspirational, as it documents a litany of courageous 
Jews and Christians who are healing our imperfect world. In Judaism, the phrase is 
tikkun olam, i.e., “the Jewish commitment to repairing the world” (p. 2). �e ques-
tion is whether each one of us can be a blessing in this healing and repairing 
process.  
 
California State University, Los Angeles THERESA A. YUGAR 

 
MEDIEVAL 

 
�e Destruction and Recovery of Monte Cassino, 529–1964. By Kriston R. Rennie. 

(Amsterdam: Amsterdam University Press. 2021. pp. 246. €99. ISBN: 
9789463729130.) 

 
        �e monks of Monte Cassino have always, both in the Middle Ages and more 
recently, seen their monastery as the fons et origo of western monasticism. If it was not 
the first monastic house to be founded in the west, then as the abbey of St. Benedict 
it was the source of the Rule which became almost universal in western Christendom 
from the Carolingian era onwards and the model for all other monasteries. �is stance 
was validated, in their eyes, by a long and unbroken tradition of monastic observance 
from the sixth century onwards and by their custody of the relics of Benedict, the 
symbol of their pre-eminent role. Yet, as Kriston Rennie points out, the Cassinese 
monastic tradition rests on shaky foundations, and is to some extent anyway a myth, 
or at least a “constructed identity.” He demonstrates this by examining one of the key 
aspects of the Cassinese tradition, the theme of destruction and renewal, first fully 
enunciated by the author of the abbey’s chronicle, Leo Marsicanus, at the end of the 
eleventh century, but repeated and developed by its later historians, into our own 
times. �us the original monastery had been destroyed by the Lombards c. 580, 
rebuilt c. 717, sacked by Muslim raiders in 883, restored once more after 950, and 
then almost entirely rebuilt by Desiderius after 1066. Subsequently the monastery was 
laid low by earthquake in 1349, and finally destroyed by Allied bombers in February 
1944. Its rebuilding after the war was viewed as the restoration, not just of a 
monastery or even a cultural monument, but as a symbol of the restoration of peace 
and western civilization. And when the abbey church was reconsecrated in 1964, Pope 
Paul VI declared St. Benedict to be the “patron and protector” of Europe. 
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       Rennie is particularly good on the problems with this story in the early Middle 
Ages. Even assuming that we can rely on the account of Benedict by Gregory the 
Great—which was written almost fifty years after the saint’s death by one who had 
no personal knowledge of him—the tradition that after c. 580 the monastic com-
munity continued in exile, having with it as a guide and inspiration the autograph 
manuscript of the Rule, is unproven and improbable. Paul the Deacon’s account of 
the refoundation in the early eighth century made no mention of the exiled com-
munity at Rome, and implied that this was actually a new beginning. It was Paul, 
too, who referred to the alleged transfer of Benedict’s relics to the French 
monastery at Fleury, which Rennie suggests is considerably better authenticated 
than the Cassinese tradition that they remained in situ, to be rediscovered during 
the rebuilding of 1066–and rediscovered again on several later occasions, the last in 
1950. But the theme of destruction and dogged recovery, while the community 
maintained the tradition, even in exile, and guarded the relics of the saint on their 
original site, is central to Cassinese self-perception, only reinforced by the rebuild-
ing of the abbey just as it had been pre-war after 1945.  
 
       This theme is intelligently developed, and this book should surely be 
required reading for all those interested in the history of this great and historic 
monastery, and monasticism generally. There are, however, some flaws in this 
account. The most serious concerns the authorship of the abbey’s chronicle, 
begun by Leo and concluded by Peter the Deacon in 1138. Contrary to what is 
suggested here, Peter wrote only a small part of the continuation to Leo’s work 
(even though he claimed mendaciously to have written all of it), and at times 
Rennie ascribes comments to Peter which were actually made by Leo himself. 
Here the author’s generally sure touch and wide reading seem for once to have 
failed him. He also perhaps devotes too much space to the symbolic rhetoric that 
accompanied the modern restoration, compared with earlier periods–one would 
like, for example, to have had some discussion of the late seventeenthcentury 
rebuilding of the main abbey church. But this is still a thoughtful book from 
which readers will profit. 
 
University of Leeds GRAHAM A. LOUD 
 
Free Will and the Rebel Angels in Medieval Philosophy. By Tobias Hoffmann. (Cam-

bridge: Cambridge University Press. 2020. Pp. 292. $99.99 hardback: ISBN: 
9781107155381; $32.99 paperback: ISBN: 9781316652886.) 

 
       Tobias Hoffmann’s recent monograph brings together several strands in his 
work—on moral evil, the freedom of the will, and theories of angelic sin in 
medieval philosophy—with which he has been engaged for more than two decades. 
Professor of Medieval Philosophy at the Sorbonne, Hoffmann focuses in his ency-
clopedic monograph on the transformative period in the Latin West between the 
1220s and the 1320s, although it also contains illuminating discussions on the 
background to these debates in such ancient sources as Aristotle, Augustine, and 
Pseudo-Dionysius.  
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       Hoffmann’s monograph is organized into three parts. Part I treats the issue of 
free will as it evolved from the period before the reintroduction of Aristotle into the 
West in the mid-twelfth century to his reception afterwards. Prior to this reintro-
duction, major Christian authorities such as Anselm of Canterbury, Bernard of 
Clairvaux, and Peter Lombard tended to unproblematically assume the existence of 
free will—understood as control over one’s acts—although they tended to couch 
their discussions in terms of “free decision” (liberum arbitrium). However, after 
Aristotle’s reintroduction into the West, which was a “game changer” (p. 22) 
according to Hoffmann, a “psychological turn” (p. 2) took place according to which 
Aristotle’s more refined theories of moral psychology came to influence discussions 
about the respective roles of intellect and will in the production of free human acts. 
�e thinkers of the period, such as �omas Aquinas, Siger of Brabant, and Godfrey 
of Fontaines, who tended to explain “free agency mainly with reference to the intel-
lect,” Hoffman calls, following convention, “intellectualists,” while those, such as 
Henry of Ghent, John Duns Scotus, and Peter Olivi, who explained “free agency 
mainly with reference to the will,” he labels “voluntarists” (p. 5). Other thinkers, 
such as Giles of Rome and John of Murrovalle, Hoffmann characterizes as holding 
“intermediary” positions between these two poles. Part I, in short, is a detailed and 
informative overview of the development of the debate between these three camps 
as they grappled with how to reconcile the intelligibility of choice with the freedom 
of the will. 
 
        In Part 2, Hoffman treats the issue of the origin of moral evil, which is to 
say, of the dilemma of how it was possible for evil to enter a world that is good 
since it was created by God. Otherwise put, it treats of the first sin of the devil 
(and the other “rebel angels” who followed him) in Augustine and Pseudo-
Dionysius. Why is this question of more than simply theological interest? 
Because the “sin of the angels highlights in a special way the problem of the 
origin of moral evil, but the problem itself applies more broadly to the cause of 
an evil will in a good person . . .” (p. 163). Discussions surrounding the origin of 
moral evil, in other words, tell us something about the nature of evil itself, which 
makes it equally applicable to human beings, and therefore to philosophy as well, 
as Hoffmann convincingly shows. 
 
       What, then, was the initial cause of angelic sin? It had to have been the result 
of a free choice of the will on the part of Lucifer. But here we are confronted with 
a dilemma: the cause of evil must be either a good will or an evil will. Obviously, it 
cannot be the former, but neither can it be the latter, since, although an evil will 
can certainly cause evil, it cannot have been the original cause of evil. Augustine 
concluded that a disordered will ultimately had no explanation. As for Pseudo-
Dionysius, he fundamentally agreed with Augustine on this subject, although he 
argued that, in addition to lacking an efficient cause, neither can evil function as a 
final cause. �e remainder of Part 2 is taken up with subsequent efforts by such 
thinkers as Aquinas, Henry of Ghent, Scotus, and John of Pouilly to resolve, albeit 
in different ways, Augustine’s dilemma. Unfortunately, in their efforts to do so, 
most attributed the origins of evil to something good: the created will. Ironically, 
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according to Hoffman, they ended up in the same place as Augustine: forced to 
admit “that the cause of evil is deficient, that is, that there is no ultimate explana-
tion for why someone does evil” (p. 195).  
 
       Finally, Part 3 investigates angelic sin in the context of the respective roles 
that intellect and will play in the production of disordered choices, which is an 
important question, for when “it comes to the angels, the question is not only how 
a good person can do evil for the first time, but also how someone can do so while 
acting under ideal psychological conditions” (p. 199). As with the question of 
human freedom, then, attempts to explain angelic sin come, for Hoffmann, in three 
varieties: intellectualist accounts, voluntarist accounts, and intermediary accounts. 
According to intellectualists, the will always follows what the intellect determines 
to be best. In instances where cognitive deficiency is a possibility, as with humans, 
who are fallible, evil choices can ultimately be traced back to ignorance or negli-
gence. But how can this occur where cognitive deficiency is impossible, as in the 
case of angels, who are supremely intelligent and indeed infallible prior to making 
their first disordered choice? �e task for the intellectualists of the period, such as 
Aquinas and Godfrey, was to find a solution to this problem. For voluntarists such 
as John Peckham, Henry of Ghent, and others, by contrast, an evil will does not 
follow from, but rather precedes and therefore causes the deficiency or darkening of 
the intellect. �eir principal challenge was, as Hoffmann puts it, “to give a plausible 
account of how the evil angels’ choice could be intentional, and hence not an irra-
tional act” (p. 219). Again, this section is of more than mere theological interest 
because examples of angelic sin also tend to shed light on the question of human 
freedom insofar as they act as test cases for the plausibility or “robustness” (p. 3) of 
their overall theories of free will.  
 
       Tobias Hoffmann’s Free Will and the Rebel Angels in Medieval Philosophy is a 
model of clarity and erudition that will profit students at all levels who are inter-
ested in medieval moral psychology and its various developments from antiquity to 
the later Middle Ages. �e relevant debates are intricate and oftentimes complex 
and challenging, even for specialists. It is to Hoffmann’s great credit that he is able 
to explain them in language that is accessible to the general reader. Treating as it 
does the not insubstantial topics of free will, sin, and evil in one of the most inter-
esting and fruitful periods in the history of philosophy, Hoffmann’s monograph is 
a very useful one indeed for anyone interested in the history of ideas. 
 
U niversity of Guelph PETER EARDLEY 
 
Le bureau des âmes. Écritures et pratiques administratives de la Pénitencerie apostolique 

(XIIIe-XIVe siècle). By Arnaud Fossier. [Bibliothèque des Écoles Françaises 
d’Athèthes et de Rome, fasc. 378.] (Rome: École Française de Rome. 2018. 
Pp. xvi, 617. €39,00. ISBN 978-2-7283-1286-3.) 

 
       �e papal (now apostolic) penitentiary was one of the major departments of 
the late medieval Roman Curia. It granted absolution of sins in cases reserved to 
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the pope, and other graces that were also a papal monopoly, notably certain dispen-
sations. Recent research on this office has concentrated on its late medieval regis-
ters, comprising successful petitions for these favors. Arnaud Fossier takes a differ-
ent approach, focussing on the office’s thirteenth- and fourteenth-century 
formularies, which predate its registers and thus supply evidence of its early organ-
ization and activity. Fossier’s book complements and updates Emil Göller’s Die 
päpstliche Pönitentiarie von ihrem Ursprung bis zu ihrer Umgestaltung unter Pius V., 
still the standard history of the office to 1569, though published in 1907–11 and at 
a time when the registers were unavailable to researchers. Fossier has the advantage 
of drawing on recent studies of the registers and the evidence of the first extant reg-
ister (1410–11). 
 
       Chapters 1 and 2 trace the origins and evolution of the office from c. 1200 
down to this first register. Its personnel and their careers receive close attention, 
notably the cardinal or major penitentiary in charge of the eponymous office and 
the minor penitentiaries subordinate to him by the mid-thirteenth century. More 
might be said here, however, about the proctors who increasingly represented peti-
tioners before the office. Chapter 3 provides a useful survey of the formularies con-
stituting Fossier’s main evidence, comparing their different formats and functions. 
Chapter 4 analyzes the diplomatic of form letters in these collections as models or 
examples for the letters the office issued in response to petitions. Comparison with 
original letters is an avenue for further research, enhancing understanding of how 
formularies were used, and the administrative processes involved in producing let-
ters. Chapter 5 explores the juristic language used in form letters, notably the subtle 
distinctions between different kinds of fault absolved or dispensed by the office. �e 
letters often commissioned local bishops to investigate the circumstances of peti-
tioners’ faults, and this procedure is contextualized well in twelfth- and thirteenth-
century jurisprudence. Chapter 6 focusses on dispensations, which relaxed canoni-
cal rules in specific cases, especially impediments to marriage and ordination. �e 
canonistic background is effectively treated for the twelfth century but might have 
been explored into the later period of the formularies. Fossier again shows acute 
attention to legal terminology in the form letters and rightly notes the difficulty in 
differentiating dispensations from related graces, especially licenses. Chapter 7 dis-
cusses the different kinds of absolution the office granted. It concerned remission 
of sins in the penitential forum when conferred by minor penitentiaries, but peni-
tentiary letters generally absolved from wrongs and their penal consequences in the 
judicial forum. Fossier further distinguishes between absolution in cases reserved to 
the pope, often from spiritual sanctions incurred ipso facto under canon law, and 
from general censures often proclaimed by popes against the Church’s enemies. 
 
        �e final chapter (8) is arguably the most original and important. It discusses 
the concept of “scandal” marking the difference between private and public sins. 
�eologians and canonists agreed by the thirteenth century that private sins con-
fessed in the penitential forum should remain private, lest they provoke “scandal,” 
i.e., set others a bad example. Scandal was thus the negative effect of public sins on 
public opinion and was to be avoided. Form letters hence made certain graces con-
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ditional on the absence of scandal, for example, dispensation of clergy for ordination 
despite physical defects providing these did not cause scandal (i.e., reputational 
damage to the Church). Marriage dispensations were similarly justified by the need 
to avoid the scandal that might arise if they were not conceded. Avoidance of scan-
dal also explains the secrecy surrounding the office’s decisions on certain cases, espe-
cially those handled in foro conscientiae. Closer comparison with the registers and 
other evidence might have nuanced the argument again, however. �e registers 
comprise extremely few petitions approved in foro conscientiae, so few it makes gen-
eralization about the term’s significance difficult. Petitioners also approached the 
penitentiary in certain cases arguably since their sins were notorious and hence scan-
dalous. For example, in later medieval England assaults on members of the clergy, 
notionally reserved to papal absolution, were usually referred to the penitentiary only 
in cases of fatal or severe injury, whereas lesser injuries might be absolved locally. 
 
       Nevertheless, this is an excellent study that deserves a wide readership beyond 
specialists in the penitentiary, including those interested in diplomatic, canon law, 
penance, and the growth of papal government. It demonstrates the value of peni-
tentiary formularies and the need to study these alongside the registers and other 
sources to understand fully the office’s activity. It will hopefully stimulate not only 
further research on the formularies but also editions, especially of Benedict XII’s 
widely circulated formulary (1334), supplementing those of the registers.  
 
University of Southampton PETER D. CLARKE 

 
MODERN EUROPEAN 

 
�e Heresy of the Brothers, a Heterodox Community in Sixteenth-Century Italy. By 

Matteo Al Kalak. (Turnhout, Belgium: Brepols. 2022. Pp. 221. ISBN 978-2-
503-59329-60). 

 
       �is excellent book is a study of Modena in the 1540s to 1570s, as “one of the 
most lively Italian heterodox communities” (p. 14). Modena’s State Archive has 
very rich inquisition trial records comparable with Venice’s. In various works 
Matteo Al Kalak has proven himself master of these records through the early 
modern period. (I am indebted to him for advice when writing about seventeenth-
century Modena inquisitors.) �is fine volume is an expanded translation, 
rethought and very readable, of his L’eresia dei Fratelli (Rome, 2011). We have a 
well exemplified and analyzed study of the personae, their diverse heterodox ideas 
and activities, of a self-named Brotherhood, or sect (setta, p. 43), of Fratelli, most 
active in the 1540s to 1560s. �ey had emerged from a humanist Academy devel-
oping ideas in the previous decades under Lutheran and Erasmian influences. �e 
Brothers met in private houses, workshops, shops, and squares to read, debate, and 
teach one another. Al Kalak identifies thirteen communities in shops and houses, 
naming fifty-two participants attending one or more places, (Tables 1 and 2). He 
names forty-two defendants, and their accomplices, whether investigated or not 
(Table 3). He studied fourteen trials in particular, with 120 suspects or heretics, 
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quoting extensively from testimonies (with Italian original and English translation 
in main text). �e Brothers came from all ranks of society, from nobles, merchants, 
doctors, lawyers to weavers, shopkeepers, tailors, and non-city peasants. Richer 
brothers gave alms to poorer, helping to expand the memberships; the literate read-
ing to the unlettered. Bartolomea della Porta was the one woman named defen-
dant, but many mothers, wives, and daughters are cited as associates, though a few 
clearly held more orthodox views. Piergiovanni Biancolini, merchant, had the most 
crowded workshop for meeting, teaching, and learning; and attended at least four 
other communities. Bartolomeo Finzio stands out among many as the most signifi-
cant preacher of heterodox ideas, including Anabaptist notions. From the expan-
sive confessions of some of the accused the inquisition judges developed a clear idea 
of the movement, and the heterogeneous mixture of ideas, Lutheran, Zwinglian, 
Calvinist, resulting from the travels of several Brothers. �at the Academy and 
Brotherhood expanded and survived for so long was indebted to the attitude of the 
two main bishops, Giovanni Morone (1529–50 and 1564–71), and Egidio Fos-
carari (1550–64). �ey protected many brothers, modified penalties, and “recon-
ciled” many, creating “a climate of tolerance” (p. 64). �is ended from about 1566 
with the elevation of Pope Pius V, followed by Sisto Visdomini as bishop (1571–
90), stimulating and facilitating the inquisitors. Earlier control over heretics had 
been hampered by jurisdictional conflicts between inquisitors, bishops, Modena 
municipal leaders (Conservators), and the D’Este Dukes ruling from Ferrara. With 
Chapter 3 on “Dangerous Books” and Chapter 4 on “Faith and Works,” Al Kalak 
well illuminates the diversity of Modena’s heterodox ideas. Antonio Brucioli’s 
translations of the Bible were widely used, as also Catechisms, St. Paul’s Epistles, 
the satire Pasquino in Estasi, the Beneficio di Cristo, and the Sommario della Sacra 
Scrittura. �e dominant influencer Giovanni Rangoni also accessed plays by Pietro 
Aretino and works by Desiderius Erasmus and Giovanni Boccaccio. Justification 
through faith was “an acquired inheritance” (p. 111), in the 1540s from Academi-
cians. Strong support was given for Predestination, though clear denial of Free Will 
appeared later. Eucharist concepts were widely and diversely debated, with some 
seeing it as eating pasta. Strong attacks came against Purgatory, auricular confes-
sions and imposition of penances, the use of images, fasting and elaborate funerals. 
Priests were heavily attacked, and the Pope was denounced as Anti-Christ; “il Papa 
è satanasso” (p. 140). �e final sentence for the guilty is not always clear, but seem-
ingly few were executed. 
 
University of Glasgow (emeritus) CHRISTOPHER F. BLACK 
 
Village Infernos and Witches’ Advocates: Witch-hunting in Navarre, 1608–1614. By 

Lu Ann Homza. (University Park: Pennsylvania State University Press. 2022. 
Pp. x, 260. $99.95. ISBN: 9780271091815. 

 
       Between 1608 and 1614, Navarre was rocked by terrifying allegations that the 
Devil was recruiting villagers as witches, placing them in apprenticeships, providing 
them with demonic pet toads, and kidnapping and converting children to his cause. 
As Lu Ann Homza describes eloquently in her new book, the Basque witches’ sab-
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bats (akelarres) exemplified all the most terrifying elements of early modern witch-
fantasy: witches flew to upside-down masses where the Devil presided like the 
Bishop of Pamplona, they feasted on corpses, they mixed poisons and called down 
destructive weather, and they danced and copulated with one another to cacopho-
nous music. Entire villages were swept up in accusations; many of the accusers were 
children. After intense community breakdown and revoked confessions, the Inqui-
sition called a halt, and began treating witchcraft as impossible to prosecute. �ese 
elements make the Navarrese witch-hunt one of the most famous episodes of the 
European witch-craze, yet strikingly one of the least studied. Part of this neglect 
stems from the lasting influence of Gustav Henningsen’s 1980 study �e Witches’ 
Advocate, which focused on the Inquisitor Alonso de Salazar Frías’s skepticism over 
the witches’ confessions. To date, this is usually how the Navarrese witch-hunt fits 
into undergraduate witchcraft surveys: an example of how modernity and enlight-
ened legal thinking triumphed over peasant (and Catholic) superstition. 
 
       Homza decisively rejects this characterization. In a much-needed reappraisal, 
Homza returns to Henningsen’s original documentary base, while supplementing 
it with new and only recently discovered sources from the Navarrese royal archives 
and Inquisitorial correspondence in Madrid. She considers the poverty and worldly 
motives that fueled the hunt, but also the surprisingly coherent command of Tri-
dentine religious reform possessed by the Navarrese laity. �e result is a careful and 
sensitive re-evaluation of the witch-hunt and an important contribution to our 
understanding of early modern daily life. In crisp prose and vivid, humorous 
descriptions of village conflict, Homza unequivocally demonstrates that witch-
accusations were anything but normal. Calling someone a witch was a profound 
social affront, and such slander had shattering social effects (p. 20). Yet, many of 
the accusers were children and there was no legal mechanism to stop or punish 
them from accusing parents and neighbors. In Homza’s telling, we see how 
Inquisitors stumbled into a complex social world they did not fully understand, and 
where Inquisitorial penalties might pale in comparison to the trauma and dishonor 
accused witches faced within their communities.  
 
       Still, Homza’s most important contribution remains a dramatic rejection of 
Salazar as an enlightened jurist, who doubted the concept of witchcraft: rather than 
ushering in modern legal procedure, Salazar “came to doubt not whether witchcraft 
was possible in theory, but whether his tribunal was proceeding against witch-sus-
pects with sufficient proof” (p. 9). �ough Homza rejects geographic determin-
ism—in both limited and broad senses—she nonetheless sees the Inquisition as 
suffering from a “tyranny of distance”: the cultural and geographic gulf between the 
Suprema in Madrid, the tribunal in Logroño, and the Pyrenean villages made com-
munication and timely dispatches exceptionally difficult, stoking conflict between 
individual Inquisitors. �eir choices effectively exacerbated the hunt, rather than 
remedy it (p. 87). �e poverty of the Logroño tribunal and the exploding number 
of cases pushed familiars to search for extralegal mechanisms to help with the back-
log, including coerced confessions, torture at the village level, and bringing suspects 
face to face (p. 100). Village Infernos is then, fundamentally, a portrait of a dysfunc-
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tional Inquisition whose actions actually botched the processes their tribunal was 
bound to uphold (p. 16). Justice was usurped by individual townspeople and the 
clergy, some of whom fought back against abuses and mistreatment by bringing 
suit in other jurisdictions. �ere was nothing top-down about the use of the courts 
by these villagers, and the result was “a persecution [that] unquestionably had more 
witches’ advocates” than Salazar alone (p. 180). 
 
�e Pennsylvania State University AMANDA L. SCOTT 

 
Heroic Hearts: Sentiment, Saints, and Authority in Modern France. By Jennifer J. 

Popiel. (Lincoln: University of Nebraska Press. 2021. Pp. xxi, 366. $65.00. 
ISBN: 9781496219619). 

 
       Jennifer Popiel’s work explores the complicated relationship between nine-
teenth-century women, sentimentality, and female autonomy. Sentimentality, 
defined by excess emotion, “syrupy” language and images, and triviality, has been 
characterized as weak, anti-modern, and feminine since the nineteenth century. 
However, sentimental language, images, and books were extremely popular with 
nineteenth-century women. Popiel suggests that the negative perception of senti-
mentality is not entirely justified. For nineteenth-century women, sentimentality 
could signify a pure heart and true calling from God. Sentimental literature and 
images provided women with models for heroic action outside of domesticity. 
Popiel argues that women adopted sentimental language to defend their right to 
choose their own path. Options were limited, but a religious vocation often offered 
more opportunities than marriage.  
 
       Popiel’s work exposes both the stark choices available to women and the cre-
ative methods they used to carve out non-domestic paths. Women who chose reli-
gious vocations employed sentimental language and images to link themselves to 
female respectability. Sentimentality gave them the cover of purity. �is protected 
them from suspicion as they engaged in public work helping the poor and promot-
ing religion. It also helped protect them from accusations of individualism or self-
ishness. Sentimentality emphasized devotion to God, obedience to the Church, 
and self-sacrifice rather than individual fulfillment or personal advancement. Even 
heroic action was achieved by a women’s sacrifice of herself either for others or for 
sexual purity. Likewise, women who chose public action through religious vocation 
avoided threatening masculinity despite the independence they achieved. Senti-
mentality allowed them to justify their autonomy with “feminine” language of the 
heart, not the “masculine” intellect.  
 
       One of the most interesting aspects of Popiel’s work is her emphasis on vir-
ginity as a path to bodily autonomy for women. Virginity has long been used to 
shame women, but it could also liberate them from domestic life under the cover 
of purity. Popiel reminds readers of the danger that sexuality posed for women. 
Sexuality could ruin a woman’s reputation, marriage often meant domination by a 
husband, and multiple pregnancies frequently led to poor health. Women suffered 
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when their children died, and childcare responsibilities undermined their freedom 
of action. Claiming virginity could liberate women from the constraints imposed 
by domesticity and their own biology. 
 
       Popiel asks readers to reconsider concepts and practices that modern readers 
tend to dislike. It is hard to see concepts like virginity positively. Used by women, 
moral restrictions could produce a certain degree of liberation and protection. 
Popiel reminds us that women’s advancement is never a straight-forward process. 
Some concepts and practices can hold women back and move them forward at the 
same time. Women were not necessarily conscious of all the ramifications of their 
choices. Women who gained autonomy by choosing a religious vocation or using 
sentimental language did not do so to advance women’s rights. �ey were genuinely 
driven by religious feelings and a desire to serve God. Nonetheless, they served as 
models for an alternative life outside of marriage and the family. �ey demon-
strated a path for women’s choice and public action that inspired other women. �e 
extent to which they advanced women’s equality is hard to measure, but Popiel 
insists that their choices should not be discounted because they do not match 
modern sensibilities. Popiel’s work forces readers to consider the myriad ways in 
which women have used ideas designed to constrain their actions to expand their 
opportunities. �is is an exceptionally well-written and thoughtful book that will 
be valuable for scholars and students alike. 
 
University of Northern Iowa EMILY MACHEN 

 
AMERICAN 

 
�e Imperial Church: Catholic Founding Fathers and U nited States Empire. By 

Katherine D. Moran. (Ithaca, NY: Cornell University Press. 2020. Pp. xiv, 
330. $48.95. ISBN: 9781501748813.) 

 
       Jacques Marquette, a seventeenth-century Jesuit, loomed incongruously large 
in my non-Catholic childhood. I learned to swim at Pere Marquette beach on the 
southeastern shores of Lake Michigan; the priest-explorer also featured promi-
nently in what passed for history instruction at my Grand Rapids public school. I 
remember the pride those lessons engendered—pride that one of our own, geo-
graphically speaking, could be claimed as an American Founding Father; pride too 
in Marquette’s French origins, redolent to my childhood self of sophistication and 
glamor. But although I was certainly aware that Marquette was a Catholic, I never 
wondered at his being so lionized in what was then a stronghold of Dutch 
Reformed Protestantism. �at surfaced as a puzzle only many years later. 
 
       Given my personal history, I was primed to appreciate Katherine Moran’s �e 
Imperial Church, the first section of which centers on the secular cult of Jacques 
Marquette. �e commemorative culture surrounding Marquette, peculiar to the 
upper Midwest, emerged in the 1870s and resulted by the early twentieth century 
in a plethora of statues and place names, along with the occasional civic pageant, 
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honoring the hitherto obscure Jesuit. Marquette was claimed by that commemora-
tive culture as a co-founder of the American nation, “naturalizing, after the fact, the 
imperial nation’s expansion into formerly French and Native American territory” 
(p. 18). Pride in their booming region was a powerful motivator for the priest’s 
admirers, many of whom were Protestants. For some he also served, however 
incongruously, to legitimize the region’s explosive industrial growth, even as the 
priest’s undoubted anti-materialism spoke to the need for a less rapacious mode of 
industrial relations. Many such advocates of a more paternalistic capitalism also saw 
in Marquette, who was famously open to the region’s Indian cultures, a powerful 
endorsement of the nation’s assimilative capacities. But notwithstanding the 
priest’s own example, it was assimilation to a white Christian norm that his admir-
ers had in mind.  
 
       Moran turns next to Junípero Serra, the eighteenth century Franciscan 
founder of California’s Indian missions, who—like Jacques Marquette—was 
reimagined as a Founding Father and a bearer of white Christian civilization.   
Serra’s secular cult, underway by the 1880s and largely confined to California, was 
more vigorously commercial than that of Marquette:  many of its mostly-Protestant 
promoters hoped to stimulate tourism and the state’s nascent hospitality industry.  
�e cult had its mildly progressive side, presenting Serra as a model paternalistic 
employer—unlike the itinerant Marquette, Serra presided over a chain of missions 
where Indian neophytes lived and worked—and embracing an assimilationist ideal 
that rejected anti-Catholicism. Some of Serra’s admirers condemned the violence 
that early Anglo arrivals in California had wreaked on what remained of the local 
Indian population. But as in the case of Marquette, the assimilationist ideal that 
Serra allegedly embodied made no room for those unwilling or unable to conform 
to a white, Christian norm—or indeed for those who would challenge the racial-
ized hierarchy of California’s emerging agro-industrial economy. 
 
       �e third and final section of Moran’s book, which deals with American occu-
pation of the Philippines, presents a more complicated narrative, impossible to 
summarize here. It too involves Catholic priests, both Spanish and American, and 
serves to “naturalize” American expansion, now in an overseas mode, and affirm a 
vision of the nation as heir to an earlier wave of mostly Catholic imperial “civiliz-
ers.” Like the rest of this formidably intelligent book, these chapters are deftly 
argued and grounded in thorough research. But in this section especially, one 
would like to learn more about how this logic—the American war in the Philip-
pines, not wholly popular back home, was unfolding in the present rather than the 
distant past—was received by a diverse national audience. �is is less a criticism, 
however, than a tribute to Moran’s fine book, which in this and other respects sug-
gests fruitful new paths for research. 
 
�e Catholic University of America, Emerita LESLIE WOODCOCK TENTLER 
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Father Luis Olivares: A Biography. By Mario T. García. (Chapel Hill: University of 
North Carolina Press. 2018. Pp. 1, 547. $34.95 hardcover; $27.95 paperback. 
ISBN 978-1-469-66927-4.)  

 
       Mario T. García is on a mission to elevate the importance of Father Luis Oli-
vares in his biography of the priest, Father Luis Olivares: A Biography. �e prolific 
scholar focuses on Chicano history, but believes that there is a major gap among 
scholars in relation to the role of religion and politics among the community. �is 
biography is his second book after Católicos: Resistance and Affirmation in Chicano 
Catholic History, where he examines what he terms “faith politics”—the fusion of the 
two—but this time he does so by exploring the trajectory of Olivares’ life. García 
traces Father Luis Olivares from his family’s origins in the United States as religious 
refugees from Mexico in the 1910s to his own tragic death from AIDS in the 1990s. 
 
       García argues that Olivares’ story must be told to produce a much “more 
inclusive history of the United States” that represents the country’s changing demo-
graphics, one that accounts for the histories of Chicanos and Latinos, California 
and Los Angeles, as well as U.S. religious and Catholic history (p. 22). He covers 
the priest’s life over the course of twelve chapters, bookended by a prologue and 
epilogue. Olivares’ family left Mexico for the U.S. during the Mexican Revolution, 
settling in San Antonio, where Luis and his brother Henry would learn about and 
eventually join the Congregation of Missionaries, Sons of the Immaculate Heart of 
the Blessed Virgin Mary, or the Claretians. �is decision sent him down a path in 
the priesthood, seeking advancement in the order. He experienced a change of 
heart in the mid-1970s, where he began instead to organize among the Chicano 
and Latino community in Los Angeles, using his religious position to benefit 
others. García devotes much of his book to the organizing that Olivares did in the 
1980s by working to provide sanctuary to refugees fleeing violence in Central 
America. �e author ends the biography with Olivares’ passing, emphasizing his 
impact on the community, noting that “Father Luis, the prophet, still speaks out. 
He is still present. ¡LUIS OLIVARES! ¡PRESENTE!” (p. 497). 
 
       García’s works to demonstrate the importance of faith politics in Olivares’ life, 
but he is perhaps most convincing in regard to the priest’s trajectory of welcoming 
the oppressed. �e author emphasizes how his family was in the U.S. in the very 
first place because of what his parents saw as an attack against Catholics in Mexico. 
García articulates that “part of the tradition that was passed on to the Olivares chil-
dren and that would impact Luis Olivares many years later was providing sanctuary 
to those being religiously persecuted” (p. 37). Later on in the biography the author 
draws this parallel when he discusses Olivares’ role in the sanctuary movement of 
the 1980s. He describes that “in declaring public sanctuary, he was not only pub-
licly embracing the refugees, he was giving his own public testimony about who he 
was and what he was all about” (p. 342). 
 
       At approximately 500 pages, Father Luis Olivares: A Biography is quite the 
tome that could be concentrated at times. Nonetheless, the portion on the sanctu-
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ary movement for refugees from Central America shines through. Scholars who 
work on the movement or even on political Catholics need to read this book. 
 
San Diego State University NATHAN ELLSTRAND 

 
Elizabeth Fox-Genovese: Paternalism’s Daughter. By Deborah A. Symonds. (Char-

lottesville: University of Virginia Press. 2021. Pp. 339. $39.50. ISBN: 
9780813945132.) 

 
       Deborah A. Symonds’ new biography of Elizabeth Fox-Genovese (1941–
2007) is a welcome addition to the growing literature on the lives and achievements 
of women in the academy. �e biography draws on Symonds’ own personal expe-
rience with Fox-Genovese and on the testimony of others, on Fox-Genovese’s 
many personal journals and copious correspondence, and on a reading of her pub-
lished works to give us a fuller picture of the complicated woman than has been 
available to date. �ere is much about Fox-Genovese’s life to interest readers, and 
thus many reasons to read Symonds’ fine book: Fox-Genovese’s status as a scholar 
of eighteenth-century French history, the place of Freudian and Marxian themes 
in her thinking, her struggle with anorexia, her experience with second wave fem-
inism, the role she played in some academic turmoil (including a lawsuit), her mar-
riage and collaboration with her husband, the historian Eugene Genovese, her con-
frontation with the new left, and much else. While Symonds covers each of these 
(and more), she has the overall trajectory of Fox-Genovese’s life in view: how, 
beginning as a child in a largely non-religious family, with Bryn Mawr and Harvard 
degrees in hand Fox-Genovese developed into a prolific and recognized historian 
working in Marxist and feminist scholarly traditions; how she gradually began to 
think of herself, and to write, as a traditional conservative; and how she came to 
convert to Catholicism. 
 
       Central to that life path, on Symonds’ telling, is a tension. On the one hand 
Symonds describes Fox-Genovese’s struggle to emerge from her family, to separate 
from her overbearing and controlling parents, to escape their authority and to estab-
lish herself as an intellectual and a scholar. Symonds’ generous quotations from Fox-
Genovese’s personal journals reveal a young, and then a mature, woman engaged in 
a classic twenbtieth-century feminist project of individuation and self-determination. 
On the other hand, Symonds describes Fox-Genovese’s enduring connection to her 
parents, how she remained under their sway and under the sway of the values of their 
generation—hence the book’s subtitle Paternalism’s Daughter. Symonds describes 
Fox-Genovese’s affinity to authority (including the authority of convention), her 
understanding of its enduring reality and necessity. (Symonds reports that Fox-Gen-
ovese would “lecture students” about their “need to accept authority so [they] would 
understand it when it came [their] turn to hold it” [p. 217]).  We might identify this 
tension, in Fox-Genovese’s life, as between individualism and authority. 
 
        Despite Fox-Genovese’s own journey of individuation and self-determination 
documented in her journals, Symonds emphasizes that she was a persistent critic of 
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individualism in her scholarly work—the critique of individualism being a thread 
connecting her early left-leaning with her later right-leaning scholarship. As 
Symonds explains, Fox-Genovese was a critic of individualism “first from the left 
and then from the right” (p. 1). How else to understand this than that her scholarly 
work expressed an ambivalence about a key aspect of her own life? Symonds quotes 
a student’s claim that Fox-Genovese was at her best when she was able to embrace 
“ambiguity and ambivalence,” suggesting another tension in her life and work: 
between accepting ambiguity and ambivalence on the one hand and seeking safety 
and certainty (perhaps another kind of authority) on the other. Symonds suggests 
that Fox-Genovese “wished for a world that was fixed and comprehensible” (p. 264). 
As another student put it: “. . . Freud, Marx, or Christ. . . , she adopted them all in 
an attempt to find an external reality that would provide her with the safety she 
craved at the same time that her intellectual life suggested something else” (p. 261). 
 
       My interest in Fox-Genovese concerns her relationship to feminism—which 
Symonds discusses especially toward the book’s end. Fox-Genovese rejected actu-
ally existing feminism in her 1996 book Feminism Is Not the Story of My Life (p. 
223); but she sought to provide a “constructive alternative [pp. 272–273]),” a “con-
servative feminism” (p. 273). As Symonds puts it, she “believed she was working 
out a new way forward, a reconstituted feminism forged from something better 
than . . . individualism,” perhaps forged from “an older humanism” (p. 239). �is 
ambition on Fox-Genovese’s part was the subject of an article of my own, “Con-
servatism, Feminism, and Elizabeth Fox-Genovese”1 in which I sought to present 
her “alternative” and to explore whether it is a kind of feminism (as well as the 
larger question whether conservative feminism is even a conceptual possibility). I 
argue that Fox-Genovese’s later writings on women should be taken seriously as 
advocacy on behalf of women but are not feminist, since feminism is critical of, 
while Fox-Genovese recommends a rapprochement with, conventional social 
forms like traditional marriage, motherhood, and sexual morality. 
 
       Symonds concludes her book by pointing to the tension between Fox-Gen-
ovese’s clear journey of individuation and self-determination on the one hand, and 
her intellectual and scholarly rejection of individualism on the other. Here, 
Symonds seems to locate that tension—indeed an ambivalence—in the distinction 
between what and how she wrote. As Symonds explains, Fox-Genovese sometimes 
wrote “in a white heat of private necessity, not to serve others but to make small 
advances into her own unspoken self. In that urgency, occasional but persistent, she 
remained a feminist, committed to what she needed to confront” (p. 277). 
 
Hofstra University AMY R. BAEHR 
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out that the view on abortion I attributed to Fox-Genovese in my article was a one she held 
along the way but was not her most mature view (p. 273). 



LATIN AMERICAN 
 

A Troubled Marriage: Indigenous Elites of the Colonial Americas. By Sean F. McEn-
roe. [Diálogos Series.] (Albuquerque:  University of New Mexico Press. 2020. 
Pp. xxviii, 319. $95.00 hardcover: ISBN 978-0-8263-6118-9; $34.95 paper-
back: ISBN 978-0-8263-6119-6.) 

 
        A Troubled Marriage takes a hemispheric approach to the strategies, successes, 
and setbacks faced by the upper echelons of indigenous society under Spanish, 
French, and English rule. Geographically, the book’s protagonists’ origins range 
from South America to Canada in the Americas. �e tactics of military support, 
marriage alliances, services as intermediaries, conversion to Christianity, and adop-
tion of European-introduced literacy and crafts lent themselves to overall positive 
outcomes for the indigenous and mestizo figures studied by McEnroe. �e author 
depicts these alliances as a two-way street, emphasizing the Europeans’ dependence 
on indigenous allies, especially in the early contact period.  
 
       McEnroe’s monograph spans the sixteenth century to the nineteenth century. 
�e book’s organization balances a chronological arrangement with a thematic 
approach, with the first chapter dealing with early contacts and the last chapter 
examining independence. In between, chapters are arranged topically, covering 
dynastic alliances, religious adaptation, adoption of writing and the arts, urban 
coexistence with colonizers, and military alliances during and after the conquest. 
�e flexible timeframe for each chapter takes into account the divergent trajectories 
of contact and colonization of indigenous spaces by separate states and empires.  
 
       �e regions and indigenous leaders examined in this book depend on histori-
cal circumstances. Due to the nature of A Troubled Marriage’s subject matter, the 
book focuses on areas in which an indigenous elite persisted after initial contact and 
in zones where European colonists had sustained interactions with the indigenous 
population, which resulted in a documentary record to reconstruct such relation-
ships. Cuzco, Lima, Mexico City, and Tlaxcala figure prominently in the book 
partly as a result of these sites’ well-preserved original sources and the persistence 
of a largely literate native elite that left a long paper trail in those locations.  
 
       To complete a work so sweeping in scope, McEnroe’s archival itinerary 
included stops in over twenty repositories in six different nations, namely the 
United States, Canada, Mexico, Guatemala, Peru, and Spain. His expansive bib-
liography demonstrates engagement with the leading works on the native popu-
lations of English and Francophone Canada, the English North American 
colonies and the United States, Mexico, Peru, and Paraguay. Such extensive 
research did not result in a dense book, however. McEnroe’s serial biographical 
organization and his narrative style make A Troubled Marriage easily accessible to 
the Diálogos Series’ main audience, university classrooms. Individually, most 
chapters would work as standalone sections to introduce readers to themes for 
specialized topics classes. 
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       Despite its accessibility, a few editing issues may give some readers pause. Any 
work so panoramic in its scope covering contact to the nineteenth century from 
South America to Canada may include a few errors. However, copy editors should 
have noticed a few glaring ones, such as identifying July 16 as Mexico’s Independ-
ence Day (p. 202) or “Lake Eerie” instead of “Lake Erie” (p. 210). Other errors 
seem to reflect an overall unfamiliarity with Central America, such as his reference 
to the “Mexico-Honduras border” (p. 7) or describing the indigenous population of 
Honduras as “neighbors” to the Kaqchikel Mayas of highland Guatemala (p. 180).  
 
        Indigenous Elites of the Colonial Americas, the book’s subtitle, suggests that the 
book’s focus will be on indigenous elites. However, while the book covers the 
“uneasy marriage” between indigenous Americans and Europeans, its subject 
matter does not exclusively examine the autochthonous population. Many of the 
biographical sketches include mestizos such as Jean Baptiste Charbonneau, Diego 
Muñoz Camargo, Diego Valadés, and “the Inca” Garcilaso de la Vega. While these 
figures played an important role in recording the indigenous past and acting as 
intermediaries, their European heritage and influences are downplayed, even 
though some, such as Garcilaso de la Vega, spent much of their lives among Euro-
peans in Europe. Some character studies even focus on Europeans who adopted 
aspects of indigenous lifeways, culture, and language, such as Gonzalo Guerrero 
and Alvar Nuñez Cabeza de Vaca from Spain’s early encounters with the Americas 
or Canada’s Louis Riel. Among the indigenous elites whose stories are omitted are 
many who met unhappy ends despite alliances with Europeans, such as Don Carlos 
Ometochtli Chichimecateuctli of Texcoco, scion of a Mesoamerican lineage who 
aligned himself with Spaniards but suffered an ignominious death by burning at the 
stake by the Inquisition in Mexico in 1539.  
 
       Overall, the book works well as a corrective to the absence of indigenous fig-
ures in studies of and classes on Atlantic World History. It is among few concise, 
approachable works that takes a continental approach to the indigenous elites of 
the Americas, seamlessly incorporating Canadian First Nation figures, Native 
American leaders from the United States, and principales and caciques of Latin 
America into a single framework of accommodation and alliances with European 
invaders. Although many of the figures examined in this serial biography have pre-
viously received attention from scholars, McEnroe’s far-reaching research brings 
many lesser-known indigenous noblemen to light, including many from Tlaxcala, 
one of the most overlooked regions in New Spain. 
 
Utah Valley University MARK W. LENTZ 

 
�e Franciscans in Colonial Mexico. Edited by �omas M. Cohen, Jay T. Harrison, 

and David Rex Galindo. (Norman: University of Oklahoma Press. 2021. Pp. 
x, 344. $65. ISBN: 9780806169255.) 

 
        The Franciscans in Colonial Mexico contains a collection of essays presented 
as part of the quincentenary celebration of the Franciscan arrival in Mexico. 

                                                                          BOOK REVIEWS                                                                 617



This important collection contains thirteen carefully constructed and learned 
essays which examine Franciscan activity in New Spain. The stated purposes of 
the collection are threefold: to commemorate the quincentenary, to honor the 
life and work of Francisco Morales, and to fill gaps in the historiography of the 
Franciscans in New Spain. The full potential of this volume is apparent in two 
essays comparing concepts of martyrdom using two differing criteria. José Refu-
gio de la Torre Curiel’s diachronic analysis of the discourse surrounding martyr-
dom (chapter 8), and Emanuele Colombo’s “comparative study of different reli-
gious orders active at the same time and in the same location” (p. 309), in this 
case Franciscan and Jesuit responses to martyrdom (chapter 13). Engaging the 
topic with two different methodological approaches illuminates how dynamic 
the Franciscan experience and the richness the cultural and religious landscape 
was in New Spain. Likewise, unique contributions such as Jonathan Truitt’s 
work on the role of sports and spectacle in the creation of Colonial Society 
(chapter 4) display the depth with which the Friars interacted with nearly every 
facet of colonial society.  
 
       �e emphasis on the Colonial Mexican location at times overshadows the par-
ticularities of the Franciscan presence, methods, and approaches to evangelization in 
the region. For example, Veronica Murilla Gallegos’ examination of Fray Juan 
Bautista’s literary production (chapter 3), an otherwise masterfully crafted essay, does 
not aclnowledge that the Franciscan literary production in Mexico reflected long-
standing trends within the Order’s history regarding the use of the vernacular. �is is 
not a universal trend, and largely a concern only for experts in the field of Franciscan 
Studies, as other contributions situate the Friars within a larger religious economy 
and consciously Franciscan identity. Matthew Restall’s “�e Landa Conundrum” 
(chapter 5) reminds us that these friars, and in fact all agents in the colonization of 
Mexico, were products of historical forces which were transcontinental, diachronic, 
and shaped in these cases by participation in the Franciscan charism. Karen Melvin’s 
examination in chapter 8 of the reinscription of the sacred topography onto the Mex-
ican landscape, likewise situates the Friars within a global Catholic framework.  
 
       One weakness of the volume is the lack of critical engagement with unfree 
labor. �e editors’ acknowledgement that the Franciscans “participated in the extir-
pation of the vestiges of Indigenous religion and culture [and] involuntarily to the 
demographic demise of Indigenous peoples” (p. 3) is certainly correct. As Steven 
Hackel in chapter 9, and Rose Marie Beebe and Robert M. Senkewicz’ chapter 10 
make clear when discussing the missions in Baja California, at certain times and 
places the Friars’ were invested in gaining and retaining control over the lives of 
Indigenous people. Nor does any essay fully account for Franciscan attitudes 
towards enslaved African labor. In this way the volume continues in the tradition 
of earlier nationalist histories which saw slavery, the encomienda, and reparimiento 
as vehicles for creating an organic Latin American culture.  
 
       Ultimately, however, the many strengths of this volume and its utility for 
scholars, overcome whatever critiques might be offered, and renders it an invaluable 

618                                                                  BOOK REVIEWS



resource for higher-level undergraduate reading and scholars in the field. �e Fran-
ciscans in Colonial Mexico is a timely and invaluable contribution to scholarship in 
the fields of Latin American History and Franciscan Studies. 
 
Society for Lascasian Studies JOHN POLLOCK-PARKER 
 
 
Idolizing Mary: Maya-Catholic Icons in Yucatán, Mexico. By Amara Solari. (Univer-

sity Park: Pennsylvania State University Press. 2019. Pp. 200. $99.95. ISBN: 
9780271083322.) 

 
       Amara Solari’s Idolizing Mary explains how images become powerful through 
a wonderful study of the Virgin Mary and her Maya devotees in Yucatán. �e book 
uses the Virgin of Iztmal as a touchstone, and Solari’s close reading of this icon 
serves a number of functions. We learn about the history of the sculpture itself, 
which Fray Diego de Landa commissioned in Guatemala and brought to Yucatán 
in the 1550s. Although the original Virgin of Iztmal sculpture was destroyed by fire 
in 1829, Solari reconstructs its appearance. We also learn about the annual proces-
sion of the image from Iztmal to Mérida, and the healing qualities that Maya and 
other devotees have attached to the image. �e procession began with the 1648 
yellow fever epidemic and continues today. Yet Solari’s study provides much more 
than a discussion of one sculpture of the Virgin. Solari uses images of Mary as a 
conduit to consider postclassic and colonial Maya ideas of images as vessels meant 
to be animated by sacred power; Maya ideas about the ability of images to absorb 
and transfer illness and suffering; Spanish ideas about indigenous religion as disease 
and the power of evangelization and Maya Catholicism to heal “idolatrous” sin; and 
the Maya emphasis on Mary, particularly the Virgin of the Immaculate Concep-
tion, as an animate healer. Ultimately, Idolizing Mary provides a way to explore the 
“nativization of Mary,” a process in which Maya people understood and utilized 
sculptures of Mary through their own ideology of “sacred materiality.” Maya devo-
tees, as well as their Spanish and Afro-Yucatecan neighbors, recognized images of 
Mary and other holy figures as sacred matter that could address the challenges of 
indigenous life under Spanish colonialism.  
 
       Solari uses a diverse source base to understand colonial Maya and Spanish 
ideas about sacrality and materiality. Sources include pictorial texts such as draw-
ings and paintings from codexes and Spanish accounts, and published and manu-
script texts written in Spanish, Maya, Italian, and Latin. Of course, given that icons 
of Mary are at the heart of the book, Solari also uses many material texts, including 
postclassic and colonial Maya-produced sculptures. Solari pays close attention to 
language in the written sources, for example in the discussion of the Maya word 
suhuy, meaning unworked or undiluted. �e use of this term to describe the Virgin 
in various texts, including the Book of Chilam Balam of Chumayel, shows how 
Maya people placed Mary within existing ideas of the sacred. Four appendices pro-
vide translations of texts used in the book, including extensive descriptions of mir-
acles performed by the Virgin of Iztmal. 
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        Idolizing Mary goes beyond works that compare indigenous and European 
religious practices and posit hidden meanings behind popular images. Instead, 
Solari delves deep to examine Maya and Spanish ideologies of sacred materiality 
over time. Idolizing Mary examines the basis of Marian devotion in Yucatán to 
reveal how Maya people utilized images of the Virgin as powerful vehicles of heal-
ing illness and suffering, often brought by colonization. In providing a genealogy 
of the Virgin of Iztmal and other Yucatecan images, Solari provides micro- and 
macro-level views of Yucatecan religiosity that reveal the active participation of 
Maya people in shaping colonial epistemologies. 
 
George Mason University JOAN BRISTOL  
 
Colonial Kinship: Guaraní, Spaniards, and Africans in Paraguay. By Shawn Michael 

Austin. (Albuquerque: University of New Mexico Press. 2020. Pp. xvi, 382. 
$85.00. ISBN: 9780826361967.) 

 
       Shawn Michael Austin in his exciting new book provides an insightful analysis 
into the everyday lives of the Guaraní through the study of colonial kinship in 
Paraguay. His focus is on those Native peoples who were subjected to labor 
demands and other obligations under the Spanish institution of the encomienda, as 
well as the African peoples and those of mixed descent who interacted with Spanish 
society, especially in Asuncion and its satellite communities during the sixteenth 
and seventeenth centuries. �ese Native peoples were generally under the control 
of Franciscan missionaries, although the author provides details on the Guaraní 
from the Jesuit missions to elucidate the divergent patterns of Native resistance and 
colonial practices. In contrast to previous works, Austin draws upon rich archival 
documents with emphasis on 350 judicial records, which have been underutilized, 
and often contain the testimonies of the Guaraní. �e author uses a broad frame-
work to demonstrate how ethnic soldiering first began with the Spanish expedi-
tions into the Chaco region in search of precious metals in the sixteenth century, 
rather than with the arming of the Guaraní by the Jesuits to combat Indian slavery 
in the early seventeenth century. �e Franciscans were also the first to evangelize 
among the Guaraní in Guairá in southeastern Brazil prior to the arrival of the first 
Jesuits in 1609 who became a major evangelical force in the region.  
 
       Austin builds on the pioneering works (1954) of anthropologist Elman R. 
Service for his analysis on kinship to demonstrate how the Guaraní shaped 
Paraguayan colonial society. Spanish conquistadors relied on and exploited the kin-
ship relations they established with the Guaraní before and well beyond the intro-
duction of the encomienda and a tributary system in 1556.  �e author states that 
the Guaraní term mborayhu (loving) is a complex word that describes the Natives’ 
relationship with their encomenderos (grantees of Indian laborers), which implied 
reciprocal benefits and a sense of community. Austin further discusses how reli-
gious orders but especially the Jesuits were the major purchasers of African slaves 
in the Rio de la Plata who put their slaves to work on their ranches, farms, con-
vents, and colleges. In 1682, he notes, Africans, whether enslaved or free, com-
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prised 15 percent of Asuncion’s population. Africans, the author convincingly 
argues, must be viewed within the context of indigenous society. 
 
       �e author mentions an absence of church records in Paraguay; however, a few 
original baptismal and marriage records from the colonial period, such as those of 
Mission Santa Rosa, remain in the archives of the churches themselves, rather than 
in Asuncion. Accordingly, one wonders about the extent to which grandparenthood 
ties took place between the Guaraní and African slaves, a pattern that was present 
in baptismal records in the church records of small towns in southeastern Brazil. �e 
author’s analysis of African slavery in Paraguay is a major achievement, but perhaps 
he could have examined slavery in greater detail in other parts of the Rio de la Plata, 
such as Uruguay, to cast a broader framework to strengthen his analysis. 
 
          Aside from these minor points, Austin’s work represents a major contribution 
to the history of the Guaraní and Spanish relations during the sixteenth and seven-
teenth centuries. �is informative book will be useful for scholars who study Spanish 
borderlands, ethnohistory, race mixture, and colonial Latin American history.       
 
Florida Atlantic University, Boca Raton BARBARA A. GANSON 
 
Guatemala’s Catholic Revolution: A History of Religious and Social Reform, 1920-

1968.  By Bonar L. Hernández Sandoval.  (Notre Dame, IN: University of 
Notre Dame Press. 2018. Pp. 254. $50.00. ISBN: 978-0-268-10441-2.) 

 
       In this compelling book, Bonar Hernández Sandoval explores the history of 
the Catholic Church in Guatemala in the period between 1920 and the 1960s, i.e., 
from the early liberal dictatorships to “the democratic spring” (1944-54), to the first 
decade after the CIA-sponsored coup in 1954. His purpose is to demonstrate how 
the massive social engagement of large sectors of the Church from the 1960s 
onwards was not simply a result of the changes following the Second Vatican 
Council and the landmark Conference of Latin American Bishops in Medellín in 
1968. Rather, it was “propelled by the institutional renewal of rural Catholicism, 
which date[d] back to the interwar period, when a reconfiguration of national and 
international politics created new spaces for the Church’s resurgence” (p. 3). 
Hernández affirms that these transformations were the result of Vatican initiatives 
that attempted to break the deadlock between the Guatemalan Church and anti-
clerical liberal governments, which since the independence of 1821 had gradually 
weakened the institution. (In 1920, there were only around hundred priests for a 
population of two million people.) 
 
       �e book is divided into six chapters and progresses chronologically, which 
makes it easily accessible for students. In the first two chapters, Hernández analyzes 
hitherto unexamined archival sources in the Vatican and the Guatemalan archdio-
cese. �ese show how the Vatican sent envoys to Guatemala to expand the space 
for ecclesial activity and to redirect the focus of the national conservative clergy 
away from fruitless power struggles with the state and toward a new vision of a 
Romanized Church. In this vision, the Church would limit itself to the religious 
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realm and aim for the reconstruction of a strong Catholic culture through the cat-
echization and disciplining of the laity. �e third chapter describes how the 
Church, under the leadership of Archbishop Mariano Rossell y Arellano (1939-
64), was able to expand its activities and begin inviting foreign missionaries to the 
country. Hundreds of priests and sisters from the United States and Europe arrived 
in Guatemala in the decades following World War II, eventually outnumbering 
Guatemalan-born clergy and religious. �e missionaries were primarily sent to the 
highland Maya peoples. From the fifth chapter and on, the book gradually narrows 
its focus to the Maryknoll missionaries and their pastoral work. Sources from the 
society’s archives in Ossining, New York, reveal the missionaries’ experience of cat-
echizing the Maya and opposing their Costumbre, i.e. custom-based Catholicism 
that included pre-Columbian practices and beliefs. �e social pastoral work, in 
which priests, sisters, and catechists increasingly engaged, can be understood in 
light of the anti-communism of the Cold War in post-coup Guatemala.  
 
       In the first part of the book, Hernández convincingly demonstrates how the 
rise of progressive Catholicism in Guatemala was rooted in developments that went 
back far longer than Vatican Council II and the Medellín conference. In the last 
part of the book, however, it seems as if Hernández is reversing his own argument 
in the case of the Maryknollers, ascribing their turn toward progressiveness—and 
in some cases support for revolutionary struggle—as a development taking place 
despite the conservatism of the Church in Guatemala. Here a broader approach—
one that would take into account the development of the broader Catholic and reli-
gious landscape of Guatemala in the 1950s and 60s—could have helped Hernández 
develop his first claim, which was well-warranted.  
 
       �is last observation notwithstanding, the book is an important historio-
graphical contribution to the history of Catholicism in Guatemala. �e book ends 
in 1968, when the civil war was rising in intensity. It is to be hoped that Hernández 
will follow up with a study of the role of the Church in that tragic period of 
Guatemala’s recent history. 
 
Aarhus University JAKOB EGERIS THORSEN 
 
For Christ  and Country: Militant Catholic Youth in Post-Revolutionary Mexico. By 

Robert Weis. (Cambridge: Cambridge University Press. 2019. Pp. 213. $99.99. 
ISBN: 9781108493024) 

 
       �e story of how José de León Toral shot caudillo Álvaro Obregón in Mexico 
City in 1928 has often been told, but not with the sociological insight, archival 
rigor, or noirish aplomb of Robert Weis’s For Christ and Country. Toral was 
Mexico’s Oswald: yet because he was a Catholic who died by firing squad, the 
political/theological signals of his crime were scrambled for eternity. Fanatic? 
Martyr? Terrorist? Or just a deluded mystic, as Rome said?  
 
        Weis sets out to contextualize Toral’s “fanaticism”—which is to dispel it. 
Fanaticism, he writes, is an ahistorical term, distinct from violence. �e book’s 
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provocation, implicitly, is to critique its use elsewhere (pp. 4–5). �us, too, 
Obregón’s death is over in one ecstatic pistol fumbling (pp. 130–131), Toral’s gun-
hand bathed in light.  
 
        Weis’s thesis is that it took a city, at a particular point of development, to pull 
the trigger. A twentieth-century Catholic stoicism flourished, Weis argues, along-
side patterns of class, family, labor, and sociability. �e book explores this matrix 
suggestively. Toral and his associates were young, provincial migrants to Mexico 
City; fatherless, hanging on in middle class colonias, they worked entry-level jobs. 
�ey inhabited, even defined, a youthful interstice: unburdened by marriage and 
children, they intermingled with the opposite sex in illegal prayer-ins or parishes 
with penitential avatars like the Sagrado Corazón. Militants, they disdained “sugar 
Catholics” (a phrase lifted from a 1928 letter of Toral’s, p. 122) for whom faith was 
an accessory, like Hollywood movies or bobbed hair. �ey were a twenty-some-
thing precariat, repulsed by consumerism, excited by a “virile” devotional style that 
encouraged them to see themselves as sacrifices. �en, in 1926, the bloodshedding 
opportunities stopped being vicarious. Now who meant it? Who dared stand in 
harm’s way? Toral did, after seeing the Pro brothers’ corpses, shredded by dum-
dums. Henceforth, “Pepe” roamed the streets artlessly searching for Obregón, a 
lovesick suitor with someone else’s gun. 
 
       �is portrait is developed through six chapters. Chapter 1 explores Church-
state tensions; chapter 2, religious policing; chapter 3, Catholic asceticism; chapter 
4 (the best), Catholics’ underground networks; chapters 5 and 6, Toral’s life, crime, 
and trial. Weis dives deeply into the archive (especially AGN’s Investigaciones 
Políticas y Sociales files and the judicial records). �ere are some factual slips: 
ACJM was created in 1913, not 1914 (p. 22) or 1917 (p.  45); the “U” in 1915, not 
1920 (p. 109); the Cristo Rey monument in 1923, not 1921 (p. 21); ranchera 
crooner Javier Solis could not have sung “Morir por tu amor” until decades later (p. 
51). But glitches in no serious way detract from a well written, perceptive narrative, 
whether Weis is analyzing Catholics’ economic protests or the horrors of Toral’s 
interrogation. 
 
        �e book is best when tracing the networks that finessed Toral, their ama-
teurism (dud bombs; Toral’s heroically bad marksmanship) giving the lie to charges 
of organized terrorist cells. �is was Catholic adventurism, chemistry-set martyr 
games politicized, made shockingly real. Weis is often judicious: he downplays the 
arch-influence of Madre Conchita (conventionally the brains of the piece); likewise 
of Church doctrine, particularly Aquinas on tyrannicide, in favor of self-help exege-
sis (Toral styled himself on biblical Judith, who beheaded the Babylonian general 
Holofernes, pp. 117, 148). �e discussion of women Catholics is interesting: the 
resistance, Weis argues, was co-constructed by middle class women who hosted ille-
gal prayer-ins and saved some of the men from quicker futile deaths (pp. 106–107). 
 
        �ere are loose threads. I wondered whether Catholics’ virility concept was 
forged in tandem with other secular forms, not just antagonistically, particularly the 
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stoicism of the corrida (mentioned pp. 89, 103, 127). Weis is not interested in 
mining Catholic spirituality, above all its obession with expiation. Nor, in chapter 
6, does he deconstruct Toral’s rhetoric with the same sharpness as he does that of 
prosecutor Padilla. Still, this is a taut, humanizing essay on 1920s youthful mili-
tancy and the meanings of “fanaticism,” by a distance the best study of cristero 
activism in Mexico City. Students of Catholicism, violence, and postrevolutionary 
Mexico will enjoy it. 
 
University of Texas at Austin MATTHEW BUTLER
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Notes and Comments 
 

 

CAUSE OF SAINTS 
 
       In July two Jesuit priests were beatified: Giovanni Antonio Solinas (1643–
1683) and John Philipp Jeningen (1642–1704). Solinas, a missionary from 
Sardinia, was martyred in 1683 in the Jesuit missions of northwest Argentina, after 
two tribes of natives decided to deceive him to preach and work in their village 
before ambushing and killing him. He was beatified by Cardinal Marcello 
Semeraro on July 2 in a ceremony in San Ramón de la Nueva Orán, Argentina. 
Jeningen was born in Bavaria and exercised his priestly ministry as an itinerant 
preacher, mostly in that same region of Germany. For many years, he was attached 
to the Jesuit basilica of Our Lady in Ellwangen. His preaching led to the founding 
of a Marian shrine in Schönenberg. He was a tireless rural missionary, travelling 
the country, holding missions, and giving retreats to priests; he cared especially for 
soldiers, prisoners, and those condemned to death. In spite of his precarious health, 
he led a very active life and, despite his many illnesses, constantly brought comfort 
and help to people. �e Eucharist was always his food. He died in Ellwangen and 
was buried there in 1704. Jeningen was beatified on July 16 in a ceremony at the 
Basilica of St. Vitus in Rottenburg by Cardinal Jean-Claude Hollerich 
accompanied by Bishop Dr. Gebhard. 
 

WORKSHOPS 
 
       �e Newberry Library in Chicago, in collaboration with the University of 
Warwick’s Centre for the Study of the Renaissance, will offer two virtual research 
skills courses in the autumn of 2022. �e first is dedicated to “Palaeography—From 
Manuscript to Print.” �ese are unassessed courses on English and Italian 
palaeography, designed to help students learn to read and transcribe documents 
from the late Middle Ages to the early modern period. Students will learn to 
identify and correctly transcribe a variety of scripts, taken from manuscripts, 
archival documents, and early printed books. �e classes are taught online (typically 
via MS Teams) by experienced researchers, and involve a fair amount of homework 
(typically 2–3 hours per week). �e English stream will take place on Wednesday 
afternoons, 15:00–16:30 (BST), starting October 12, 2022, with Italian classes 
taking place on Tuesday afternoons, 15:00–16:45 (BST), starting 4th October 
2022. Italian palaeography requires at least an intermediate knowledge of Italian. 
Further information on palaeography in general is available on the website, with 
links to the different streams and application forms / deadlines accessible from this 
page: http://www2.warwick.ac.uk/fac/arts/ren/postgradstudy/manuscripttoprint/ 
�e application deadline for the English Stream is September 1, 2022; for the 
Italian Stream, September 20, 2022. 
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        �e second research skills course is dedicated to “Latin for Research in the 
Humanities.” �e course explores and compares the writing styles and approaches 
of humanists from across Europe. �e class is taught by Mr. Iván Parga Ornelas, and 
the cost is £180 per term. �is course helps participants (staff or students) develop 
the ability to read and understand Renaissance Latin texts, while allowing them to 
brush up their Latin skills for research purposes. �e weekly meetings of ninety 
minutes focus on a small number of Neo-Latin authors in order to build familiarity 
with their particular styles and rhetorical practices. Sessions typically consist of the 
reading and translation of a fourteenth- to sixteenth-century text, supported by 
grammar and vocabulary revision. �is year the texts have been selected from 
Petrarch and Erasmus of Rotterdam during term 1 and from Leon Battista Alberti 
and �omas More during term 2. Additionally, excerpts from Neo-Latin poetry—
epigram, elegy, and epic—will be read in some sessions. For more information see 
here: https://warwick.ac.uk/fac/arts/ren/latin4research/. �e application deadline is 
September 20, 2022. Students not enrolled in Warwick’s Centre for the Study of the 
Renaissance will pay £180 per course, per term. Participants from institutions 
belonging to the Newberry Library’s Center for Renaissance Studies Consortium 
may be able to claim their fees back from local Newberry funds; ask your local 
consortium representative for more information. Queries can also be directed to the 
CSR’s administrator on renaissance@warwick.ac.uk. 
 

FELLOWSHIPS 
 
        �e Leibniz Institute of European History (IEG) awards 8–10 fellowships for 
international doctoral students in European history, the history of religion, historical 
theology, or other historical disciplines. �e IEG funds PhD projects on European 
history from the early modern period until 1989/90. It is particularly interested in 
projects that involve a comparative or cross-border approach, deal with European 
history in its relation to the wider world, or are on topics of intellectual and religious 
history. �e IEG Fellowships provide a unique opportunity to pursue individual 
PhD projects while living and working for six to twelve months at the Institute in 
Mainz. �e monthly stipend is € 1,350. Additionally, one can apply for family or 
child allowance. �e IEG preferably supports the writing up of dissertations; it will 
not provide funding for preliminary research, language courses, or the revision of 
book manuscripts. PhD theses continue to be supervised under the auspices of the 
fellows’ home universities. Candidates are expected to have proficiency in English 
and a sufficient command of German to participate in discussions at the Institute. 
�e IEG encourages applications from women. Application forms are available at 
https://buff.ly/3lA7vxQ. Applications should be sent to application@ieg-mainz.de. 
Letters of recommendation should be submitted directly by the referees. �e IEG 
has two deadlines each year for IEG Fellowships: February 15 and August 15. 
Questions concerning the IEG Fellowship Programme should be directed to Joke 
Kabbert: fellowship@ieg-mainz.de. 
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CONFERENCES 
 
       From August 1 to 3, 2022, Boston College hosted the Institute for Advanced 
Jesuit Studies’ International Symposium on Jesuit Studies dedicated to the theme 
Jesuits and the Church in History. �ere were thirteen panels. Panel One: 
Foundations in Mission Lands: �e Jesuits and the Local Clergy featured 
“Desolation and Orphanhood: Experiences and Voices of Suppressed Jesuits 
Regarding the Papacy” by Arturo Reynoso, S.J.; “Of Biographies and Miraculous 
Events: �e Relationship between the Eighteenth-Century Province of the Society 
of Jesus of New Spain and the Novohispanic Church” by Hugo Zayas González; 
and “Giulio Mancinelli, S.J. (1537–1618): An Agent of Post-Tridentine Church 
Between Italy and the Ottoman Empire” by Silvia Notarfonso. Panel Two: Early 
Jesuit �ought on Religion and Translating Catholic Faith in Mission Lands 
consisted in “Nadal’s Defense of Jesuit Distinctiveness” by Joshua Hinchie, S.J.; 
“From Hierarchical to Popular Church: �e Contribution of Jesuits’ Translation of 
Western Metaphysics in South American Missions (16th–17th Centuries)” by Juan 
Dejo, S.J.; and “Jesuits Teachings of the Immortality of Soul in Late Ming China” 
by Lu Jiang. A plenary session titled “Humanities in a New Light: Interdisciplinary 
Perspectives on the Jesuit Missions to China” heard “Virtues of a Comparative 
�eologian” by Peng Yin; “From West to East and Back Again: �e Re-
Europeanization of Chinese Jesuit Imagery in the Late 19th Century” by Yifu Liu; 
and “Imago Mundi: Transnational Filmmaking and American Jesuit Missions in 
Early Cold War China” by Joseph Ho. Panel �ree: History, Law, and 
Cosmography as Intellectual Strategies for the Catholic Church consisted in three 
papers: “Church’s Territory: Jesuits’ Geographical Knowledge and Scientific 
Network in the 18th Century” by Xiangyi Liu; “Chronology of Concord: Peter 
Canisius’ Reverse Church History of Marian Devotion” by Hilmar Pabel; and “�e 
Jesuits and the Law of Church: Francisco Suárez (1548–1617) on Canon Law in 
His Treatise De Legibus IV” by Stephan Hecht. Panel Four: Sources for the 
Historiography of Jesuit Relations with the Church in the Modern Period had 
three presentations: “Jesuit Online Necrology: Understanding the Men Who 
Devoted �eir Lives to the Society of Jesus and to the Catholic Church, 1814–
1970” by Adrian Vaagenes and Matthew Naglak; “Jesuits and the Church in Light 
of the Society’s Roman Archive” by Robert Danieluk, S.J.; and “Contemplative 
likewise in Action: Jesuit Identity and the Church (16th–17th Centuries)” by Irene 
Gaddo. A keynote talk was given by Paul F. Grendler on “�e Expulsion and 
Return of the Jesuits to Venice, 1606–1657. A Test of Loyalty Between the Papacy 
and the Jesuits.” Panel Five: Foundations and Relations among Jesuits and the 
Clergy in Local Contexts (16th–17th Centuries) also had three papers: “Founding 
a Jesuit College in the Kingdom of Naples (16th–17th Centuries): Local Strategies, 
Global Conflicts” by Niccolò Guasti; “Ambivalent Reception: Reflections on Jesuit 
Foundations from the Local Catholic Church in the Austrian Jesuit Province in the 
First Half of the 17th Century” by Zsófia Kádár; and “New Network of the Jesuit 
Stations in the Orient Planned by the Polish Royal Couple in the 1650s” by Natalia 
Królikowska-Jedlińska. Panel Six: Catholic Journals and Jesuits between Local and 
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National Politics in the 19th Century featured three papers: “Carlo Passaglia, S.J.’s 
Magazine Il Mediatore (1862–66): Political Activism, Religion and �eology in 
Post-Unification Italy” by Laura Madella; “19th Century Boston Jesuit History 
Seen in the Story of Mary Jane Regan (1842–1925)” by Barbara Adams Hebard; 
and “�e Restored Jesuits, the Church, and the State in 19th-Century New York” 
by James Roberts. A plenary session on �e Jesuits and Politics in the Early 
Modern Church contained three papers: “Jesuits and Papal Nepotism in 17th 
Century” by Flavio Rurale; “‘I Obey, but I do not Comply?’: Jesuit Missionary 
Practice in China after the Papal Suppression of the Chinese Rites” by Adam 
Włodarski; and “A Stab in the Back?: �e Role of the (Lower) Secular and Regular 
Clergy in the Suppression of the Society of Jesus in 1773” by Joep van Gennip. 
Panel Seven: Jesuit Spirituality and Identity between the Catholic Church and 
Reformation was studied in three papers: “Edmund Arrowsmith, S.J. and the 
English Catholic Mission: Ministry, Martyrology, and Hagiography in His Life 
and Afterlife” by Robert Scully, S.J.; “Training the Secular Clergy: �e Practice of 
Institutionalized Spiritual Exercises in Early Modern France” by Judith 
Lipperheide; and “‘�e World is Our Cloister:’ Assessing the Parallels between the 
Society of Jesus and the Carthusians” by Henry Shea, S.J., and Stephen Molvarec, 
S.J. Panel Eight: Jesuits and Catholic Missions in Late Ming China and Early-
Modern Japan contained three papers: “Early Jesuits and Other Religious Orders 
in the Archdiocese of Goa: Cooperation, Competition, and Conflict (1540–75)” by 
Bradley Blankemeyer; “What Saint Francis Xavier and Giovanni Battista Sidoti 
Brought to Japan” by Aiko Okamoto-MacPhail; and “Translating `Buddhist-
Christian’ Hagiography in the Late Ming: �e Story of Barlaam and Josaphat” by 
Yi Wang. Panel Nine: Dying in Asia for the Church: Jesuits and Martyrdom in the 
Early Modern Period also had three papers: “Martyrdom in the Library: �e Books 
of the Early Modern Jesuit Novitiate in Mainz” by Elisa Frei; “Jesuits and 
Martyrdom in Japan” by Carla Tronu Montané; and “Why Did Most Jesuits 
Survive the Martyrdom of 1597?: �e Diplomatic Policy of the Toyotomi 
Administration and the Martyrdom of the ‘26 Martyrs of Japan’” by Yurika 
Takano. Panel Ten: Jesuit Universities as Catholic Institutions in the Global, 
Contemporary Context consisted in three presentations: “Responding to ‘Hungers 
in the Church and the World’: Fordham University’s Graduate School of Religion 
and Religious Education and the Renewal of Religious Education in the Post-
Vatican II Church” by Dennis Gunn; “French Jesuit Missions in Sub-Saharan 
Africa: Which link with the Church and its Global Mission? �e Example of a 
Local Initiative: the INADES” by Barbara Baudry; and “�e Cursillo Retreat and 
Fourth Day Spirituality in the Catholic Church: �e Role of the Society of Jesus 
and Ignatian Spirituality” by Chris Miller. Panel Eleven: Jesuits in the Context of 
Church Politics featured “Popes and Jesuits vs. Nationalism, ca. 1848–1978” by 
Tom Worcester, S.J.; “Obedience in the Church and in the Society of Jesus” by 
Jörg Nies, S.J.; and “A Problematic Partnership: Jesuit Priests, Diocesan Clergy, 
and the Ministry to Enslaved People in the Maryland Province” by Elsa Mendoza. 
Panel Twelve: Cultural Transitions and Political Adaptation in National Contexts 
contained the papers “�e Making of Christian Sheshan (Zô-sè), 1863–1947” by 
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Hsin-fang Wu; “Psychology in Catholic Pedagogical Humanism: Manuals and 
Printed Materials for the Training of Teachers in Brasil (1920–60)” by Raquel 
Assis; and “�e Jesuits and the Public Sphere in Contemporary India” by Neil 
Lincoln Tannen. Panel �irteen: Philosophy, �eology, and Spirituality and the 
Second Vatican Council contained three papers: “Reflections on the Jesuit College 
of Eegenhoven and its Role in the Second Vatican Council’ by Andrew Barrette; 
“From Suspicious Reformer to the Suspicion of Reform: �e Enigmatic Case of 
Henri de Lubac” by Carlos Alvarez, S.J.; and “Henri de Lubac, the Jesuits of Lyon-
Fourvière, and Pope Pius XII: the Humani generis crisis of 1950 and the problem 
of method” by Philip Moller, S.J. A final session on �e Jesuit and the Church: 
Trajectories and Perspectives featured a roundtable discussion involvng John 
O’Malley, S.J. (by zoom), Mark Lewis, S.J., Nelson H. Minnich, and Stefania 
Tutino. 
 
       �e Haskins Society, founded in 1982, is an international scholarly 
organization dedicated to studying the history and cultures of peoples in northwest 
Europe in the early and central Middle Ages, and their encounters with societies in 
the Mediterranean, the Baltic, and the larger medieval world. �e Haskins Society 
annual conference will take place at the University of Richmond on October 28–
30, 2022. Featured speakers include Cord Whitaker (Wellesley), Frances Andrews 
(St. Andrews), and Anne Lester (Johns Hopkins). For full details, see 
https://thehaskinssociety.wildapricot.org/page-1856509. 
 

PUBLICATIONS 
 
       �e first issue of Volume 25 (2021) of the Zeitschrift für Antikes 
Christentum/Journal of Ancient Christianity is a �emenheft on “Clerics and �eir 
Multiple Roles in Late Antique Christianity,” edited by Robert Wisniewski: “How 
Numerous and How Busy were Late-Antique Presbyters?” by Robert Wisniewski 
(pp. 3–37); “�e Role of Clerics in North African �ird-Century Martyr Narra-
tives,” by Éric Rebillard (pp. 38–52); “From Slave to Bishop. Callixtus’ Early 
Ecclesiastical Career and Mechanisms of Clerical Promotion,” by András Handl 
(pp. 53–73); “Presbyters Serving as Pastors in Roman Africa,” by James Patout 
Burns (pp. 74-92); “`Neither Poverty nor Riches’: Ambrosiaster and the Problem 
of Clerical Compensation,” by David G. Hunter (pp. 93–107); and “Audientia sac-
erdotalis? Remarks on the Legal Nature of Dispute Resolution by Ecclesiastics in 
Late Antiquity,” by Marzena Wojtczak (pp. 108–49). 
        
       A special issue of Philippiniana Sacra, published on the eight hundredth 
anniversary of the “Dies Natalis of Sto. Domingo de Caleruega” (Volume LVI, 
Number 170 [2021]) commemorates “50 Years of the Dominican Province of the 
Philippines” and “500 Years of Christianity in the Philippines.” �e four articles 
are: ”Prelude to Filipino Catholicism: �e Hispanization of the Christian Mission 
(15th to 16th Centuries),” by Jessie R. Yap, O.P. (pp. 973–992); “�e Establish-
ment of the Dominican Province (1581–1631),” by Jessie R. Yap, O.P. (pp. 993–

                                                               NOTES AND COMMENTS                                                      629



1028); “Extant Artifacts from the First One Hundred Years of the Dominicans in 
the Philippines (1587–1750),” by Regalado Trota José (pp. 1029–84); and “�e 
Dominican Influence in the Philippines in Terms of Marian Piety: Yesterday, 
Today and Beyond,” by Roland D. Mactal, O.P. (pp. 1085–1108). 
 
       Quaerens, Journal of �eology and Pastoral Life, published by the Recoletos 
School of �eology in Quezon City, Philippines, has celebrated the “IV Centenario 
de la Provincia de San Nicolás de Tolentino, Orden de Agustinos Recoletos, 1621–
2021,” in a double issue for 2020 (Volume 15) under the heading “Siempre en mis-
sion.” It contains thirty articles in 610 pages. �e next volume (for 2021) is entitled 
“Amor Diffusivus II: Historical Studies in Commemoration of the 500th Anniver-
sary of Christianity in the Philippines (1521–2021),” of which the theme is “Gifted 
to Give.” Emmanuel Luis A. Romanillos has contributed fifteen articles, which are 
published in 405 pages. 
 
       “C. F. W. Walther and Christian Missions” is the theme of the issue of the 
Concordia Historical Institute Quarterly for summer, 2022 (Volume 95), which con-
tains four brief articles. 
 
       Aspects of twentieth-century Mexican church history are treated in the issue 
of �e Americas for April, 2022 (Volume 79, Number 2): “Catholic Mobilizations 
in Twentieth-Century Mexico: From Pious Lynchings and Fascist Salutes to a 
‘Catholic 1968,’ Maoist Priests, and the Post-Cristero Apocalypse,” by Matthew 
Butler (pp. 181–96); “Martyrs, Fanatics, and Pious Militants: Religious Violence 
and the Secular State in 1930s Mexico,” by Gema Kloppe-Santamaría (pp. 197–
227); “Fascists, Nazis, or Something Else? Mexico’s Unión Nacional Sinarquista in 
the US Media, 1937–1945,” by Julia G. Young (pp. 229–61); “Silencing Rebellious 
Priests: Rodolfo Escamilla García and the Repression of Progressive Catholicism 
in Cold-War Mexico,” by Jaime M. Pensado (pp. 263–89); “�e Nazas-Aguanaval 
Group: Radical Priests, Catholic Networks, and Maoist Politics in Northern 
Mexico,” by Jorge Puma (pp. 291–320); and “Las Falsas Derechas: Conflict and 
Convergence in Mexico’s Post-Cristero Right after the Second Vatican Council,” 
by Luis Herrón Ávila (pp. 321–50). 
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Periodical Literature 
 
 

GENERAL AND MISCELLANEOUS 
 
Lending at Interest. A Medieval Controversy in the Contemporary Debate. Laura 

Righi. Cristianesimo nella storia, 43 (1, 2022), 61 – 91. 

Padre Engelbert Kirschbaum SJ: gesuita e archeologo all’avanguardia. Cristina 
Cumbo. Gregorianum, 103 (2, 2022), 391 – 408. 

Bishop Christopher Butler’s Role in Dei Verbum 11 on the Inspiration of the Bible. 
Cesar Andrade Alves, S.I. Gregorianum, 103 (2, 2022), 359 – 90. 

Pace e umanesimo. Gli amici al concilio Vaticano II (1962 – 1965). Mauro Velati. 
Revue d’histoire ecclésiastique, 114 (Jan.– June, 2019), 289 – 325. 

La recepción del Vaticano II: crónica histórica para un “status quaestionis.” 
Santiago Madrigal. Estudios Eclesiásticos, 97 (Jan., 2022), 3– 44. 

ANCIENT 
 
History, Eschatology, and the Development of the Six Ages of the World. Part I: 

From Antiquity to Tyconius. John Joseph Gallagher. Augustinianum, 61 
(June, 2021), 181 – 206. 

History, Eschatology, and the Development of the Six Ages of the World. Part II: 
From Tyconius to Bede. John Joseph Gallagher. Augustinianum, 61 (Dec., 
2021), 361 – 80. 

Genesis 1 and the Beginnings of Gnosticism. Christoph Markschies. Zeitschrift für 
Antikes Christentum / Journal of Ancient Christianity, 26 (July, 2022), 25-44. 

Girolamo, Elvidio e il contesto teologico romano al tempo di Damaso. Emanuele 
Di Santo. Augustinianum, 61 (Dec., 2021), 435-60. 

Passio Perpetuae: la concezione della donna-martire nelle opere di sant’Agostino 
d’Ippona. Alessia Brombin. Antonianum, 97 (Jan., 2022), 97– 108. 

Basil’s Knowledge of Astronomy. Colten Cheuk-Yin Yam. Zeitschrift für Antikes 
Christentum / Journal of Ancient Christianity, 26 (July, 2022), 126-44. 

An Early Collection of Acts from the Council of Ephesus (431) in Antioch. 
�omas Graumann. Zeitschrift für Antikes Christentum / Journal of Ancient 
Christianity, 25 (Dec., 2021), 452– 78. 

Santos y herejes. La diáspora cristiana norteafricana durante el “Siglo vándalo.” 
Raúl Villegas Marín. Cristianesimo nella storia, 43 (1, 2022), 37 – 60. 
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�e Biblical Text and its Variants at the Heart of the Debate between the Emperor 
Julian and Cyril of Alexandria. �e Cases of Genesis 6,2 and 49,10. Marie-
Odile Boulnois. Zeitschrift für Antikes Christentum / Journal of Ancient 
Christianity, 25 (Oct., 2021), 284–319. 

Catholic Identity in a Hostile Vandal Context: Insights from the Notitia 
Provinciarum. Christoph Scheerer. Zeitschrift für Antikes Christentum / Journal 
of Ancient Christianity, 25 (Oct., 2021), 320–39. 

Editare il Martinello di Sulpicio Severo: osservazioni testuali sulle Lettere. Fabio 
Ruggiero. Augustinianum, 61 (Dec., 2021), 499–525 

Acerba funera. “Pagani” e cristiani di fronte alla morte infantile. Elena Zocca. 
Augustinianum, 61 (Dec., 2021), 527–51. 

Lives, Lives and Afterlives: �e Exemplary Pedagogy of Caesarius of Arles. A.E.T. 
McLaughlin. Augustinianum, 61 (June, 2021), 207–35. 

Rufinus of Aquileia’s Historia ecclesiastica and Historia monachorum in Aegypto: A 
Dual Program of Monastic Historiography. Andrew Cain. Zeitschrift für 
Antikes Christentum / Journal of Ancient Christianity, 25 (Oct., 2021), 233–49. 

Leontopolis: Kaiserstadt ohne Bischof? Lokalisierung und Geschichte einer 
isaurischen Märtyrer-Kultstätte. Philipp Pilhofer. Zeitschrift für Antikes 
Christentum / Journal of Ancient Christianity, 25 (Dec., 2021), 479–506. 

MEDIEVAL 
 

Notes sur la circulation des textes autour de l’abbaye de Saint-Riquier au IXe siècle. 
Angela Cossu. Mélanges de l’Ecole française de Rome, 133 (2, 2021), 375–92. 
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